
 
 
 

Live Wire 
 

The Writings of  
 

High Priest Don Danko 
 

Joy of Satan Ministries 
 

Volume One 
 
 
 
 
 

 
“True Knowledge Leads To 

Liberation” 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 2 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 3 

SECTION ONE, PART 1: THE JEWS           
 

Enemy Agenda    5 

The Jewish Creation of Christianity   7 

The Vatican Synagogue of Rome   15 

The New Zion: The Bible is a Book of Jewish Witchcraft   23 

Mind Control Programming and the Bible   31 

The Torah Is Fake: Jews Lie About Themselves; 
 Moses and Abraham are Phony   37 
 
Communism and Masonry: Two Fronts of the Jew World Order   41 

The Real Holocaust: The Jewish Murder Machine Called the USSR   55 

Jewish Ritual Murder   79 

The Jewish Communizing Of America   91 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 4 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 5 

ENEMY AGENDA 
 
 

The truth concerning enemy religions both East and West is they not "religions," 
as there is no spirituality in them. In truth, they are nothing more than political 
ideologies with a tinsel of pseudo-spiritual metaphysics. The “priesthoods” are 
the party officials who enforce and maintain the ruling ideology over society. No 
different from any Soviet ruled Nation of the current or previous century, the 
Party, and the ideology of the Party rules. 
 
The Sudra's duty and supreme good is nothing but obedience to famous Brahmin 
householders who know the Veda. If he is unpolluted, obedient to his superiors, 
gentle in his speech, without a sense of 'I', and is always dependent upon the 
Brahmins and the other [twice-born castes]. He attains a superior birth [in the 
next life]." — Manusmrti 9:334-335.  
 
Here is the essence of all the enemy systems’ points of convergence; the 
corruption of the true spiritual language by changing the concepts behind the 
meanings until it is nothing more than a ritualized slave morality that is designed 
to domesticate humanity with each generation, into a cattle-like state. The dairy 
cow of today was once the famed mighty Aurochs of old. Understand the crucial 
fact: genetics are actually meta-genetics.  
 
How the enemy modification program works is simple. The brain is inter-
connected with the chakra centers, which are the macrocosm of the genetic or 
DNA information code in the body. By programming the mind via ideological 
software download, this reformats the neural pathways in the brain [hard drive], 
which correspond to the programming command [vibration frequency] or filters. 
This interfaces into the charka centers that send this program code into the 
overall energy body which imprints it into the genetic information code via 
epigenetic, thus switching the overall psyche into the program frequency. This 
plugs into mass mind and then becomes a locked program due to the collective 
psychic power of the mass mind. Part of this enemy paradigm is the removal of 
spiritual knowledge and the removal of advanced humans from society by 
murdering them and destroying their bloodlines. Murdering them cuts off the 
head of the original system and the head of the new system rules. Communism 
is the open practice of this and it culls out the most advanced genetics, in order 
to enforce a slave labor state.  
 
I also believe in places like the Far East where all spiritual knowledge could not 
be totally removed, celibacy was brought among other reasons, to ensure such 
advanced genes where not passed on, in essence doing the same. 
 
Over generations, this physiological effect takes greater hold with the lack of 
spiritual practices now replaced by ritualism, designed to enforce and strengthen 
the modification program code. The generations born carry the genetic 
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information code that forms them into existence. To this point, they are born in 
the image of centuries of genetic transmutation, and you have the perfect goyim 
or cattle in a global two-legged factory farm. This is how modification works on 
the meta-genetic level. 
 
Nietzsche understood this and termed it the "Slave Morality," which process and 
final aim was the under-man, the human cattle. Interesting enough, in the Far 
East such beings are called “Pashu” [animalistic being]. The ancient spiritual 
masters acknowledge in that term the degenerative effects of a lack of spiritual 
practice.  
 
In contrast, daily practice of Yoga undoes the programming codes, it cleans out 
all the imprints with blasts of a higher vibrational flow, and reformats the psyche 
to how it should be naturally on a higher level of vibration. The enemy 
programming is of a low-density frequency wave, and it cannot remain in the 
psyche after the consistent practice of yoga has advanced with some time. It also 
strengthens the bioelectrical field to where it blocks [shields] one from the mass 
mind aspects of the enemy program. This is no different from a radio wave on a 
lower frequency, which has no effect on a higher wave frequency. This sends a 
higher vibration into the DNA, which is literally a vibrational information code that 
interacts with and forms the entire being. Change the vibration, change the code, 
change the code, and change the form, because the form is vibration, so one 
ends up with an advancing human again through meta-genetics. 
 
The essence of what Nietzsche calls the ‘master morality,’ is having a life style 
and culture based upon an evolutionary practice that creates the god-man 
[Superhuman], Übermensch, by a literal transmutation of genetic code. As 
advancing humans have children, and those children mature, following the same 
path, this leads to advancement of the entire race. 
 
Satan's Enlightenment process works on the meta-genetic level, and upon 
sending a higher wave of light energy thought the entire being, reforming one to 
a higher level, until in time one is perfected to the microcosmic frequency or 
octave of the sun star; the gold in the work. 
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THE JEWISH CREATION OF CHRISTIANITY 
 

 
PROTOCOL No. 14 
“When we come into our kingdom, it will be undesirable for us that there should 
exist no other religion than ours, of the One God, with whom our destiny is bound 
up by our position as the Chosen People, and through whom our same destiny is 
united with the destinies of the world. We must therefore sweep away all other 
forms of belief. If this gives birth to the atheists whom we see today, it will not, 
being only a transitional stage, interfere with our views, but will serve as a 
warning for those generations which will hearken to our preaching of the religion 
of Moses, that, by its stable and thoroughly elaborated system has brought all the 
peoples of the world into subjection to us.” 
 
The Christian and Islamic programs both worship the Jews in the form of their 
"God" and its claimed prophets, hence binding Gentiles under the Jews on both 
conscious and subconscious levels. The external conflicts are superficial and 
many are show. Both programs are built upon the Jewish Torah and force the 
Noahide [Mosaic] laws upon Gentiles, thus conforming to the Jews’ stated plans 
to bind Gentiles into servitude under their rule. 
 
In 380 CE, Emperor Theodosius declared Christianity to be the official Roman 
State religion, and all Pagan cults were forbidden. 
 
This article deals with how the Jews created Christianity in phases and gained 
power in the ancient Roman Empire in general. To get to that point, the Jews 
created this ideology in Alexandria- the Jew York of its era. 
 
"There were a number of Jewish brotherhoods, several of whom believed that 
they were "God's elect" and that salvation would come through them. Their 
principle agent of salvation [Yeshua] was the Messiah [Christos], and in the 
Jewish communities influenced by Greek culture [Hellenized], this messiah was 
depicted not as a warrior but as a spiritual and mystical entity. In this way, 
not only would the Romans and the Greeks themselves be overthrown, but also 
their Gods, being replaced by the Jewish tribal god Yahweh. These various 
Jewish sects were intent on creating a philosophy or religion that would 
manipulate the Gentiles into the "monotheism" of Judaism and away from 
"idolatry," or polytheism, with the awareness that those who held the keys to a 
monotheistic god would dominate in religion and culture in general. One group of 
these "Jews by Birth" was that of the Alexandrian Therapeuts."  
 —Acharya S. "Suns of God" 
 
More on the city and its Jewish population: "Jews were among the earliest 
occupants of the newly founded city of Alexandria, beginning in the fourth century 
BCE. With further influxes later at the invitation of the Ptolemys, as revealed by 
the ancient historian Strabo [63/64 BCE - 24 CE], Alexandria represented by his 
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time the greatest commercial center in the world. Alexandria during the first 
century of the Common Era was a thriving metropolis extending in all directions 
that influenced people around the Mediterranean, including in the important field 
of religion. 
 
First-century Alexandria vied with Rome to be the greatest city of the Roman 
Empire. More than a half a million people lived in its cosmopolitan four square 
miles. It was a major center for international trade and shipping. It seems clear 
that the Jewish population of the city was large and spread out in all areas. So 
sizable was the Jewish population at Alexandria that Philo, a member of one of 
the wealthiest Jewish families in that metropolis estimated that by his era, Jews 
constituted some 50 percent of the city. Moreover, the Jewish population at 
Alexandria was so large and powerful that Jews possessed "their own treasury 
and court of justice." 
—D. M. Murdock "Christ in Egypt" 
 
This Philo character played a major role in working to subvert the Gentile host 
culture, no doubt using his wealth and influence to do so. Philo, being part of this 
Therapeut organization, which declared objective was to bring Gentiles down and 
chain them to the Jewish yoke via an ideology that hijacked religion. Philo was a 
Karl Marx of his day. 
 
"Philo himself was apparently a Therapeut, based on a number of factors, not the 
least of which is that he was knowledgeable about the mythos and ritual of the 
Alexandrian mystery school. In addition, Philo's likely involvement with the 
Therapeutan Church of God is reflected in the fact that later writings of 
"Christians" were "borrowed" heavily from the Jewish philosopher. "Philo was the 
bridge between Hellenic Judaism and Christianity"—Acharya S 
 
"He [Philo] came from a wealthy and prominent family and appeared to be a 
leader in his community. Philo's brother, Alexander, was a wealthy, and 
prominent Roman government official, a customs agent responsible for collecting 
dues on all goods imported into Egypt from the East." Note the typical Jewish 
tactic of trying to inject Jewish lies and claims of supremacy into every Gentile 
culture exampled by this Jew: 
"He [Philo] put forward the teachings of the Jewish prophet, Moses, as "the 
summit of philosophy" [Op. 8], and considered Moses the teacher of Pythagoras 
[b. ca 570 BCE], and of all Greek philosophers and lawgivers [Hesiod, Heraclitus, 
Lycurgus, to mention a few]. For Philo, Greek philosophy was a natural 
development of the revelatory teachings of Moses. He was no innovator in this 
matter because already before him, Jewish scholars attempted the same. 
Artapanus in the second century BCE, identified Moses with Musaeus and with 
Orpheus. According to Aristobulus of Paneas [first half of the second century 
 BCE], Homer and Hesiod drew from the books of Moses which were translated 
into Greek long before the Septuagint." 
Even this Moses character was stolen from the Gentile God Bacchus, who is a 
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Romanized name for Dionysus, and was worshipped in Egypt as Osiris. 
 
More on this order: 
It was in Alexandria that the Jews first came so powerfully under the influence of 
Hellenism, and here that the peculiar Greco-Jewish philosophy sprang up of 
which Philo was the most noted representative. 
 
"Many Jews in that city were ‘Hellenizing,’ in that, as Jews do today, they 
adopted and lived within the culture or cultures around them, in this case the 
Greek, which was dominant during the era in question. As The International 
Standard Bible Encyclopedia states: 
"Indeed, Hellenistic Judaism had its ‘chief seat’ at Alexandria, where also the 
Jewish Bible was translated into Greek and called the Septuagint." 
 
One group of Hellenizing Jews, or rather, "Hebrews of a fashion," was deemed 
the "Therapeuts," a type of monastic community centered at Alexandria, with 
similar groups elsewhere around the Mediterranean. The Therapeuts at 
Alexandria were first mentioned by this name by Philo in his work De Vita 
Contemplative." 
 
"Living so closely to Alexandria, the great center of learning, the Therapeuts 
possessed tremendous clout and significant wealth as well." Although they were 
thus headquartered in Egypt, the Therapeutan community, Philo relates, "Is to be 
found many parts of the world." 
 
Regarding the Therapeuts, Christianity, and Hadrian, noted historian Edward 
Gibbon [1737-1794] states: 
"The extensive commerce of Alexandria, and its proximity to Palestine, gave an 
easy entrance to the new religion of Christianity. It was first embraced by great 
numbers of Therapeutae, or Essenians, of the Lake Mareotis, a Jewish sect that 
had abated much of its reverence for the Mosaic ceremonies. It was in the school 
of Alexandra that Christian theology appears to have assumed a regular and 
scientific form; and when Hadrian visited Egypt, he found a church composed of 
Jews and of Greeks, sufficiently important to attract the notice of that inquisitive 
prince." 
 
One Catholic writer, who insisted upon the connection between Philo's 
Therapeuts and the Christians, was Eusebius during the fourth century. In The 
History of the Church [2.17], in speaking of "Philo's account of the Egyptian 
ascetics," Eusebius remarks: "Whether he invented this designation 
[Therapeutae] and applied them, fitting a suitable name for their mode of life, or 
whether they were actually called this from the very start, because the title 
Christian was not yet in general use, need not be discussed here." "The reality, 
however, may be that the Therapeuts morphed into Christians because it was 
they who essentially created much of Christianity, with no "historical Jesus." 
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DE Bunsen remarks: 
"...Stephen, Paul, and Apollos, we regard as promulgators of the universalist 
Alexandrian [read Jewish] Gnosis of the Essenic Therapeuts, as applied to 
Christianity." 
 
Dr. Grant states: 
"The best precedent for the Christian schools of Alexandria seems to lie among 
the Therapeutae by the Mareotic Lake, described in Philo's work “On the 
Contemplative Life.” Such Therapeutae would be ready for Alexandrian 
Christianity." 
 
Regarding the locations of Therapeutan order as presented by Philo in "On the 
Contemplative Life" but also in other treatises, Conybeare comments: 
“Are we to suppose that systemata of the same types as that which Philo 
proceeds to describe, were found all over the inhabited world? Or was the one 
settled on the Lake Mareotis, to which the best persons resorted from all 
quarters, the only one? I think the truth may lie between the two suppositions. 
There may have been such societies in several of the great Jewish communities 
scattered round the Mediterranean, e.g. in Cyprus, Corinth, Tarsus, Colossae, 
Antioch, Rome, Smyrna and elsewhere." 
— D. M. Murdock "Christ in Egypt" 
 
One can see this Jewish order had multi-national bases of operation and a large 
amount of funding and influence to spread its subversion with. 
 
"In the Ancient Lowly: A History of the Ancient Working People, C. Osborne 
Ward, a political economist at the U.S. Department of Labor, provided an 
interesting and practical take on the Therapeuts. They were members of very 
powerful "business guilds," and "unions" of working class people. Citing various 
inscriptions, Ward sought to demonstrate a "Solonic Dispensation." This "Solonic 
dispensation" that Ward suggests became Christianity represented as a "vast 
system of trade unions over the world." Describing these brotherhoods as found 
in Egypt and elsewhere, Ward remarks: "The principal name by which they were 
known, was not Coptic, but Greek; was Therapeutae, an association closely 
allied to the Essenes.” —D. M. Murdock "Christ in Egypt" 
 
How did the Jews obtain the power to force the Christian program their 
Therapeuts [Frankfurt School of the Ancient World] order fashioned, on the 
populace for real? Ben Klassen wrote that Julius Caesar was a Jewish puppet 
and the Jews wanted to create the position of Emperor to consolidate power in a 
central position that they could control with ease, as Rome was a Republic at the 
time of Caesar. 
 
This makes sense, given the Jews by that time were in control of the majority of 
wealth in the Roman Empire just as they are today, with their control of the global 
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banks and banking/corporate system, which gives them control over the Gentile 
Nations. 
 
It was the Jewish Alexanders that funded the Flavian Dynasty of which many 
powerful and famous Jews where members of, such as Philo Alexander, 
Josephus and others. Even Titus's wife was Jewish. It was with the rise of the 
Flavians that we see the appearance of Jewish Christianity. Constantine himself 
was descended from the Flavians, hence the title of Flavius Constantine. It was 
Constantine who made Christianity the official state religion of Rome. It is no 
accident the first Catholic Saints are all Flavians, and the Flavians were full of 
Jewish blood and funded by Jewish money, power, and politics. 
 
Who do you think Caesar borrowed the vast sums of money he did to win the 
mob with massive displays and games, and to fund his armies and wars? We 
also see from the evidence the Jews were also in control of the key networks and 
were behind creating the Caesars of Rome, thus centralizing all political power 
into the hands of few whom they controlled. Without this new political system, 
Christianity could not have assumed total power by the decree of Theodosius, 
toppling the Gentile word: 
 
"The politically ambitious Julius Caesar recognized the power of the Jews, which 
stemmed from one incontrovertible fact —Rome was made up of many opposing 
political groups and sects. In order to win, the politician needed the support of 
one group, which would stick by him steadfastly, and thus influence other groups 
to support him. Just as in our present-day democracies, this group was the Jews. 
They would guarantee their support to any politician who in turn would do what 
they asked. When Caesar discovered this simple truth, he sought out the Jews, 
and won their support.”  
 
On page 8 of "Jews of Ancient Rome," Leon writes, 
"The Jews in the 'Populares,' the liberal-democratic or people's party, supported 
Caesar and he issued verdicts in their favor." Things have not changed much in 
two thousand years. We still have the liberal-democratic party in every country, 
and it always represents the ambition of the Jews. With the Jews behind him, 
Caesar soon became the dictator of Rome and the unchallenged ruler of the 
world. Alarmed by his increasing subservience to the Jews, a group of loyal 
senators, led by Brutus, a former friend of Caesar's in his pre-Jewish period, 
resolved to assassinate him. On page 9, Leon writes, "In return for the support 
which he had received from the Jews, Caesar showed them his favor 
conspicuously, and his decrees in their behalf, which, fortunately, were recorded 
by those in compulsory military service, and allowed them to send shipments of 
gold.” 
 
Thus, we find that Caesar made the Jews a privileged group who were above the 
laws of Rome. The traffic, in gold between nations was the cornerstone of Jewish 
international power two thousand years ago, just as it is today. It was carried on 
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under the guise of being a "religious" occupation, and if we understand that the 
religion of the Jews was and is gold, this was an accurate description. The 
Jewish Temple in Jerusalem was still the headquarters of Jehovah. Several 
Roman Senators tried to ban the traffic in gold, only to be overthrown by Jewish 
power. On page 10 of "Jews of Ancient Rome," Leon writes, "For many nights 
after Caesar's murder, groups of Jews came to weep at the site of his funeral 
pyre." 
 
Here too, nothing has changed. We saw the Jews weeping at the funeral of 
Roosevelt, and at the funeral of Churchill. They will always be weeping when a 
politician who has committed himself to the machinations of world Jewry meets 
his end. 
 
Leon stated that Emperor Augustus, who inherited the empire after Caesar's 
generals fell out amongst themselves, restored the special privileges of the Jews. 
This probably explains why he emerged stronger than the other factions, which 
divided Rome after Caesar's death. As Jewish decay continued, the Empire 
rapidly weakened. After the death of Domitian in 96 CE, the emperors of Rome 
were no longer of Roman birth; henceforward, they were all foreigners. The 
power of the Jews was such that no Roman politician dared to attack them. Leon 
quotes the speech of Cicero in October 59, before a Roman jury. Cicero was 
defending Lucius Asia. Flaccus had tried to enforce the ban on the Jewish 
shipments of gold, with the result that the Jews of Rome had him removed from 
office and brought back to face a trumped up charge of embezzlement 
 
Cicero stated: 
"Gold. This is obviously why the present case is being tried close to the Aurelian 
Steps. It is because of this particular charge that you have sought out this 
location, Laelius [the prosecutor]. You know how large a group they [the Jews] 
are, and how influential they are in politics. I will lower my voice and speak just 
loudly enough for the jury to hear me; for there are plenty of individuals to stir up 
those Jews against me and against every good Roman, and I don't intend to 
make it any easier for them to do this. Since gold was regularly exported each 
year in the name of the Jews from Italy and all our provinces to Jerusalem, 
Flaccus there, gentlemen of the jury, who cannot sincerely commend this action? 
The exportation of gold had been forbidden by the Senate on many previous 
occasions, and most strictly of all during my consulship. Further, that Flaccus 
was opposed to this barbarous Jewish superstition was proof of his strong 
character that he defended the Republic by frequently denying the 
aggressiveness of the Jewish mobs at political gatherings was evidence of his 
high sense of responsibility." 
 
This speech of Cicero's is one of the few revelations of Jewish subversion, which 
survived the burning of libraries. The great consul of Rome, Cicero, had to lower 
his voice to avoid stirring up the Jews. A Roman aristocrat, Flaccus, was 
removed from office and dragged back to Rome to face a false charge. Why? 
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Because he had tried to enforce the Roman law banning the Jewish traffic in 
gold. The outcome of this trial was that Flaccus was acquitted of the charge of 
embezzlement, but the Senate ban on the shipping of gold was removed. Thus, 
the Jews won their objective, and Flaccus was lucky to escape with his life after 
he had opposed them. In the face of this power of the Jews, the Roman 
aristocrats were no longer able to keep order in the Empire, and Rome fell to the 
Barbarians. 
 
In a papyrus found in Oxyhynchus, Egypt, a Roman named Hermaiscus is tried 
for treason, apparently because, like Haman in the Persian Empire, he protested 
against the growing power of the Jews. The papyrus states that in his defense, 
Hermaiscus said to the Emperor Trajan, "It distresses me to see your cabinet and 
your privy council filled with Jews." Of course, he executed his own death 
sentence for his daring statement. How many other gentiles have died for like 
offenses during the past centuries? 
—From "New History of The Jews" by Eustace Mullins 
 
"Considering all the factors, it appears that in the Egyptian Therapeuts, we 
possess a Jewish religious community that was evidently part of a massive 
brotherhood."  
—D. M. Murdock "Christ in Egypt" 
 
"The Therapeuts, who in turn created Christianity." Where did the Jews steal and 
corrupt their concepts from? It is apparent from the purported remarks of the 
emperor Hadrian in a letter to his brother-in-law Servianus around 34 CE, as 
related by the Pagan writer Vopiscus circa 300, that the Jews at Alexandria were 
very involved in the worship of Serapis, as were the Christians. Over the 
centuries that this letter has been translated, scholars of certain sensibilities have 
found it expedient either to expunge various parts of it or to denounce it as a 
forgery. 
 
"The worshippers of Serapis are Christians [Chrestians], and those are devoted 
to the God Saerapis, who call themselves the bishops of Chrestos."  
—Emperor Hadrian 
 
"It is thus possible that the "Christos" or the "Anointed God” Pliny's "Christiani" 
were following was Serapis himself. The Jewish branch of the Therapeutae, 
contrived to create an equivalent mythical god-man of their own in Jesus Christ. 
Like his earlier incarnation Osiris, Serapis was called not only Christos but also 
"Chrestos," centuries before the Common Era. Indeed Osiris was styled 
"Chrestus" long before his Jewish copycat Jesus was ever conceived." 
—Acharya S, "Suns of God" 
 
This is why Christianity as noted by scholars is so identical to the Egyptian 
Pagan religions. This is the major template the Jews stole and corrupted it from, 
even lifting the title for their fictional god-man from one of the major Pagan 
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deities. What did the Jews do to the Gentile followers of Serapis once they had 
gotten what they wanted from weakening and subverting the host culture? 
 
In 391 CE, the Patriarch of Alexandria, Theophilus, summoned the monks to 
arms and turned them against the city of Memphis and the great shrine of 
Serapis, the Serapeum, the main temple of the Osirian-Isis religion. The attack 
was akin to ordering the destruction of the Vatican. Egyptian priests were 
massacred in their shrines and in the streets. The ferocity of the violence 
consumed priests, followers, and the Egyptian intellectual elite of Alexandria, 
Memphis and the other cities of Egypt who were murdered, and their temples 
and libraries destroyed. The institutional structure of the Egyptian religion, then 
more than four millennia old, was demolished in less than two decades." 
—Acharya S "Suns of God" 
 
The ancient Romans wrote that the Christian mobs were funded, lead, and 
organized from local Jewish community synagogues within the empire. They also 
called Christianity "a sect of Judaism." Now we know why. 
 
 
 Sources: 
 
§ "New History Of The Jews" —Eustace Mullins 
§ "Christ in Egypt" —D. M. Murdock 
§ "Suns of God"—Acharya S 
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THE VATICAN SYNAGOGUE OF ROME. 
 
 
As written in the Jewish Origins of Christianity: 
"The Jews were in control of the later Roman Empire in the same way they 
control the world today, via control of the central key centers of the Nations. The 
Jews, using this power, created Christianity and imposed it from above and 
below. The same they would do later on in Russia with Communism." 
 
The Vatican is the Kremlin on the Tiber.  
The last Pope, John Paul the Second was a racial Jew. His mother was a Polish 
Jewess by the name of Katz, making him by Jewish law, full-blooded Jew. "The 
Pope's mother was Emily Katz, whose Polish name is "Emilia Kaczorowska," 
which is usually Anglicized by American immigrants to the familiar sounding, 
"Emily Katz."  
http://www.jewwatch.com/jew-religions-christianity-penetration-pope-john-paul-2-
jewish-news-release.html 
 
He was not the first Jewish Pope in history either. A majority of the College of 
Cardinals elected the first cardinal of acknowledged Jewish descent, Anacletus 
II, as pope in 1130. Anacletus II, whose original name was Pietro [Peter] 
Pierleone, was the great-grandson of a Roman Jew, Baruch Pierleone. 
—H.Geduld Cleveland Jewish News 
 
“Halley's Bible Handbook has a commentary which is most informative. Innocent 
III, a Jew [1198-1216 A.D.], was the most powerful of all the Popes, and claimed 
to be the "Vicar of Christ," "Vicar of God" and "Supreme Sovereign over the 
Church and the World." He claimed the right to depose Kings and Princes, and 
that "All things on earth and in heaven and in hell were subject to the Vicar of 
Christ." He brought the Church into the Supreme Control of the State. 
 
Kings of Germany, France, England, and practically all of the monarchies of 
Europe obeyed his will. He was even able to bring the Byzantine Empire under 
his control. Never in all of history has any one single man exerted more power. 
He ordered two crusades, decreed Transubstantiation, and confirmed Auricular 
Confession. He forbade the reading of the Bible in the vernacular, ordered the 
extermination of heretics, instituted the inquisition, and ordered the massacre of 
the Albigenses. More blood was shed under his direction and that of his 
successors, than in any other period of the Roman Church History. All of the 
nations of Europe were under this corrupt and despotic Political-Religious 
domination of the Popes and their Papacy for a total of 1260 years, from 606 CE 
to 1866 CE, with each Pope enforcing his own personal doctrine or whim, to 
subjugate the populace. Immorality was rampant in the Papacy and the Church. 
John XXIII, a Jew [1410-1415], called by some, the most depraved criminal who 
ever sat on the Papal Throne, guilty of nearly every crime. As Cardinal in 
Bologna, 200 maidens, nuns, and married women all fell victim to him. As Pope, 
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he violated virgins, nuns, lived in adultery with his brother's wife, was guilty of 
sodomy and other nameless evils, he bought the Papal office and sold 
Cardinalates to the children of wealthy families.” 
 
"Pope Gregory VII [a Jew] decided it was no murder to kill excommunicated 
persons. This rule was incorporated into canon law. During the revision of the 
code, which took place in the 16th century, and which produced an entire volume 
of corrections, the passage on page 189 was allowed to stand. It appears in 
every reprint of the Corpus Juris. It has been for 700 years, and continues to be, 
part of the ecclesiastical law.” 
 
The false claims that the church was at odds with the Jews is total nonsense. 
Many popes, as can be seen from their images, are racial Jews. One can 
compare their pictures beside photographs of notorious racial Jews today and 
see they look like twins. 
 
The 1486 publication of the Malleus Malficarum by the Dominican friars Heinrich 
KRAMER [JEW] and James SPRENGER [JEW],  was the document and 
manifesto that instigated the mass murder of some 50 to100 hundred thousand 
innocent Gentiles, many women, who where hideously tortured and murdered by 
"Witch Finders" for decades, and it was created, published and pushed by Jews. 
 
Note these two kikes Kramer and Sprenger were members of the Dominican 
Friars. When the Spanish government found that Jews within Spain had been 
working with the Moors against them as a fifth column, [like the Jews always do 
even in America, as nearly all the Communist spies and agents where kikes], 
they launched an investigation into the Jews in Spain. The Vatican was 
screaming at them to stop [note the Vatican on the other hand ordered and 
encouraged the inquisition against Gentiles wiping out millions] and many Jews 
were given sanctuary by the Vatican on papal orders. It was also the Jewish 
Jesuits who ran much of the inquisition as well. 
 
What the Spanish investigation, much like the later FBI investigations into the 
Communists in America found; all of the high ranking Catholic Clergy in Spain 
where racial JEWS! Guess why the Vatican was trying to halt the investigations. 
Do you really think that this was only limited to Spain when even the Popes were 
racial Jews, as evidenced here? The creation of a hate manifesto written by two 
racial Jews within the Catholic Clergy lead to a real HOLOCAUST of tens of 
thousands of Gentiles, with most being murdered by being burnt to death. In 
addition, it is a little known fact that under the Catholic rule, the Jews obtained a 
free Jewish Kingdom [Septimaniain] Europe. 
 
The Vatican also had the original Pagan Monarchy killed off as much as possible, 
and replaced with criminal proxies, only loyal to them. The most famous case 
being the murder of King Dagobert of the Merovingians by the Vatican. His crown 
was then usurped by the Vatican and given to Pepin the Fat of Herstal, of whom 
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had been one of Dagobert's trust mayors. The killer was acting on direct orders 
from Pepin himself. This set up a situation in Western Europe where the Aryan 
Royal lines were one by one usurped by the enemy. 
 
The original Pagan Royalty rule was then passed into guess what tribe’s hands, 
just as the Jews came to rule Russia as the Commissars and Party officials 
under the banner of their Communist Ideology, after killing off the Gentile 
aristocracy. 
 
"Makir Theuderic [Jew] married a sister of Pepin called Alda. His son Guillaume 
[i.e. William] d'Orange, is also famous in the French Chansons and was 
nicknamed 'Hook Nosed'. He was fluent in Arabic and Hebrew. The Heraldic 
device on his shield was the same as that of the Eastern Exilarchs — the Lion of 
Judah. Guillaume observed the Sabbath and Sukkoth during his campaigns."  
"Machir's sister known as Bertha Bigfoot married the son of Charles Martel, 
Pepin, and became the mother of Charlemagne. Bertha [also called Bertrada] 
gave birth to Charlemagne in 742. Bertha's mother was said to be called 'White 
Flower' [Blanche Fleur] or Lilly-which is the origin of the name of the House of 
Lily for the French Kings. Lily is also a title acquainted with the Davidic House 
and the future Messiah as the 'Lilly of the Valley'. Charlemagne was referred to 
as "David" by his followers. When Charlemagne became King in 768 on the 
death of his father King Pepin I, he proclaimed Makir the Western Exilarch, King 
of Septimania. Makir was his maternal uncle [the brother of his mother]. The 
families of Machir, Gershom, and Bertha were to replace the old Merovingian 
Dynasty, and they took for themselves the Merovingian names and titles. As a 
result, the genealogies became confused and later generations obscured the fact 
of this powerful Jewish Dynasty in Europe. Later genealogists hid the origin of 
the mother of Charlemagne with a false genealogy linking her to the 
Merovingians. They did the same for all the Exilarch family. You must remember 
that The Carolingians were replacing the Merovingians, and they had a need for 
legitimatizing themselves by appearing to be a continuation of the Merovingian 
line. Fortunately in many cases they have only thinly disguised the genealogies 
so that it is possible to reconstruct them." —Athol Bloomer 
 
Charlemagne was the leader who with full Papal support, launched massive 
Crusades into the Pagan heartland of the Saxons. Wealthy Jewish merchants 
within the realm funded his wars against Gentiles. Charlemagne openly stated, 
“The Jews shall be the bankers of his Empire.” 
 
Of his decade’s long physical and cultural genocide: 
"In 768, Charlemagne started a 32 year long campaign of what can only be 
described as genocidal evangelism against the Saxons under his control in 
Western Germany. The campaign started with the cutting down of the Saxon's 
most sacred tree, their version of the World Tree or Yggdrasill, [the symbol of the 
beginning of the earth and the source of all life in the ancient Indo-European 
religions], located in a sacred Saxon forest near present day Marburg. 
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Charlemagne quickly turned to violence as a means of spreading the Christian 
word. In 772, at Quierzy, he issued a proclamation that he would kill every Saxon 
who refused to accept Jesus Christ, and from that time on, he kept a special 
detachment of Christian priests who doubled as executioners, and in every 
Saxon village in which they went, these priests would execute anybody who 
refused to be baptized. 
 
Then in 782, at Verden, Charlemagne carried out the act for which he is most 
notoriously associated - he ordered the beheading of 4,500 Saxons in one day 
who had made the error of being caught practicing Paganism after they had 
agreed to be Christians. Charlemagne's constant companion and biographer, the 
monk Einhard, vividly captured the event in his biography of the Frankish king. In 
it is written that the King rounded up 4,500 Saxons who "like dogs that return to 
their vomit" had returned to the pagan religions they had been forced to give up 
upon pain of death. After having all 4,500 Saxons beheaded "the king went into 
winter camp, and there celebrated mass as usual." Twelve years later, in 794, 
Charlemagne introduced a law under which every third Saxon living in any pagan 
area was kidnapped and forced to resettle and be raised amongst Christian 
Franks. 
 
The Christian missionary, St. Boniface, felling the sacred great oak tree of 
Geismar, Hesse, in 724 CE. The oak tree was sacred to the god Thor, and was 
one of many pagan sites that the Christians destroyed in their ultimately 
successful attempts to destroy all other religions except Christianity. Despite this, 
many pagan customs remained, such as the celebration of spring. The Christians 
stole from the Pagan Goddess of Fertility, Ostara, and created the Christian rite 
of Easter ["Ostara" = "Easter"], and stole from the Winter solstice, which was 
originally Pagan, and marked the longest night of winter, and turned it into 
Christmas. 
 
“With the use of violent and bloody coercion, Saxon and German Paganism was 
literally killed off, and most of the survivors became Christians more out of fear 
than out of genuine conviction." —Kemp, March of the Titans  
 
The Vatican also passed strict laws that allowed Jews to become moneylenders, 
while denying Gentiles from the same. This created an advantage for their fellow 
Jews to gain control of the wealth in Europe and the wealthy banking houses. 
Many banker Jews openly funded the Vatican. To this day, the Rothschilds are 
bankers for the Vatican. 
 
The Jesuits were also a Jewish created and Papal/Vatican backed order- the 
original Mossad: 
"The Jesuits [Society of Jesus] are the spies and the assassination squad of the 
Catholic Church. People who believe this institution to be "religious" or "spiritual" 
are sadly deluded. It is and always has been political in every respect. It is a 
political front that operates to control people using many fictitious religious 



 19 

characters and ceremonies stolen from religions predating it from around the 
world. The separation of church and state mean nothing to the Catholic Church 
that works relentlessly and ruthlessly for world domination by any means 
possible. This institution has been built on mass murder, torture, extortion, 
organized crime, lies and depriving humanity of true spirituality. It has controlled 
kings, queens, nobility, presidents, governments, and nearly anyone in power."  
http://www.exposingchristianity.com/Jesuits.html  
 
"Men of Jewish lineage rendered the Society famous by their doctrine, sanctity, 
and erudition." —García Girón de Alarcón 
 
"We Jesuits take pleasure in admitting those of Jewish ancestry." 
—Jerónimo Nadal Morey 
https://sites.google.com/a/jewishjesuits.com/www/ 
[www.jewishjesuits.com] 
 
In General Ludendorff's book "Das Geheimnis Der Jesuitenmacht Und Ihr Ende" 
he agreed that the Jesuits are controlled by Jews. 
 
"The first Jesuits were crypto Jews. Ignatius Loyola himself was a crypto Jew of 
the Occult Cabala. A crypto Jew is a Jew who converts to another religion and 
outwardly embraces the new religion, while secretly maintaining Jewish 
practices. As John Torell explains: "In 1491 San Ignacio de Loyola was born in 
the Basque province of Guipuzcoa, Spain. His parents were Marranos and at the 
time of his birth the family was very wealthy. As a young man he became a 
member of the Jewish Illuminati order in Spain. As a cover for his crypto Jewish 
activities, he became very active as a Roman Catholic. On May 20, 1521, 
Ignatius [as he was now called] was wounded in a battle, and became a semi- 
cripple. Unable to succeed in the military and political arena, he started a quest 
for holiness and eventually ended up in Paris where he studied for the 
priesthood. In 1539, he had moved to Rome where he founded the "JESUIT 
ORDER," which was to become the most vile, bloody and persecuting order in 
the Roman Catholic Church. In 1540, the current Pope Paul III approved the 
order. At Loyola's death in 1556 there were more than 1000 members in the 
Jesuit order, located in a number of nations." 
 
Ignatius of Loyola's secretary, Polanco, was of Jewish descent and was the only 
person present at Loyola's deathbed. James Lainez, who succeeded Loyola as 
the second Jesuit General, was also of Jewish descent. Jews were attracted to 
the Jesuit order and joined in large numbers. Lacunza was no exception. He was 
a Jew, which explains why he introduced the eschatological teaching of a return 
to the Jewish animal sacrifices during the Millennium. [In a book titled “The 
Coming of the Messiah in Glory and Majesty” published in 1812, 11 years after 
the death of its author, Jesuit Emanuel de Lacunza , wrote under the fictitious 
pen name of a purportedly converted Jew, Rabbi Juan Josaphat Ben Ezra, in 
order to conceal his identity and to make his writings more palatable to the 
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Protestant readers. He promoted the writings of sixteenth century Jesuit priest 
Francisco Ribera, developing a futuristic perspective that restricted the prophetic 
fulfillments in the book of Revelation to the end of the world]. Lacunza also wrote 
that during a millennium after the tribulation, the Jewish animal sacrifices would 
be reinstated along with the Eucharist [the mass] of the Catholic Church. 
Lacunza has followed after Jewish fables and replaced the commandments of 
God with the commandments of men. That doctrine gives the Jews primacy in 
God's plan and relegates Christians to a prophetic parenthetical to be supplanted 
by the Jews during the thousand year earthly reign of Christ. " 
http://www.israelect.com/reference/WillieMartin/Ignatius_Loyola.htm 
 
The Renaissance and Reformation: 
“The Merovingian dynasty was the mastermind behind the Renaissance: “René 
[d’Anjou] was the Angevin monarch who, at the time of the renaissance, single-
handedly spearheaded a Hermetic revival in Europe. It was he who personally 
convinced Cosimo de Medici to translate many ancient texts such as the Corpus 
Hermeticum into various European tongues for the first time ever. The Angevins 
were primarily advocates of the Regia, or Royal Art, of hermeticism.” 
 
The forces of the reformation where put into action to redirect the forces of the 
Renaissance which where signaling an end to the power of the Jewish Christian 
program, as people where rejecting the Catholic Church, seeing it as a vehicle of 
Jewish power and agenda. This was the observation the Cathars made as well. 
Rome was Jewish. At the high point of the Church’s power, it began to collapse, 
due to its own corruption and popular revolt. People where returning to their 
organic traditions.  
 
This is why the Jews put one of their own, Martin Luther out front. As researcher 
and author Christopher Jon Bjerknes points out, Martin Luther was Jewish and 
other Jews acknowledged this. Luther himself was a total Philo-Semite, even 
stating how he was often accused of being Jewish himself. Why does Luther go 
from this to denouncing the Jews? 
 
Because it was reverse psychology. The heart of the movement away from 
Catholicism was based on the disgust at its Jewishness, so he had to pour on the 
hatred for the Jews and while trying to convince the people that the Jews where 
the enemies of Christ. The Jews still play this game to this day, even putting false 
Talmud quotes about Jesus and Mary, when the Talmud only mentions Balaam a 
Pagan High Priest, not Jesus. In fact, the Talmud does not even mention Jesus 
Christ. This is reverse psychology, and it worked. Martin Luther the Jew, and Jew 
John Coleman [Changed his name to Calvin], were the major forces behind the 
reformation, which allowed Jewish Christianity to hijack the spiritual awakening 
and rejection of Christianity, and push an even more puerile form of this program 
on the populace, which keeps Gentiles bound under the Jewish spell. This is why 
Giordano Bruno a leading advocate of the spiritual rebirth of authentic European 
culture, and who was openly anti-Christian and anti-Jewish, was hunted down by 
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the Jewish forces of the inquisition and burned at the stake with an iron spike 
through his tongue so he could not even speak at his own execution, whereas 
Martin Luther didn’t even have one hair on his head touched by the Catholic 
regime.  
 
Who controls the Vatican Bank: 
"It is a somewhat curious sequel to the attempt to set up a Catholic competitor to 
the Rothschilds that at the present time [1905] the latter are the guardians of the 
papal treasure." -The Jewish Encyclopedia [Vol. 2, p. 497] 
The Jewish Rothschilds do. Just as the Kremlin under the Red Banner was the 
synagogue of Moscow, so is the Vatican the synagogue of Rome. 
 
_________________________________________________________ 
 
Sources 
 
§ THE HOUSE OF DAVID, Athol Bloomer 
§ March of The Titans, Arthur Kemp  
§ Communism, a Jewish Talmudic Concept- Know Your Enemy. By Will 

Martin 
§ MYSTERY, BABYLON THE GREAT 
§ Realm of the Ring Lords, Sir L. Gardner 
§ https://sites.google.com/a/jewishjesuits.com/www/ 
§ http://www.exposingchristianity.com/ 
§ http://www.clevelandjewishnews.com/articles/2005/05/26/news/world/pope

s0527.txt 
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THE NEW ZION: 
THE BIBLE IS A BOOK OF JEWISH WITCHCRAFT 

 
 
The final purpose of the Bible is for the Jews to build their Temple of Solomon, 
which is the Jewish World Order. The Bible is used to create the energy to 
manifest their Chief Corner Stone. The Jews stated in their Protocols that their 
Messiah is the keystone [capstone] to their entire agenda. “Messiah” is the 
meaning of chief capstone or corner stone. 
 
Jewish Talmud: 
Simeon Haddarsen, fol. 56-D: "When the Messiah comes every Jew will have 
2800 slaves." 
 
Special note 888 and 8 also relate in the Bible directly to the Nazarene as he is 
the Messiah or Chief Corner Stone of which is the birth and completion of the 
Jewish World Order [Messiah meaning Chief Cornerstone/Capstone]. This 
represents the finished Temple of Solomon.  
 
1 Peter 2:6 [mentioning Jesus] [2+6=8 as stated above, the Nazarene as the 
Jewish Messiah who creates the Global Zion where Gentiles are slaves]. 
 
"Behold, I lay in Zion a chief cornerstone, elect, precious, and he who believes in 
Him will by no means be put to shame"  
 
7 is a number of finishing man with spiritual power, and of the Jewish Messiah in 
this case. It goes back to the number 22 in Revelations and Psalms, the books 
related to global Jewish Rule. 7 therefore, its value is for you who have faith, but 
for those without faith: "The stone which the builders rejected has become the 
cornerstone." 
 
8 is the number of the creation of this Jew World Order, hence also the undoing 
of those opposed to it. 8 and "A stone that will make people stumble, and a rock 
that will make them fall." They stumble by disobeying the word, as is their 
destiny.  
 
Note 9, being the number of finality and of God's proclamation, and judgments. 
Here we see the Jews are the Chosen People who will be given the Messiah and 
world rule, which is all through the Bible, and its point, the core of the Bible is the 
Jewish Torah. 9* But you are "a chosen race, a royal priesthood, a holy nation, a 
people of his own, so that you may announce the praises" of him who called you 
out of darkness into his wonderful light. 
 
This is an extension of Psalm 89:19 [8+9=17=8 the Nazarene and 1+9=10 the 
number of the Jewish Global Zion the number of perfection of their "God;" when 
they rule. As seen by this verse is about the Jewish Messiah]. 
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"Psalm 89:19 Then thou spakest in vision to thy holy one, and saidst, I have laid 
help upon one that is mighty; I have exalted one chosen out of the people." 
 
The pinnacle the Nazarene stands upon is considered to be the only remaining 
portion of the original temple built by Solomon. The Pinnacle is the place where 
the Chief Cornerstone is placed. The Nazarene is thus the Jewish Messiah by 
this statement in the Bible. 
 
The dialogue between the Nazarene and the Christian Devil is connected to 
whom the Rabbis state is the person identified by God in Psalm 91 and is none 
other than the Messiah. We see again this is the Jewish Messiah and what this 
means. Psalms is based upon the Jewish Messiah and World Rule. Psalms is 
the 19th book in the Old Testament. 1+9=10. Psalms 91 also equals 10. 
 
Psalms contains 150 Psalms which add to 6 [1+5+0=6], the number the Jews 
wish to bind us under. 73 of these are dedicated to King David who is connected 
to the Jewish World Leader, the Nazarene. 7+3=10 the perfect number in 
Judaism and relates to the 613 [6+1+3=10] rules of their "God" that the Jews will 
impose upon the Gentiles with their Theocratic law. This is as vital as the Torah 
and its law is the salvation [World Rule] of their God and the essence of their 
Covenant, which gives them this promise. We see the Messiah is actually the 
fulfillment of this all-important Theocratic law:  
Matthew 5:17-18 Jesus states: 
17 Think not that I am come to destroy the law, or the prophets: I am not come to 
destroy, but to fulfill. [1=7=8 the number of the new order and power to be 
created by this laws fulfillment the coming of the Messiah and the Temple of 
Solomon finished.] 
 
18 For verily I say unto you, Till heaven and earth pass, one jot or one tittle shall 
in no wise pass from the law, till all be fulfilled. 
 [1+8=9; 9 is the number of finality and Gods judgment once again the setting up 
subliminally for this Jewish Messiah and Slave State]. 
 
Revelations is the final book in the Bible and has 22 chapters, the number of 
God, the final working completed- the finishing of the building of the Temple of 
Solomon; the number of the Master Builder, literally the Messiah. 12, which 
relates back to Gentiles being bound without power at the soul and becoming 
slaves to the Jewish Zion and its Messiah. This is the full agenda of this book in 
this verse: 
Revelation 22:12 "And behold, I am coming quickly, and My reward is with Me, to 
give to everyone according to his work. I am the Alpha and the Omega, the 
Beginning and the End, the First and the Last." 
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Hence why the Nazarene utters the 7 last words of finality, on the cross which is 
the phase at the start of Psalms 22, Psalms being the book of Jewish World 
Rule. 
 
Within the text: 
Revelations chapter 17:1–20:15, depicts the destruction of the Gentile [Pagan 
nations] by the Jewish Messiah. 
 
The New Creation [21:1–22:5] Rev 12:1–6, depicting the New Israel, The Jew 
World Order, 12=completion. This is the number like 6 of man falling short of 
spiritual power and being a slave to Zion. 12 being this within the context of total 
Jewish World Order. 
 
5 She gave birth to a son, a male child, destined to rule all the nations with an 
iron rod.* Her child was caught up to God and his throne.  
 
6 The woman herself fled into the desert where she had a place prepared by 
God, that there she might be taken care of for twelve hundred and sixty days.*  
[12 and 66 the numbers of as stated which is when the New Israel the Jewish 
World Order is created by the Jewish Messiah the Nazarene. There are 66 books 
in the bible that also add into 12.] 
 
10 Then I heard a loud voice in heaven say: [Note as stated, 10 the number of 
completion, being under their Theocratic rule.] 
"Now have salvation and power come, and the kingdom of our God and the 
authority of his Anointed."  
 
Note the Rod of Iron relates back to book Psalms depicting the Jewish World 
Messiah and Rule: 
[Psalm 2] A royal Psalm. To rebellious kings [Ps 2:1–3] God responds vigorously 
[Ps 2:4–6]. A speaker proclaims the divine decree [in the legal adoption language 
of the day], making the Israelite king the earthly representative of God [Ps 2:7–9] 
and warning kings to obey [Ps 2:10–11]. The Psalm has a messianic meaning for 
the Church; the New Testament understands it of Christ [Acts 4:25–27; 13:33; 
Heb 1:5]. 
 
The Messiah is a Tyrant who shall rule by violence, murder, and force only, 
which is the nature of the Jewish God and People. He shall not tolerate freedom 
[rebellion] of any kind. All the Gentile nations will be enslaved to him. 
 
Psalms, chapter 2 
9 With an iron rod you will shepherd them, like a potter's vessel you will shatter 
them [Note 9 is the number of finality and judgment of God, the final judgment. 
The Messiah lays waste by judgment on the Gentile world and destroys it]. 
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[Note 8 refers to be made to proposer and the creation of a New Order or a new 
start. The Jewish Messiah shall create the order in which the Jews shall reap the 
fat of the Gentle land; the Jew World Order slave state. As stated, 8 in the Bible 
refers to the Nazarene.] 
More: 
In the Bible, the number 8, which comes after the number 7 signifies 
completeness, and symbolizes a new beginning, or a new order of things; a new 
creation, a new birth. 
 
Christ was selected as the Passover Lamb on the 10th day of the first month, a 
weekly Sabbath [John 12: 28-29]. He was crucified on the 14th day [7 + 7, or 
double completeness], which was also the 4th day of the week. He was in the 
tomb exactly 3 days and 3 nights. He was resurrected toward the end of the next 
weekly Sabbath, the 17th [the number of victory]. The 17th was also the 8th day 
when counted inclusively from the 10th day, the day of His selection. Thus, the 
confluence of these numbers shows Jesus' total victory. The building of the 
Temple of Solomon and his time on the cross relates to Psalm 22. The 10 refers 
to rule under the Jewish Theocratic law. Which Jesus states he is the fulfillment 
of. 
 
 Matthew 5:17-18 
17 Think not that I am come to destroy the law, or the prophets: I am not come to 
destroy, but to fulfill. 
18 For verily I say unto you, Till heaven and earth pass, one jot or one tittle shall 
in no wise pass from the law, till all be fulfilled 
 
Psalms: 8 
And I will give you the nations as your inheritance, and, as your possession, the 
ends of the earth. 
 
[My note- 11 relates to destruction and chaos. The Messiah will destroy and 
plunge the Gentile nations into ruin, who do not bow before Zion and the Jewish 
race as slaves]. 
11 Serve the LORD with fear; exult with trembling, Accept correction lest he 
become angry and you perish along the way when his anger suddenly blazes up. 
Blessed are all who take refuge in him! 
 
Jesus is the Jewish Messiah only: 
With Revelations being the end of the Bible, it is also the 66th book, 66 [6+6=12], 
which relates back to the Gentiles being bound without power at the soul and 
being enslaved to the Jewish Zion and its Messiah. It is the perfect number in the 
Bible because it expresses its intent to enslave the Gentiles, as the Jewish word 
“Goyim” literally means beasts of burden, and slaves to the Jewish World Order. 
The Jewish Holy Books repeatedly state that Gentiles simply exist to be slaves 
for the Jewish People and their "God." This is why 12 and 66 are stated to be the 
number connected with the New Israel. 
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Here is the final reality right from the mouth of the Jewish Messiah itself: 
 
Mat 15:22 And, behold, a woman of Canaan came out of the same coasts, and 
cried unto him, saying, Have mercy on me, O Lord, thou Son of David; my 
daughter is grievously vexed with a devil.  
 
Mat 15:23 But he answered her not a word. And his disciples came and besought 
him, saying, Send her away; for she crieth after us. [Send her way because she 
is a Goy]. 
 
Mat 15:24 But he [Jesus] answered and said, I am not sent but unto the lost 
sheep of the house of Israel. [The Jewish Messiah only, not the Goyim.] 
 
Mat 15:25 Then came she and worshipped him, saying, Lord, help me. [Begs as 
slave]. 
 
Mat 15:26 But he [Jesus] answered and said, It is not meet to take the children's 
[of Israel the Jews] bread, and to cast it to dogs. [Jesus in true Jewish style calls 
her as a Gentile an animal, and all Gentiles as well. He did not come for the 
Goyim the animals only for the Chosen People, his fellow Jews.] 
 
Very Important: 
Mat 15:27 And she said, Truth, Lord: yet the dogs eat of the crumbs which fall 
from their masters' table. [Note here we have 1+5=6 the number 6 is stamped on 
all that is connected with human labor; the man without spiritual power in the 
ancient world, called an animal, the Goyim.  
2+7=9 the number of the finality and judgment of God; the Gentile being reduced 
to a slave and bowing before the Jewish Masters, the Jewish God, and the 
Jewish Messiah; The Jew World Order]. 
 
Matthew 15:24] He [Jesus] replied, "I was sent only to the lost sheep of the 
house of Israel." 
 
Matthew 10:5-20 
These twelve Jesus sent out with the following instructions: "Do not go among 
the Gentiles or enter any town of the Samaritans.  
6 Go rather to the lost sheep of Israel. 
 
Christians are false Jews and not given the salvation of the Messiah: 
 
Revelation 2:9-10 
9 I know your afflictions and your poverty—yet you are rich! I know about the 
slander of those who say they are Jews and are not, but are a synagogue of 
Satan. 10 Do not be afraid of what you are about to suffer. I tell you, the devil will 
put some of you in prison to test you, and you will suffer persecution for ten days. 
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Be faithful, even to the point of death, and I will give you life as your victor's 
crown.  
 
[9 is the number of finality and 10, Jewish theocratic rule under their Messiah- 
here is the final point]. The Nazarene is addressing the Jews. As he stated he 
only comes for the Jewish race. Gentiles are simply animals to be the slaves of 
the Jews. With the number 10, we see the final truth- only the Jews have 
salvation of the Messiah and Zion. As the Jewish religion states that Adam is 
from the blood of Yahweh this is why he was created on the 7th day, the number 
of completion. Eve they state, had sex with Satan and spawned Cain who is 
reduced to become a part of his natural role in the land of Nod amongst and 
married to the 6th day humans; the Goyim or animals hence their creation on the 
6th day, the number of such. That is the message in Genesis- this is Cain's real 
sin, his birth.  
 
Because Gentiles are from the Seed line of Satan, they can never have the 
Convent of Israel. Thus, they are not entitled to the salvation of the Torah, only 
the Jewish race is. The Gentiles are stated to have Satanic souls and blood in 
the Jewish religion, the religion the Nazarene preached and is the fulfillment of. 
This is why the Nazarene is called the second Adam. 
 
The fake Jews, the synagogue of Satan are the GENTILES. Hence 9 the finality 
of the Judgment of the Jewish Messiah-God upon them as fake Jews. Christians 
[Gentiles] are the fake Jews. They believe themselves to be entitled to the 
Jewish salvation of the Torah, which Jesus in the final book of the Bible states 
they are not of, nor will they ever be, with the next verse of 10, the number of 
Jewish World Order. The Jewish Messiah tells the Jews they will triumph in the 
end and have the promise of salvation, The Jew World Order; the Temple 
finished.  
 
Pay heed: 
John 4:22 
22. "You worship what you do not know; we know what we worship, for salvation 
is of the Jews.  
 
22 is the number of salvation, which is the Temple of Solomon, the New Zion 
where the Jewish Messiah rules from with the rod of iron and treads the Gentiles 
under his feet as slaves and servants.  
 
Christians you literally WORSHIP WHAT YOU DO NOT KNOW, YOUR OWN 
DAMNATION. 
 
Simeon Haddarsen, fol. 56-D: "When the Messiah comes every Jew will have 
2800 slaves." 
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"The nations will gather to pay homage to the people of God: all the fortunes of 
the nations will pass to the Jewish people, they will march captive behind the 
Jewish people in chains and will prostrate themselves before them, their kings 
will bring up their sons, and their princesses will nurse their children. The Jews 
will command the nations; they will summon peoples whom they do not even 
know them will hasten to them. The riches of the sea and the wealth of nations 
will come to the Jews of their own right. "Any people of the Kingdom who will not 
serve Israel will be destroyed"  
—Isidore Loeb [Le Litterature des Pauvres dans la Bible]. 
Important articles that also deal with this subject: 
 
§ http://groups.yahoo.com/group/JoSNewsletter/message/497 
§ http://groups.yahoo.com/group/JoSNewsletter/message/494 
§ http://groups.yahoo.com/group/JoSNewsletter/message/490 
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MIND CONTROL PROGRAMMING AND THE BIBLE 
 
 
Note with the fall of the Soviet Jewion. The Jews have been working to rebuild 
the Christian religion in the failure of their atheist Christian program. This allows 
them to maintain strict control over the populace. From which they will in time 
regain the former control they once had.  
 
We can see in the link how the Jews use subliminal programming on America 
that connects into their spell book the Bible on the populace:  
1960'S SUBLIMINAL MESSAGES [in slow motion] [Youtube video]  
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=Rnkg-yCPryE 
 
2 Corinthians  
12:16 But be it so, I did not myself burden you. But, being crafty, I caught you 
with deception.  
 
Note in the above youtube video, the Jews are using the terms with God 
repeatedly:  
 
"God is real, God is watching" = 22 letters  
 
"Believe in government God" =22 letters  
 
"Obey Consume Obey Consume" = 22 letters  
 
According to Christian and Jewish mysticism, 22 is the number of the Hebrew 
Alphabet is the number of the Master builder, infinity and completion, 
Quintessence [spirit which is God in the universal sense in the Hermetic 
teachings] the mind of God and God. The Nazarene utters the 7 last words of 
finality, on the cross which is the phase at the start of Psalms 22. It equals the 12 
Zodiac signs and 10 planets in the Tarot of which such alphabet is assigned. 
Revelation the last book of the Bible also has 22 chapters.  
 
The number 22 corresponds to the World trump card of the Tarot, indicating 
completion. This indicates the enemy completing their goal of world conquest 
and domination through communism.  
 
More on this important subject in the following article:  
The Holy Bible: A Book of Jewish Witchcraft  
http://gblt.webs.com/Bible_Jewish_Witchcraft.htm  
 
Psalm 66:7  
He [God] rules forever by his power, his eyes watch the nations— let not the 
rebellious rise up against him.  
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The book of psalms is the 19th book of the bible. Note the verse, 66:7; which 
also adds up to 19 [6 + 6 + 7 = 19]. 19 = 19 = 38 and 3 + 8 = 11, which is a 
number of downfall, so the above verse not only threatens against rebellion, but 
given the numbers, it subliminally points out that rebellion will result in down fall.  
 
1 Samuel 12:15  
15 But if ye will not obey the voice of the Lord, but rebel against the 
commandment of the Lord, then shall the hand of the Lord be against you, as it 
was against your fathers.  
 
1 Samuel is the 9th book of the bible. 9 + 12 + 15 = 36; 3 + 6 = 9.  
9 is the number of finality and Judgment, the power of God itself.  
 
Colossians 3:22  
Servants, obey in all things your masters according to the flesh; not with 
eyeservice, as menpleasers; but in singleness of heart, fearing God  
 
Colossians is the 51st book of the bible. [5 + 1 = 6]. The Jews use the number 6 
extensively, such as in their "six million" phony holoco$t. In the bible, the number 
6 is the number of man without any spiritual power. The number 7 has to do with 
the 7 chakras and spiritual power emanating from these and spiritual perfection. 
6 falls short. 6 is also a number of hard labor. Work was done for 6 days and the 
7th was a day of rest.  
 
"The number 6 is stamped on all that is connected with human labor. We see it 
stamped upon his measures, which he uses in his labor, and on the time during 
which he labors. And we see this from the very beginning."  
 
The Jewish emphasis on and use of the number 6, sets up a vibration on the 
astral for the advancement of their agenda, their communist state and world 
order. Communism is slave labor. With the communist state, the jews become 
"god" and all spiritual knowledge is replaced with material atheism.  
 
The above verse of the 51st book of the bible [1 + 5 = 6] advocates slave labor. 
Taken further, the verse 3:22 can be multiplied 3 x 22 = 66; the total number of 
books in the bible, indicating completion of the Jewish communist slave labor 
state and their new world order.  
 
Romans 13: 1-7  
1 Everyone must submit himself to the governing authorities, for there is no 
authority except that which God has established. The authorities that exist have 
been established by God.  
2 Consequently, he who rebels against the authority is rebelling against what 
God has instituted, and those who do so will bring judgment on themselves.  
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3 For rulers hold no terror for those who do right, but for those who do wrong. Do 
you want to be free from fear of the one in authority? Then do what is right and 
he will commend you.  
4 For he is God's servant to do you good. But if you do wrong, be afraid, for he 
does not bear the sword for nothing. He is God's servant, an agent of wrath to 
bring punishment on the wrongdoer.  
5 Therefore, it is necessary to submit to the authorities, not only because of 
possible punishment but also because of conscience.  
6 This is also why you pay taxes, for the authorities are God's servants, who give 
their full time to governing.  
7 Give everyone what you owe him: If you owe taxes, pay taxes; if revenue, then 
revenue; if respect, then respect; if honor, then honor.  
 
The Founders wanted the Great Seal put upon the dollar for a good reason, but 
they never put anything about the Jewish "God" on there. Reference to the 
Jewish "God" was put on American currency by Jewish President Dwight David 
Eisenhower.  
"July 30th, 1956, two years after pushing to have the phrase "under God" 
inserted into the pledge of allegiance, President Dwight D. Eisenhower signs a 
law officially declaring "In God We Trust" to be the nation's official motto. The 
law, P.L. 84-140, also mandated that the phrase be printed on all American 
paper currency." [1] Eisenhower was a Jew by his own confession; the name 
Eisenhower is taken from Eisenhauer a Jewish surname.  
 
"In Eisenhower's West Point Military Academy graduating class yearbook, 
published in 1915, Eisenhower is identified as a "terrible Swedish Jew."  
 
It's not a surprise that the Kosher owned White House with the President Franklin 
Delano Roosevelt who himself was of Dutch-Jewish ancestry and his staff read 
like a synagogue list:  
For more about this, read the article "Jewish Bankers War on America."  
http://gblt.webs.com/Jewish_Bankers_War_On_America.htm 
 
"In 1943, Washington not only transferred Col. Eisenhower to Europe but 
promoted him over more than 30 more experienced senior officers to five star 
general and placed him in charge of all the US forces in Europe.  
 
This "great General" who hid in fear pissing himself when it was believed a tiny 
unarmed, German Commando unit was after him during the war, personally 
ordered the murder of over 1.7 million German soldiers after the war was over in 
his POW death camps. Their only crime was defending their nation and people. 
Many of the above where not any older then 15 years of age. This is another 
blatant example of Pure Talmudic hate.  
For the full article "In 'Eisenhower's Death Camps': A U.S. Prison Guard 
Remembers: http://www.ihr.org/jhr/v10/v10p161_Brech.html 
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"In God We Trust" has 12 letters: Twelve is a perfect number, signifying 
perfection of government, or of governmental perfection. There are 66 books in 
the Bible, which add to 12 [6 + 6 = 12].  
 
The word God also appears 4473 in the Bible adding up to the sum of 9. 9 is the 
number of finality and Judgment, the power of God itself which is wrapped up 
with this:  
 
The Judgments of "God" in Haggai 1:11 are enumerated in nine particulars:  
"And I called for a drought upon the land, and upon the mountains, and upon the 
corn, and upon the new wine, and upon the oil, and upon that which the ground 
bringeth forth, and upon men, and upon cattle, and upon all the labor of the 
hands."  
 
Haggai is the 37th book of the bible. 3 + 7 = 10; so Haggai 1 would be 11; here 
again, we have 11.  
 
"The law was signed by President Eisenhower on July 30, 1956, and the motto 
was progressively added to paper money over a period from 1957 to 1966. 
(Public Law 84-851)[18] The United States Code at 36 U.S.C. § 302, now states: 
"'In God we trust' is the national motto." [2]  
 
One can see that money is a powerful way to inject something into the 
unconscious of the public mind:  
 
9/11 $20 Bill Trick [Youtube video]  
 
Here is more information on subliminals in the Media leading up 911:  
WHAT? ...Hollywood Predicted 9:11??? [Youtube video]  
http://www.youtube.com/watch?v=9sZo8sWAfCs 
Bluntly here:  
9/11 foreshadowed in Super Mario Bros. The Movie [Youtube video]  
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=TKLw_Fm3tqg 
 
And we can witness how the Jewish powers inject their "God" into the mass mind 
again:  
"Eisenhower signed the bill into law on Flag Day, June 14, 1954. Eisenhower 
stated "From this day forward, the millions of our school children will daily 
proclaim in every city and town, every village and rural school house, the 
dedication of our nation and our people to the Almighty.... In this way we are 
reaffirming the transcendence of religious faith in America's heritage and future; 
in this way we shall constantly strengthen those spiritual weapons which forever 
will be our country's most powerful resource, in peace or in war.  
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The phrase "Under God" was incorporated into the Pledge of Allegiance June 14, 
1954, by a Joint Resolution of Congress amending §4 of the Flag Code enacted 
in 1942." [3]  
 
In closing, many people in the JoS e-groups have mentioned how they have 
seen certain numbers repeatedly. This can be a certain number recurring on a 
license plate of a vehicle, or on a digital clock, in an advertisement, and in many 
other places. Sometimes this can even occur for days, but this alone and by itself 
is harmless. When we are aware of certain numbers, this establishes a 
subliminal vibration and before we know it, we begin to see these same numbers 
frequently in our daily lives. This aspect is quite innocent and oftentimes 
meaningless, but in the above article, the perpetrators are fully aware of the 
power of numbers and they enforce this to establish their magickal workings in 
reality, via the Judeo/Christian Bible. This is why many Christians are practically 
coerced into memorizing bible verses, as this imbeds a subconscious link. For 
more on this:  
 
_________________________________________________________ 
 
Sources  
 
[1] This Day in History [www.history.com]  
 
[2] Wikipedia Article: "In God We Trust"  
 
[3] Ibid  
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THE TORAH IS FAKE, THE JEWS LIE ABOUT THEMSELVES 
 
 
Abraham never existed: 
Looking at the major history and historical figures claimed by the Jews, we can 
see the plain truth. Their entire history is false and was stolen from the Gentiles. 
The real foundation of their history rests upon two major characters- Abraham 
and Moses.  
 
The supposed Great Patriarch Abraham and his family, the first "official" Jews in 
history, were in fact stolen from the ancient Hindu Trinity of Brahma, Vishnu, and 
Siva, along with Saraswati: 
 
Since Krishna was not born of man, he was not actually the earthly father of 
Brahma and Mahesh. Therefore, he himself was the protector [Tara] of Brahma. 
In Sanskrit, Tara means "savior; protector." It is a term generally used with the 
gods Rudra, Shiva, Vishnu, and Brahma. Even the Old Testament states that the 
father [protector] of Abraham was Terah [Genesis 11:26.] The Bible tells us that 
Abraham and Sarah were half-siblings. [Genesis 12:19-20.]. The Hindu holy 
books also tells us that a blood relationship existed between them. The Puranas 
relate Saraswati to Brahma and Vishnu. Most frequently, she is associated with 
Brahma. Her connection with him dates earlier than to any other God. She is 
portrayed mostly as his wife and occasionally as his daughter. When Vishnu's 
popularity in India increased, myths relating Saraswati to him appeared. 
[Reference: Sarasvati and the Gods; www.vishvarupa.com.] Therefore, Brahma 
or Vishnu would also have been the Tara [Terah] of Sarasvati because of her 
divine origins. 
 
Brahm [Abraham] Sarasvati [Sarah] 
Abraham or Brahma's home was the land of Haran [Genesis 1:4.] Haran was the 
coastal principality governed by Krishna. It was even named after him because 
Hara [Sun God] is another name of Krishna. Brahma/Abraham was 75 years old 
when he left Haran. 
 
The Bible mentions Haran and Haryana. The Hindu holy books also say that 
Brahma/Abraham lived in Ur of the Chaldees. Ur was a Sumerian name for 
"town; city." Chaldee [pronounced Kaldee] derives from the Sanskrit Kaul, a 
Brahman caste, and Deva [Demi-god]. The North Indian Kauldevas worshiped 
idols representing their ancestors. According to the Hindus, Brahma married 
Sarasvati in Chaldea, the part that is now Afghanistan. 
 
In Hindu mythology, Sarai-Svati is Brahm's sister. The bible gives two stories of 
Abraham. In this first version, Abraham told the Pharaoh that he was lying when 
he introduced Sarai as his sister. In the second version, he also told the king of 
Gerar that Sarai was really his sister. However, when the king scolded him for 
lying, Abraham said that Sarai was in reality both his wife and his sister! "And yet 



 38 

indeed she is my sister; she is the daughter of my father, but not the daughter of 
my mother; and she became my wife." [Genesis 20:12.] 
 
However, the anomalies don't end here. In India, a tributary of the river Saraisvati 
is Ghaggar. Another tributary of the same river is Hakra. According to Jewish 
traditions, Hagar was Sarai's maidservant; the Moslems claim she was an 
Egyptian princess. Notice the similarities of Ghaggar, Hakra and Hagar.  
 
The bible also states that Ishmael, son of Hagar, and his descendants lived in 
India. "...Ishmael breathed his last and died, and was gathered to his kin... They 
dwelt from Havilah [India], by Shur, which is close to Egypt, all the way to 
Asshur."  
[Genesis 25:17-18.] It is an interesting fact that the names of Isaac and Ishmael 
are derived from Sanskrit: [Hebrew] Ishaak = [Sanskrit] Ishakhu = "Friend of 
Shiva." [Hebrew] Ishmael = [Sanskrit] Ish-Mahal = "Great Shiva.” —Matlock 
 
Lingam worship in the Bible: 
In the 28th chapter of Genesis, Jacob, after having a dream about a 'ladder' 
reaching up to heaven with angels 'limbing' it and God standing at the top[12], 
erects a 'pillar' with the stone he was using for a pillow and consecrates it with oil 
[18]. He calls the place Beit-El ['Bethel' in English, which means 'House of God'] 
[19]. He says that the stone pillar itself was "God's house" [22]. And he later, in 
chapter 35 verse 14, erects another one on the road from Paddan-Aram. 
 
The worship of Brahma was also in the Near Eastern World: 
"About 1900 BCE, the cult of Brahm was carried to the Middle and Near East by 
several different Indian groups after a severe rainfall and earthquake tore 
Northern India apart, even changing the courses of the Indus and Saraisvati 
rivers." 
 
"...the Temple of Mecca was founded by a colony of Brahmins from India. It was 
a sacred place before the time of Mohamed, and they were permitted to make 
pilgrimages to it for several centuries after his time. Its great celebrity as a sacred 
place long before the time of the prophet cannot be doubted."  
[Anacalypsis, Vol. I, page 421].  
 
"...the city of Mecca is said by the Brahmins, on the authority of their old books, 
to have been built by a colony from India; and its inhabitants from the earliest era 
have had a tradition that it was built by Ishmael, the son of Agar. This town, in the 
Indus language, would be called Ishmaelistan." [Ibid, p. 424].  
 
Before Mohammed's time, The Hinduism of the Arab peoples was called Tsaba. 
Tsaba or Saba is a Sanskrit word meaning "Assembly of the Gods.” Tsaba was 
also called Isha-ayalam [Shiva's Temple]. The term Moslem or Moshe-ayalam 
[Shiva's Temple] is just another name of Sabaism. —Matlock 
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The facts on Mohammed’s fictional existence: 
http://exposingthelieofislam.wordpress.com/muhammad-never-existed/ 
 
One of the shrines in the Kaaba was also dedicated to the Hindu Creator God 
Brahma, [not Abraham], which is why the illiterate prophet of Islam claimed it was 
dedicated to Abraham. The word "Abraham" is none other than a 
mispronunciation of the word Brahma. This can be clearly proven if one 
investigates the root meanings of both words. Abraham is said to be one of the 
oldest Semitic prophets. His name is supposed to be derived from the two 
Semitic words 'Ab' meaning 'Father' and 'Raam/Raham' meaning 'of the exalted.' 
In the book of Genesis, Abraham simply means 'Multitude.' The word Abraham is 
derived from the Sanskrit word Brahma. The root of Brahma is 'Brah,' which 
means - 'to grow or multiply in number.' In addition, Lord Brahma, the Creator 
God of Hinduism is said to be the Father of all Men and Exalted of all the Gods, 
for it is from him that all beings were generated. Thus again we come to the 
meaning 'Exalted Father.' This is a clear pointer that Abraham is none other than 
the heavenly father." 
 
Moses never existed: 
http://stellarhousepublishing.com/moses-dionysus.html 
 
Famed French philosopher Voltaire made the following astounding remarks way 
back in the 18th century - and he wasn't the first! Voltaire stated: Why don't we 
know these facts?  
 
The ancient poets have placed the birth of Bacchus in Egypt; he is exposed on 
the Nile and it is from that event that he is named Mises by the first Orpheus, 
which, in Egyptian, signifies "saved from the waters.” He is brought up near a 
mountain of Arabia called Nisa [Nysa], which is believed to be Mount Sinai. It is 
claimed that a goddess ordered him to go and destroy a barbarous nation and 
that he passed through the Red Sea on foot, with a multitude of men, women, 
and children. In another version, the river Orontes suspended its waters right and 
left to let him pass, and the Hydaspes did the same. He commanded the sun to 
stand still; two luminous rays proceeded from his head. He made a fountain of 
wine spout up by striking the ground with his thyrsus, and engraved his laws on 
two tables of marble. He needed only to have afflicted Egypt with ten plagues, to 
be the perfect copy of Moses. 
 
In the hymns of Orpheus, Bacchus had a rod with which he performed miracles, 
and of which he could change into a serpent at his pleasure. He passed the Red 
Sea, dry shod, at the head of his army. He divided the waters of the rivers 
Orontes and Hydaspus by the touch of his rod, and passed through them dry-
shod. By the same mighty wand, he drew water from a rock, and wherever they 
marched, the land flowed with wine, milk, and honey.  
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Bacchus was called the "Lawgiver” and it was said of Bacchus, as well as of 
Moses that his laws were written on two tables of stone. Bacchus was 
represented horned, and so was Moses. Bacchus was spotted and rescued from 
a box that floated upon the water, and so was Moses. Bacchus had two mothers, 
one by nature, and one by adoption, so had Moses. Bacchus and his army 
enjoyed the light of the sun at night, Moses and his army, a pillar of fire by night.  
 
Moses being called the Lawgiver, and the laws being written on two tablets of 
stone, were obviously copied from Bacchus, but the idea of his [Moses] receiving 
the commandments from the Lord on a mountain was undoubtedly taken from 
the Persian legend of Zoroaster. 
"In his gentler [Dionysus] aspects he is a lawgiver." 
 
Sources: 
 
§ Suns of God, Acharya S 
§ Christ In Egypt, DM. Murdock 
§ Irish Origins Of Civilization, Tsarion Micheal 
§ Who Was ABRAHAM? Gene D. Matlock, B.A., M.A.  
§ How Almighty God was born, John Kaminski 
§ KNJV Bible 
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COMMUNISM AND MASONRY:  
TWO FRONTS OF THE JEW WORLD ORDER 

 
 
"Gentile masonry blindly serves as a screen for us and our objects, but the plan 
of action of our force, even its very abiding place, remains for the whole people 
an unknown mystery. Who and what is in a position to overthrow an invisible 
force?" [Protocol 4] 
 
"We shall create and multiply free Masonic lodges, absorb into them all who may 
become or who are prominent in public activity, for in these lodges we shall find 
our principle intelligence office and means of influence. The most secret political 
plots will be known to us and will fall under our guiding hands. We know the final 
goal, whereas the goyim have knowledge of nothing." [Protocol 15] 
 
The Jews claim the protocols are a forgery. This is how the Jews lie. When the 
court in Switzerland in the 19th century ruled the protocols as a forgery, it was 
ruling the protocols as a legitimate document, hence real, as the document 
presented in the court was a reprint, hence a forged of the original document. 
Just as to forge a check, you need an original to create the copy from. They told 
half a truth in order to tell a full lie. The Court ruling was the protocols are real. 
 
As we can witness, President Washington knew about the Illuminati and that they 
where trying to infiltrate the Masonic orders and movements, and that their 
doctrine was the enemy of the Masonic one the Founding Fathers had fought to 
build America upon: 
 
Library of Congress link: 
The George Washington Papers at the Library of Congress, 1741-1799 
Type "Illuminati" 
 
Mount Vernon, October 24, 1798. 
Revd Sir, I have your favor of the 17th instant before me; and my only motive to 
trouble you with the receipt of this letter, is to explain, and correct a mistake, 
which I perceive the hurry in which I am obliged often to write letters, has led you 
into. 
 
It was not my intention to doubt that, the Doctrines of the Illuminati, and principles 
of Jacobinism had not spread in the United States. On the contrary, no one is 
more truly satisfied of this fact than I am. 
 
The idea that I meant to convey was, that I did not believe that the Lodges of 
Freemasons in this Country had, as societies, endeavored to propagate the 
diabolical tenets of the first, or pernicious principles of the latter [if they are 
susceptible of separation]; that Individuals of them may have done it, or that the 
founder, or instrument employed to found, the Democratic Societies in the United 
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States, may have had these objects; and actually had a separation of the People 
from their Government in view, is too evident to be questioned. 
My occupations are such, that but little leisure is allowed me to read newspapers, 
or books of any kind; the reading of letters, and preparing answers, absorb much 
of my time." 
 
President Washington was the highest-ranking Mason in America. The original 
Freemason religion and idealism of which the American Republic was built upon. 
can be read here: 
 
The Real American Revolution topic 585.html 
 
“In 1785, leading members of the Illuminati left the Society and testified before a 
Court of Inquiry called by the Elector of Bavaria. Their startling evidence removed 
all doubt regarding the Illuminati. On the 11th of October, 1785, the Bavarian 
authorities raided Zwack's [Illuminati cofounder] house and discovered a 
mountainous array of Illuminati documents which showed quite clearly that they 
planned to bring about a "universal revolution that should deal the death-blow to 
society.” 
 
Communism start was not founded in the 19th century; it was founded in the 18th 
century. When as History records that on May 1, 1776, [May Day is a Communist 
holiday as well] Dr. Adam Weishaupt founded the Bavarian Order of the 
ILLUMINATI. Weishaupt was a Professor of Jewish Canon Law at the University 
of Ingolstadt in Bavaria, Germany. He was born to Jewish parents and later 
"converted" to Roman Catholicism. He became a high-ranking member of The 
Order of the Jesuits, whom he subsequently left to form his very own 
organization at the clear behest of the newly formed "House of Rothschild." 
 
Weishaupt took a group of fellow Jewish agents who had organized under the 
name of the “Frankist,” and from them into the newly termed order, the 
“Illuminati.” The doctrine of this Jewish front was Communism.  
 
“It is more interesting to learn that Karl Marx was not the real founder of 
Communist world revolution. Its true father was Adam Weishaupt, founder of the 
"Freemasonic Order" of the Illuminati”— Marschalko 
 
The six main points of Weishaupt doctrine is the abolition of:  
 1. Ordered or nationalistic governments in the form of monarchies.  
 2. Private property.  
 3. Inheritance rights.  
 4. Patriotism to nationalist causes.  
 5. Social order in families, sexual prohibition laws, and all moral codes.  
 6. All religious disciplines based on faith in a living God, as opposed to faith in 
nature, man, and reason.  
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Weishaupt himself did not enter a lodge until 1777, when he received induction 
into the Lodge Theodore de Bon Conseil in Munich. However, once inside 
Masonry, Weishaupt immediately went to work with Rothschild agents to inject 
the Illuminate doctrine, hand in hand with Judaic occult systems to put the 
Gentiles under the control of the Elders of Zion, while rotting out the original 
Masonic spiritual doctrines and philosophy of universal-spiritual law. Weishaupt 
and his agents organized the Congress of Wilhelmsbad at the Castle of William 
IX of Hesse-Kassel, on July 16, 1782. That special event, which was momentous 
in both size and aspirations, was attended by elite representatives of Masonic 
lodges from all over. In addition, it was there that a decision was reached to allow 
the previously excluded Jews to be granted admittance into Freemasonry.  
 
William IX was in bed with Rothschild from the start and one of his agent dupes: 
“William looked for help in managing his estate. He hired Mayer Amschel 
Rothschild as "Hoffaktor" in 1769, [1] to supervise the operation of his properties 
and tax gathering. The wealth of William's estate provided a good living for 
Rothschild and the men had a strong relationship; he founded the Rothschild 
family dynasty, which became important in financing and banking in Europe. 
Although they had been acquainted since 1775, William IX did not formally 
designate Rothschild as his overseer until 1801.” 
 
The Jews had also been working to influence and corrupt Masonic doctrines and 
infiltrate Masonic Societies for decades by other organizations such as the 
Martinists: 
 
Y Martines de Pasqually: In his book on the Order of the Elus Coens of the 
eighteenth century, R. le Forestier tells us that this Order was founded; 
continuing as Martinists today, about 1760, by Martines de Pasqually, said to be 
a Portuguese Jew. It was one of the most interesting occult groups of the time, 
"which constituted under cover of Freemasonry one of the last links of the long 
chain of mysterious and jealously closed associations whose members claimed 
by magical process to communicate with the divine in order to participate in a 
blessed immortality" Illuminism! The name Cohen, given by Pasqually to his 
members is an adaptation of the Hebrew term Cohanim, which designated the 
highest sacerdotal caste, constituted at Jerusalem, under Solomon, to assure 
divine service in the Temple.” 
 
Its no mistake the Jewish Kabbalah doctrines of Eliphas Levi where some of the 
most disseminated in the 19h century and beyond, in mainstream society, as 
Levi was a Martinist. The Jewish power elites worked relentlessly to replace 
authentic spiritual knowledge with Hebraic systems of corruption. That placed 
Gentiles both consciously and subconsciously under their influence, and was 
designed not to lead to any spiritual power. 
The Jewish agents infiltrated the French Masonic societies and helped to start 
and fund the French Revolution, of which they manipulated the Masonic societies 
into supporting. The original revolution, which created a constitutional Monarchy 
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was taken over by armed force and usurped by the Jacobins who where Jewish 
Frankists [Illuminati’s political front] and the outer political force of the Jewish 
Elders of Zion’s agenda. They then instituted the Terror and slaughtered the 
aristocrats, the middle classes, and peasants. Entire regions and classes where 
murdered. The Jewish directors now in control of the revolution, installed by 
terror, all of the ideological points of the Illuminati manifesto, with the Jewish 
Bankers funding, and directing this via their networks. The French Revolution 
was the first Communist Revolution in history.  
 
Louis Dasté, writing on the subject of Freemasonry in the French Revolution 
states: "This mysterious illumination of the low grades of Masonry, this hierarchy 
of which Philalèthes Junior has so jealously guarded the secret, those 'Unknown 
Superiors' venerated by the Judaising Martinists and Philalèthes, who claim 
domination over ordinary lodges; is not all that the unbreakable chain which links 
the Jewish Cabala to Freemasonry, and have we not henceforth the right to 
suspect the Occult Power hidden behind the Masonic Lodges to be the brain of 
Judaism which would conquer and dominate the entire world?" 
 
In time, it fell apart with a military coup that put Napoleon into power, and that 
ended the terror and restored order, and brought about a more authentic 
Masonic order. In his statements and actions, he refuted the Jewish, Jacobin 
ideology of Communism. 
 
In 1827, Sir Walter Scott publishes his nine-volume set, “The Life of Napoleon” 
and in volume two he states that the French Revolution was planned by the 
Illuminati [Adam Weishaupt] and was financed by the money changers of Europe 
[The Rothschilds].  
 
Napoleon was a Mason most popularly noted by his famous hand in the jacket 
image, which was a common gesture in many paintings and later photographs of 
hundreds of men in the Western World, as it is a sign of degree of the Masonic 
societies.  
 
However, the Masonic Societies had succumbed to the Jewish infiltration in 1811 
in Frankfurt [Frankfurt was the original base of Rothschild operations]. The new 
Frankfurt Lodge was established as now head of European Freemasonry of 
which the founders and leaders to this day are the Jewish Rothschilds and was 
co-founded by the Jew Zvi Hirsch.  
 
The first Communist International was held in Frankfurt in 1847 and was chaired 
by Lionel de Rothschild along with the Jew Karl Marx. At the meeting, a branch of 
the Elders Of Zion's Illuminati, the Jacobin Club, parading as "The League of the 
Just," would become the Communist League of which Marx was a leading 
member. Marx was commissioned by Rothschild to write the Communist 
Manifesto. The Manifesto was published the following year, 1848. The largest 
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support and circulation of the Communist Manifesto was conducted by the 
network of worldwide Freemasonry. 
 
The motto of the League of the Just [Bund der Gerechten] was "All Men are 
Brothers" and its goals were "the establishment of the Kingdom of God on Earth,” 
based on the ideals of love of one's neighbor, equality and justice." This is the 
core doctrine of the Jewish programs, but what does this really mean? The Jews 
tell us themselves and as we see in their actual behavior when in power, which is 
based upon what is written in their Talmud and Torah: 
 
“The nations will gather to pay homage to the people of God: all the fortunes of 
the nations will pass to the Jewish people, and they will march captive behind the 
Jewish people in chains and will prostrate themselves before them, their kings 
will bring up their sons, and their princesses will nurse their children. The Jews 
will command the nations. They will summon peoples whom they do not even 
know will hasten to them. The riches of the sea and the wealth of nations will 
come to the Jews of their own right. "Any people of the Kingdom who will not 
serve Israel will be destroyed"  
—Isidore Loeb [Le Litterature des Pauvres dans la Bible]. 
 
The “Kingdom of God on Earth” is the rule of the Elders of Zion, as they state 
when their Messiah comes each Jew will get 2800 Goyim slaves. 
 
“During the decade of the 1840s, the word "Communist" came into general use to 
describe those who hailed the left wing of the Jacobin Club of the French 
Revolution, as their ideological forefathers. [My note- this is the Illuminati doctrine 
openly]. This political tendency saw itself as the egalitarian heritors of the 1795 
Conspiracy of Equals headed by Gracchus Babeuf. The sans-culottes of Paris, 
which had decades earlier been the base of support for Babeuf — artisans, 
journeymen, and the urban unemployed — was seen as a potential foundation 
for a new social system based upon the modern machine production of the day."  
 
At this point, the Jewish Kabbalah replaced Freemasonry as the spiritual aspect, 
and communism as the philosophical branch; both used for the one end: 
“During the ceremonies of the ritual for the Royal Arch degree, the candidate is 
asked, "Brother Inspector, what are you?" and he replies, "I AM THAT I AM." Can 
you imagine that? When Moses asked God to name Himself, God said, "I AM 
THAT I AM" and He said, "Thus shalt thou say unto the children of Israel, I AM 
hath sent me unto you." [Exodus 3:14] 
 
“I AM THAT I AM” is the name Yahweh gives for itself in the Torah and Judeo 
Christian Bible, the lost word and Masonic God Jubulum, the trinity title of 
Yahweh. 
"Few Candidates may be aware that Hiram, whom they have represented and 
personified, is ideally and precisely the same as Christ, yet such is undoubtedly 
the case. This old philosophy shows what Christ as a glyph means, and how the 
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Christ state results from real initiation, or from the evolution of the human into the 
divine" [Mystic Masonry, p. 248].  
 
Albert Pike tells us who the God of Mason's is: 
"The Apocalypse is, to those who receive the nineteenth degree, the Apothesis of 
that Sublime Faith which aspires to God alone, and despises all the pomps and 
works of Lucifer. LUCIFER, the Light-bearer! Strange and mysterious name to 
give to the Spirit of Darkness! Lucifer, the Son of the Morning! Is it he who bears 
the Light, and with its splendors intolerable blinds feeble, for traditions are full of 
sensual or selfish souls? Doubt it not! Divine Revelations and Inspirations: and 
inspiration is not of one Age, nor of one Creed. Plato and Philo also were 
inspired. The Apocalypse, indeed, is a book as obscure as the Sohar. It is written 
hieroglyphically with numbers and images; and the apostle often appeals to the 
intelligence of the initiated. “Let him who hath knowledge, understand! Let him 
who understands, calculate!” he often says, after an allegory or the mention of a 
number. Saint John, the favorite apostle, and the depositary of all the Secrets of 
the Savior, therefore did not write to be understood by the multitude." 
—Morals and Dogma. 
 
The bold Pike is referring to Christ as Savior who taught in parables for the 
multitude.  
 
2 Peter 1:19: 
"We have also a more sure word of prophecy; whereunto ye do well that ye take 
heed, as unto a light that shineth in a dark place, until the day dawn, and the day 
star [Jesus] arise in your hearts." 
 
Revelation 22:16: 
"I Jesus have sent mine angel to testify unto you these things in the churches. I 
am the root and the offspring of David, and the bright and morning star." 
 
Lucifer is Latin of Morning Star or Venus, which Christ announces himself as in 
the Bible. The Morning Star of Day Star is another noted title of Jesus within the 
Bible. This title was stolen like many things from the Pagan mysteries. 
 
When Mason's state they are Lucifer, they are stating they are Christ like. 
Theosophy, which as Blavatsky stated is an esoteric branch of Christianity 
originates from within the Masonic Societies of the 19th century. Many of 
Blavatsky associates and supporters were high-ranking Masons. Freemasonry is 
esoteric Christianity now. Pike is directly referencing the book of revelations of 
the Bible for his statement. His savior as openly stated is Jesus. 
 
Behold, I lay in Zion a chief cornerstone, elect, precious, and he who believes on 
Him will by no means be put to shame" [1 Peter 2:6, NKJV]. This is Chief 
Cornerstone is what Messiah translates to its talking about Jesus.  
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The Alpha and Omega represents the Chief Cornerstone: 
Revelation 22:12 "And behold, I am [Jesus] coming quickly, and My reward is 
with Me, to give to every one according to his work. I am the Alpha and the 
Omega, the Beginning and the End, the First and the Last." 
 
The Chief Cornerstone of Capstone symbolizes the completion of the Temple of 
Solomon, of which Christianity is a program to manifest. The Jewish Temple of 
Solomon is their Jewish World Order. Pike and others tell us exactly where the 
goals of Freemasonry now exist. 
 
Bible: Book of Jewish Witchcraft: 
topic483.html 
 
The Templars: 
The Templars who practiced the original tradition and from which original 
Freemasonry originated, banned the Jews from joining. The God of their Temple 
Of Solomon was not Christ but John, hence they where called Johannites. This 
has been corrupted by the enemy through.  
 
As I wrote in an article, John of the Templars is Jana [Oana] another title for 
Satan in Sanskrit, meaning "Wisdom," which as Higgins revealed is also Oanes. 
The Greeks spelled John as Ioannes. Higgins also revealed that the title Oannes 
is the source of term gnosis. As is well known by scholars, Oannes is the 
Sumerian EA [Satan]. Oana’s origin is in the Sanskrit Jana Padita [Lord of 
Wisdom], which is the title of our God as Siva in the image of Skanda [whose 
totem is the Peacock and Serpent], the second Siva, which relates to the reborn 
Siva; the reborn soul generated by the Magnum Opus. Jana also relates directly 
to the purifying effects of the kundalini serpent, literally to burn away, to purify. 
With Jana, we have Ana for Anahta, the golden serpent of entity, and An also 
denotes the serpent on its own.  
 
This is why Da Vinci, who was the Grand Master of the Priory of Sion, a Templar 
Branch, painted John the Baptist as Dionysus. Dionysus as many scholars know 
is Siva in the East, and this is why the leaders of the Templar Order all took John 
as their name. 
 
Oannes is also shown holding a cauldron and a pinecone. The cauldron is the 
earliest symbol of the grail from the Pagan world. The pinecone the pineal gland, 
the seat of the soul in which the reborn conscious manifests with the ascent of 
the power, "The head at the center of the earth." 
 
Oannes baptism is that of the water of the kundalini energy in which one 
emerges after being reborn. In ancient Druidic legends the warrior is flung into 
the cauldron and emerges reborn, etc 
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Baphomet itself goes back to the ancient east as well, being the symbolic form of 
Satan as the two-headed Agni, whose vehicle is the goat and ram and whose 
number is 9. The Templar Baphomet was traditionally a double human-headed 
image identical to Janus [not that of the goat as seen in modern times]. 
Baphomet means baptized in Wisdom because wisdom is another name for 
Sophia or Shakti, and Baphoment in the Templar cipher translates to "Sophia." 
The Templar image that is symbolic for the Magnum Opus is Sophia holding the 
sacred books with a ladder in front of her. In the traditional world, the serpent 
was depicted in the hieroglyph of a woman. The word Sophia means serpent 
light in English, in its proper translation. 
 
The Greek [Hellenic after Helos/Hari our God] Mystery schools stated the initiate 
was thrown into a caldron and boiled until the Titanic element is purified out and 
only the Olympian is left. The initiate then emerges reborn from the caldron, a 
perfected being; the title for such being: Shining Serpent. 
 
Gnosis being obtained, with the rise of this power is the symbolic fact that one 
has obtained the state of Oana. As Oannes [Satan] is also symbolic of the 
serpent power and its risen state of consciousness.  
 
360, the degrees of a perfect circle, are equal to 9. The ancient symbol of 
immorality was the golden serpent clutching its tail in a perfect circle, and was 
called Anahat, meaning eternity. This is why the temple of the sun the Templars 
represented was described as being a circle divided into 13 parts, the Magnum 
Opus. The Zodiac wheel of which the 13 constellations represent the macrocosm 
of the soul and the sun's journey thought them represent the 13 steps of the 
perfection of the individual soul. 
 
SOL, OM, and ON are three words for the sun and trinity of the soul and the 
vowels and constants represent the male and female aspects united. Our word 
for soul comes from Sol, as this relates to the spiritual sun. The true Temple of 
SOLOMON is the human being. 
 
This is why the Great Seal of the United States, drafted by the Founders shows a 
Pyramid with 13 levels and 72 blocks, the 13 steps of enlightenment and 72=9, 
the number of completion of the Temple of the Soul, and the number of Agni 
[Satan]. It also shows 13 stars with in the six-pointed star. The six-pointed star 
was stolen by the Jews later on, but is still used as the symbol of the reborn Siva 
today, being the unification of male and female aspects of the soul that form the 
reborn soul, and relates to the real Masonic lost name of God, which is AUM.  
 
The 13 stars represent the 13 major chakra's perfected, six along each side of 
the body, which are the true meaning of the pillars of the arch still shown in the 
East with the reborn God standing between them and under the arch. The six-
pointed star is seven as it represents the six planets on its points with the sun in 
the center. As such, it represents not the heart, but the solar chakra where the 
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eight rayed sun star emits from. The capstone above the Pyramid on the seal is 
in the shape of the triangle that is the symbol of the quintessence of which a 
major number of is 33, with the all-seeing eye within it. That represents Jana in 
the East. AUM is the quintessence, the lost name, the Masonic name of God. 
God is quintessence= AUM, of which the soul if purified and refined into, the 
alchemical first matter, which represents the finishing of the work.  
 
Yoga equals 13 in Sanskrit numerology, which is the proper number of steps in 
the Magnum Opus, the perfection of the 13 major energy centers of which the 
eight-fold wheel or star is a map of.  
 
God equals 26 in the Masonic system and this adds to 8. This symbolic eight is 
represents the unified soul, and it is the same as the six-pointed star. Eight is the 
number of mercury, which perfects the soul and is symbolized as the serpent 
staff, as this energy is the force or cosmic ether or mercury [quintessence]. 
 
"Verse 129 implies that the ultimate [here Siva] is of the nature of Cosmic Space 
[Akasha or Void], and the essence of Jiva lies in the self-same Space in 
microcosmic condition" 
—Tirumantiram 
 
That is why the individual is also called God in the hermetic texts. He is made the 
microcosm of the energy of creation. That is quintessence or Akasha and how 
this energy transmutes one form into another by removing or burning away 
obstacles, the dross. Doing this increases the flow of this creative nature, which 
causes the transformation as the Yoga Sutra's relate. This grants the Magnum 
Opus. 
 
AU represents Siva and Shakti the M is the third power or prana, which unlocks 
the soul to the Godhead. As we will see, the message of AUM being one letter, 
explains why three become one. This is the trinity, the God A, the Goddess U 
and the divine Child M. The Divine child M [prana] is generated via the AU 
energy. This is the six-pointed star in the circle, which represents Vayu or 
mercury [prana] in the East; the Magnum Opus by the union of opposites of the 
soul. The Jews stole this as the symbol of their seal of their corrupted Temple of 
Solomon. The AU energy is the meaning of the checkerboard symbol of the 
Templar banner. 
 
The Masonic 33 degrees is the 33 esoteric spinal vertebrae that the kundalini 
energy travels up. 33 is the number of quintessence, the energy of the Magnum 
Opus and the Key Stone in the Arch and the Meru Column of Siva, which 
represents the spinal column.  
 
Another Templar item found was a silver head of Virgo [Sophia] the perfected or 
reborn conscious, a code with this symbol: M and a phase, which means 
perfected life. This M symbol is the symbol of the reborn soul and is seen within 
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Egypt and elsewhere. The Templars carved grave effigies of themselves into the 
rocky hillside of European sites facing east, the rising Sun, because the sun is 
traditionally depicted rising between the center of the twin peaks of the M symbol.  
The Jewish Temple of Solomon faces west, where the Templar one faces east 
for the above reason. 
 
Back to the corrupted Masons who exist to build the Jewish Temple of Solomon, 
the Jew World Order: 
In the 19th level of Scottish Rite Freemasonry, the Initiate receives the degree of 
GRAND PONTIFF. It is during this ritual that the candidate swears an oath of 
secrecy and an oath of total obedience “to any Chapter of this degree to which I 
may belong; and the edicts, laws and mandates of the Grand Consistory of 
Sublime Princes and Commanders of the Royal Secret, as well as those of the 
Supreme council of the 33rd degree." 
 
It is then that the "Thrice Puissant" anoints him with oil on the crown of his head 
and says, "Be Thou a Priest Forever, after the order of Melchizedek." 
 
Melchizedek or Malki Tzedek [/mɛl. ɪz.ə.dɪk/[1]]; [Hebrew: לְכִּי־צֶדֶֿק -malkī מַ
ṣeḏeq] [translated as "my king [is] righteousness]"] was a king and priest 
mentioned during the Abram narrative in the 14th chapter of the Book of 
Genesis. 
 
He is introduced as the king of Salem, and priest of El Elyon ["God most high"]. 
He brings out bread and wine and blesses Abram and El Elyon. [2] Chazalic 
literature, specifically Targum Jonathan, Targum Yerushalmi, and the Babylonian 
Talmud—presents the name [קדצ־יכלמ] as a nickname title for Shem, the son of 
Noah. 
 
In Christianity, according to the Letter to the Hebrews, Jesus Christ is identified 
as a priest forever in the order of Melchizedek, and so Jesus assumes the role of 
High Priest once and for all.- 
 
“After receiving the password [Emanuel] and the sacred word [Alleluia], he is 
dressed in a robe of white linen and given a cordon [a ribbon or sash of honor 
worn across the breast] of crimson color, with 12 stars representing "the 12 gates 
of the "new city, " and the twelve signs of the Zodiac, the twelve fruits of the tree 
of life, the twelve tribes of Israel and the twelve Apostles."  
—[Scottish Rite Masonry Illustrated, The Complete Ritual, Vol. 2, pages 26-27, 
E. Cook Publications, 1974] 
 
Emanuel deriving from [Hebrew: לאונמע, meaning God is with us], a prophetic 
name used in Isaiah 7:14. The middle letter "m" is doubled in Hebrew causing 
that single "m" and double "mm" variants co-exist in many languages. 
The word "Alleluia" or "Hallelujah" [from Hebrew הי וללה], literally means "Praise 
ye Yah" or "Praise Jah, you people",[1][2] is used in different ways in Christian 
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liturgies. "Praise Jah" is a short form of "Praise Yahweh",[3][4][5] or of "praise ye 
Jehovah".- 
 
In the spelling "Alleluia", the term is used also to refer to a liturgical chant in 
which that word is combined with verses of Scripture, usually from the Psalms. 
This chant is commonly used before the proclamation of the Gospel. 
 
The name is common to both Jewish and Christian naming traditions, interpreted 
in Judaism without messianic significance, but by Christians in the light of the 
Gospel of Matthew 1:23 as relating to Jesus: 
“In the seventeenth degree, or Knights of the East and West, after the candidates 
have completed the initiation and after revealing the password [Jubulum] and the 
Sacred Word [Abaddon], "the Senior Warden conducts the Candidate to the 
elevated vacant canopy at the right of the All Puissant." 
—Scottish Rite Masonry Illustrated, The Complete Ritual, Vol. 1, Pages 453, 457, 
E. Cook Publishing, 1974] 
Jubulum is a title of Yahweh and Abaddon is another Hebrew title used in the 
Bible. 
 
"It is in this final "Blue Lodge" degree that candidate is laid out "in death” and is 
raised from the dead by the "Worshipful Master" of the Lodge [representing King 
Solomon], using the "strong grip" or "Lion's Paw" of the Master Mason. 
 
On the "five points of fellowship," he and his "savior" pass the sacred word, Mah-
Hah-Bone. [Hebrew term] 
—[Duncan's Rituals, Revised, and Complete, pages 35, 96, 120, 121, E. Cook 
Publications, 1974] 
 
Mah-hah-bone is a Hebrew word and used to substitute for the Masonic 
Yahweh’s name of God Jubulum in the lower degrees. 
The list goes on and on. It is not a mistake the majority of occult texts authored 
by Mason’s or those involved with them are all based upon the Jewish Kabbalah 
one way or another, and Judeo Christian themes. Even the passwords to get into 
many lodges are in Hebrew, and the Judeo Christian bible is placed upon the 
altars of the all the Lodges. This puts the members under the direct and 
subliminal control of the Elders of Zion. 
 
Freemasonry’s purpose is to act as a branch of Judeo Christianity and build the 
Jewish Temple of Solomon, The Jewish World Order. 
The New Zion: Jew World Order: topic483.html 
 
“Masonry is based upon Judaism. Eliminate the teachings of Judaism from the 
Masonic Ritual and what is left? - The Jewish Tribune [New York, Oct 28, 1927]  
 
"In the present nations, Freemasonry is only of benefit to the Jews"  
—Theodore Herzl  
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"We have founded many secret associations, which all work for our purpose, 
under our orders and our direction. One of the many triumphs of our 
Freemasonry is that those Gentiles who become members of our Lodges, should 
never suspect that we are using them to build their own jails, upon whose 
terraces we shall erect the throne of our universal King of the Jews; and should 
never know that we are commanding them to forge the chains of their own 
servility to our future King of the World" 
—Opening speech made at the B'nai B'rith convention in Paris [published in the 
Catholic Gazette, Feb 1936]  
 
"It was during that period that I became interested in freemasonry. In the 
eighteenth century freemasonry became expressive of a militant policy of 
enlightenment, as in the case of the Illuminati, who were the forerunners of the 
revolution.” 
—Leon Trotsky [Jew and high ranking leader of the Communist revolution] My 
Life: The Rise and Fall of a Dictator 
 
One of Trotsky’s close friends and fellow Communist, Christian Rakovsky: 
Christian Rakovsky, born Chaim Rakeover [Jewish name] in 1873, was a high-
ranking Communist: 
“A lifelong collaborator of Leon Trotsky, he was a prominent activist of the 
Second International, involved in politics with the Bulgarian Social Democratic 
Union, Romanian Social Democratic Party, and the Russian Social Democratic 
Labour Party. Rakovsky was expelled at different times from various countries as 
a result of his activities, and, during World War I, became a founding member of 
the Revolutionary Balkan Social Democratic Labor Federation while helping to 
organize the Zimmerwald Conference. Imprisoned by Romanian authorities, he 
made his way to Russia, where he joined the Bolshevik Party after the October 
Revolution, and, as head of the Rumcherod, unsuccessfully attempted to 
generate a Communist revolution in the Kingdom of Romania. Subsequently, he 
was a founding member of the Comintern, served as head of government in the 
Ukrainian SSR, and took part in negotiations at the Genoa Conference.” 
 
Openly stated, the relationship between Jews, Communism, and Freemasons is 
nothing more than a movement to advance World Jewish Government under the 
final step of Communism. His record of this event was kept in the writings titled 
“Red Symphony,” by Dr. J. Landowsky, translated by George Knupffer. 
His statements are such:  
“The real aim is to create all the required prerequisites for the triumph of the 
Communist revolution; this is the obvious aim of Freemasonry; it is clear that all 
this is done under various pretexts; but they always conceal themselves behind 
their well known treble slogan [Liberty, Equality, and Fraternity]. The real secret 
of Masonry is the suicide of Freemasonry as an organization, and the physical 
suicide of every important Mason." 
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"Masons should recall the lesson of the French Revolution. Although "they 
played a colossal revolutionary role; it consumed the majority of Masons," since 
the revolution requires the extermination of the bourgeoisie as a class, [so all 
wealth will be held by the Illuminati in the guise of the State] it follows that 
Freemasons must be liquidated. When this secret is revealed, Rakovsky 
imagines "the expression of stupidity on the face of some Freemason when he 
realizes that he must die at the hands of the revolutionaries. How he screams 
and wants that one should value his services to the revolution! It is a sight at 
which one can die...but of laughter!" Rakovsky refers to Freemasonry as a hoax: 
"a madhouse but at liberty."  
 
“In Russia in 1929, every Mason who was not Jewish was killed along with his 
family, according to Alexey Jefimow  —"Who are the Rulers of Russia?" p.77. 
 
The National Socialist Government of Germany banned all Freemasonic Lodges, 
as they are wings of international Jewry and its Communism. 
 
Sources: 
§ Communism A Jewish Talmudic Concept Know Your Enemy. By Will 

Martin 
§ Wikipedia 
§ Scottish Rite Masonry Illustrated, The Complete Ritual, Vol. 1 
§ Red Symphony, by Dr. J. Landowsky; translated by George Knupffer. 
§ My Life: The Rise and Fall of a Dictator- Leon Trotsky 
§ The Coming Gnostic Civilization by M.A.Pinkham 
§ Duncan's Rituals, Revised and Complet. E. Cook Publications, 1974] 
§ Morals And Dogma: Albert Pike. 
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THE REAL HOLOCAUST: THE JEWISH MURDER MACHINE 
CALLED THE USSR 

 
 
Every day we have our senses assaulted by the Jewish Media Lie Machine’s 
favorite fable of the fictional Holocaust of six million poor Jews by the Germans. 
Despite the fact such lies have already been exposed by numerous experts from 
across the world and even during the landmark trial of Zundel [which did not stop 
him from being put in prison for five years for telling the truth], the Jews continue 
with the wailing of their lies as they are the race of the Big Lie. At this point as 
their holyhoax tales unravel daily, they are left only with state backed terrorism 
aimed at those who tell the truth on the subject, in a desperate bid to use fear to 
silence those brave souls who speak out. The truth does not fear investigation.  
 
Exposing the biggest lie of the 20th Century: 
 
http://www.zundelsite.org/ 
 
http://gblt.webs.com/Real_Holocaust.htm 
 
In this article, the Jewish led slaughtercost of the Gentile People of Eastern 
Europe will be examined. The Jews, zealously driven by their Talmudic psyche, 
systemically murdered over sixty million innocent Gentiles; an entire nation 
genocided from the top down. 
 
FAMOUS [JEW] TROTSKY QUOTE [1917]: 
"We must turn Russia into a desert populated by White Negroes upon whom we 
shall impose a tyranny such as the most terrible Eastern despots never dreamt 
of. The only difference is that this will be a left-wing tyranny, not a right-wing 
tyranny. It will be a red tyranny and not a white one. We mean the word `red' 
literally, because we shall shed such floods of blood as will make all the human 
losses suffered in the capitalist wars pale by comparison. The biggest bankers 
across the ocean will work in the closest possible contact with us. If we win the 
revolution, we shall establish the power of Zionism upon the wreckage of the 
revolution's funeral, and we shall become a power before which the whole world 
will sink to its knees. We shall show what real power is. By means of terror and 
bloodbaths, we shall reduce the Russian intelligentsia to a state of complete 
stupefaction and idiocy and to an animal existence." 
 — From the `Memoirs of Aron Simanovich', quoted in The Nature of Zionism by 
Vladimir Stepin, Moscow, 1993, and translated from Russian into English by 
Clive Lindhurst. 
 
The major event that led to the Communist "Revolution" in the East was the First 
World War. This war was instigated by Jewry for the purpose of toppling the 
remaining remnants of the old Gentile political, social, and economic power 
structures, and creating a chaotic situation that would make the Western world 
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ripe to be seized upon by Jewry, leading into its destruction and enslavement via 
a global Communist take over. In essence, the Hegelian dialect of problem: 
reaction, solution. This war alone killed over sixteen million people. 
 
The official trigger event was the murder of Ferdinand and his wife. The Jewish 
Revolutionary Gavrilo Princip was shown being seized by police moments after 
mortally wounding Archduke Ferdinand and his wife. The assassination of 
Catholic Monarch ~ Crown Prince Franz Ferdinand ~ heir to the Austrian throne, 
was carried out by the Jewish assassin Gavrilo Princip using a Browning pistol 
on June 28, 1914. The Zionist newspaper PEIEWISCHE VORDLE wrote on Jan. 
13, 1919, "The international Jewry... believed it necessary to force Europe into 
the war so that a new Jewish era could begin throughout the world.  
 
Archduke Ferdinand was assassinated by Gavril Princeps at Sarajevo; Austria 
demanded an apology from Serbia, Serbia apologized but Austria inexplicably 
declared war anyway. Max Warburg, Jewish advisor to the Kaiser who also 
helped fund the Jewish Bolshevik Revolution, advised the Kaiser to enter into 
WW1 so Zionists could push for an Israeli state. Both Warburg and Schiff were 
Rothschild agents. Warburg also arranged for Lenin to be transported through 
Germany to Russia in a sealed train to lead the conspirators to their Bolshevik 
triumph.  
 
Three Jewish advisers to Kaiser Wilhelm, Chancellor Bethmann-Hollweg, Max 
Warburg and Albert Ballin, then had the Kaiser declare war, and the other 
nations were involved. Why ? To carry out the Jewish Plan.  
 
On February 8, 1920, Sir Winston Churchill expressed his alarm over world 
developments in an interview published in the Sunday Illustrated Herald, London:  
"From the days of Adam [Spartacus] Weishaupt, to those of Karl Marx to those of 
Trotsky, Bela Kun, Rosa Luxemburg, and Emma Goldman, this worldwide 
conspiracy for the overthrow of civilization and for the reconstruction of society 
on the basis of arrested development, of envious malevolence and impossible 
equality, has been steadily growing.  
 
"There is no need to exaggerate the part played in the creation of Bolshevism 
and in the actual bringing about of the Russian Revolution by these international, 
and for the most part, atheistic Jews. It is certainly a very great one: it probably 
outweighs all others. With the notable exception of Lenin, [my note- it turns out 
Lenin was a Jew], the majority of the leading figures are Jews. Moreover, the 
principal inspiration and driving power comes from the Jewish leaders."  
Churchill referred, of course, to the overthrow of the Gentile State in Russia and 
its replacement by a hateful gang of homicidal maniacs, whose unimaginable 
success was accomplished by the astute financial aid of Jacob Schiff to the 
Jewish revolutionaries, and by Max Warburg in Germany, who, at the crucial 
moment of the revolution in Russia, arranged for Lenin to be transported through 
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Germany to Russia in a sealed train to lead the conspirators to their Bolshevik 
triumph.  
 
Jacob Schiff [Jew] financed the Jewish Bolsheviks who were responsible for 
millions of Gentile deaths and the overthrow of the Russian nation.  
 
A statement of the situation from 1926 from a revised and re-edited version of A 
Sea of Blood: The Truth about Bolshevik Russia, a 12,000-word pamphlet 
originally published in Munich [1926] and authored by a Russian émigré known 
as "Dr Gregor."  
 
1. Introduction 
Nine years have already passed since an indescribable crime against humanity, 
the Bolshevik Revolution of 1917, was systematically begun. Now in its ninth 
year [1926], a government exists which calls itself a worker-and-peasant 
government—but not one true worker or farmer has ever sat on it. For nine 
years, torture has been used in the name of democracy as an official instrument 
of the state, and in the name of socialism millions of upright individuals have 
been murdered, put to death through starvation, or banished from home and 
hearth to every distant part of the globe. 
 
In the name of the proletariat the, Russian people have been subjugated by rank 
foreigners, their speech has been silenced, and their bodies sent—to the cheers 
of the [Jewish] Third International — into mass graves. 
 
An old Russian expression says: "There are never more lies told than before a 
war and after a hunt," and in point of fact, the Great War [WW1] never had a true 
armistice; it never really ended, and the hunt for more human skulls — of course 
only Gentile and Aryan skulls will do — continues in accordance with a sinister 
and systematic plan. And thus the great lie blooms forth, in effect a form of 
worship of the Father of Lies, by that international scum calling itself the 
Bolsheviks. 
 
Mundus vult decipi! — The world wants to be deceived! It believes Soviet lies 
and fairy tales and even participates in this sick comedy, sending delegations of 
well-known people, leftists of course, incapable of understanding the Russian 
language, and sympathetic to boot with the goals of the Third International! 
 [The 3rd International was the third great convention meeting held by ultra-
radical Jews and Marxists in 1919 to coordinate Communist activities worldwide.] 
 
Off these foreign guests go to Soviet Russia to "study" the situation. These 
splendid chaps have no idea what Russia was like before the Bolsheviks, and 
what it could have become without them in the meantime! On the other hand, the 
Soviet Union's new friends show great knowledge and appreciation for our 
Russian caviar and vodka! The caviar is good, the vodka burns like fire going 
down, and in the brain-fog of democratic goodwill, one somehow misses the 
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rivers of blood, the dashed brain fragments, and the slithering clatter of millions 
of slaves' chains. And so internationalist democracy [Jewry] celebrates its rites of 
sacrifice. The Gentile lamb is slaughtered…  
 
2. The systematic destruction of Russia 
The old Russia no longer exists. In its place we have a vast desert: its 
intelligentsia 90% annihilated, its middle class throttled, its working class made 
serfs once again — but this time serfs in state-owned factories, workers who just 
for using the word "strike" can be put up against the wall! As for the farmer, now 
he is a mere beast of burden, a camel in the Soviet-made Sahara, laboring 
without question for his Jewish exploiters and nearly without pay. 
 
For a non-initiate it must be entirely incomprehensible how such a mighty empire, 
seemingly in one night of revolution, could be set aflame at all four corners and 
destroyed. However, in one night it did not happen. 
 
The events of March 1917— Kerensky's middle-class overthrow of the tsar and 
of November 1917, the Bolshevik putsch against Kerensky's government were 
only the visible result of years of patient, mole-like undermining activities by the 
Jewish Internationale: a work which did not begin in the criminal minds of [Jews] 
Marx, Kautsky, and Engels, but instead in an earlier alliance of Jewry with the 
higher grades of world [Jewish infiltrated] Freemasonry.  
 
My note- it is important to understand the Freemason's were infiltrated by the 
Jewish Illuminati in the 18th century and turned into an organ of Global Jewry. 
 
These lofty "idealists" have tortured and killed, in the name of Russia's workers 
and peasants — and according to their very own statistics — the following 
numbers of victims in the first four years of the glorious Russian Revolution:  
 
8,800 Gentile doctors and their aides. Why? Because they represented non-
Jewish middle-class medicine. Now come the officers: 54,650 army and naval 
officers, 10,500 police officers [lieutenant-rank and above] and 48,500 lower-
ranking policemen, and for what reason? Because they were military and police 
officers, and we all know that "militarism" is no longer permissible for any 
nationalistic and Aryan-conscious white people. It is only allowed to Red bandits, 
who call themselves proletarians, to dig the real proletariat a mass grave. 
 
Then there are 260,000 flag-loyal soldiers of the old army, all now executed. 
However, even this statistic is trifling. Now come the intelligentsia: teachers, 
professors, engineers, building contractors, writers and judges — especially 
judges, because these were the most dangerous for a state ruled by convicted 
felons. 
To them let us add lawyers, district attorneys and all the college-educated 
occupations — to reach the number of 361,825 murdered members of our most 
mentally demanding professions. I will not even tarry over our annihilated class of 
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large landowners, consisting of 12,950 persons, and when someone asks me 
how the Russian intelligentsia can bear the Bolshevik yoke, I always answer that 
the Russian intelligentsia is either literally six feet under or in exile, and that the 
tiny remainder left over has suffered such a blood-letting and systematic 
humiliation through the Communist steamroller that they have forfeited every last 
bit of self-esteem and personal honor. 
 
Finally, we come to the modest numbers of workers and peasants executed by 
the worker-and-peasant state. They amount to only 192,350 workers and 
815,000 peasants. All these figures are official statistics published by the Cheka 
[forerunner of the KGB] and printed in easily obtainable Bolshevik newspapers 
during this period when the anti-Communist White Russian forces were fighting 
Trotsky and the Red Army, [1917-1921]. 
 
All these facts can be verified in the complete volumes of information or excerpts 
published in 1922 by the Ministry of Internal Affairs of the Kingdom of Serbia, the 
only country in Europe, which is fighting mercilessly against the disease of 
communism. Even this enormous number of casualties is small compared to the 
mentally ill persons now running around free in Soviet Russia — four million eight 
hundred thousand of them, but this is no surprise. Even the old Russia did not 
have enough sanatoria and hospitals for them. Now the whole country has 
become a madhouse. The murders continue and the blood flows on, albeit only 
Gentile and Aryan blood. 
 
When during the 1922 Famine, 30,000 human beings were dying every day, 
Jewish leader Trotsky made the sarcastic remark: "All the better — look at the 
paperwork that will save us now!" 
 
3. Tsars assassinated by the Jews 
After Nicholas I, his son Alexander II mounted the throne, a true friend of his 
people. In 1861, he abolished serfdom and gave the peasants land. This reform 
happened through the mere arrangement of village communities — an institution 
far closer to true and sincere communism than the capitalistic, tax-exploitative 
system we see in Soviet Russia today. 
 
This same tsar, Alexander II, who in 1864 gave his people a whole new trial 
procedure for their court system, then the fairest and most progressive in Europe, 
underwent seven attempts to assassinate him, until finally, in an eighth attempt 
perpetrated by Goldmann, Liebermann, and Zuckermann [can anyone mistake 
their race?], successfully carried out the wishes of London. [Great Britain was by 
this time in the control of the Jewish bankers of the City of London]. 
 
Alexander II, the great benefactor of his nation, was assassinated on March 1, 
1881, the very day that he was to bestow upon his country a new, constitutional 
form of government. Alexander II was gone. 
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Alexander III now became tsar. With respect to this monarch who preserved 
European peace, we Russians were all convinced that when he died in 1894, he 
had succumbed to a normal illness [in this case an acute kidney infection]. How 
great was afterward our amazement when we learned, on the run, in exile, and 
from Jewish sources — that this tsar too had fallen victim to the criminal minds of 
the tribe of Judah. 
 
The Jew Saltus exults over this fact in his book “The Imperial Orgy”, published in 
New York in 1920. In his foam-mouthed delirium over the successful downfall of 
the Gentile-Aryan world he explains in his book how the Jews, working with the 
Entente powers — England, France, the U.S. and Italy — got rid of the tsars one 
after the other. He further relates that, at the same time as the Russian churches 
were praying for the health of the tsar, he was being cursed in the synagogues. 
 
My note- this is true and was proven in the 1911 case of the ritual murder of 
Andrei Youshchinksy, who was ritually murdered by the local Jewish community 
as part of a ritual, by their own confession to help bring down the Tsar and 
Russia to Jewry: 
http://groups.yahoo.com/group/JoSNewsletter/message/242 
 
"While the murder was proven to have taken place inside the synagogue of a 
local Jewish owned and operated brick factory, the Jury could not determine for 
certain if it was Beiliess who had wielded the implement that punctured Andrei’s 
body over 45 times, killing him, while carefully drawing as much blood as 
possible from Andrei's body in the process. It was stated the puncture wounds to 
the side of the child's head where done specifically for a special part of the ritual 
as a sacrifice, so the Jews could overthrow the Czar." 
 
To the bedside of the sick tsar, his personal physician, Zakharin, was 
summoned. Zakharin, a perfectly good Russian name, and yet — a Jew. When 
he arrived to see the tsar in Livadiya, he had the medicine all ready for him in his 
vest pocket. The kind of medicine is easy to imagine: a one-way ticket into the 
next world. 
After the trusting tsar had swallowed the medication and was rolling in pain on 
his bed, Zakharin bent over-him, according to Saltus, with a diabolical grin on his 
face. The tsar choked out the words "Who are you?" Zakharin's answer: "I am a 
Jew!" And with enormous chutzpah, he then turned to the empress and the tsar's 
ministers and said: "Not to worry, his majesty is only talking in a fever!" 
 Then he bent over the dying man and grinned at him again: "You are breathing 
your last breath—and we have won!" This comes straight from the Jew Saltus in 
his book “The Imperial Orgy.” 
 
4. The murder of millions of Gentiles by the Cheka 
And then the Russian Revolution came. Who were these friends of the common 
people who in the name of freedom, equality, and democracy began annihilating 
the Gentile-Aryan population? Undoubtedly, there were among them some true 



 61 

idealists [useful idiots of Jewry] who really believed that they could use murder 
and manslaughter, along with robbery and theft, to make a happier world and a 
new paradise of equality. The well-known result, however, was a living nightmare 
consisting of hunger, deprivation, despair and an equality only in one's right to be 
murdered by the Jewish-controlled Cheka [forerunner of the KGB]. 
 
The word "Cheka" is not only an acronym in Russian for "Special Commission for 
Fighting Counter-Revolution," but also a Yiddish expression for animal slaughter. 
How fitting this expression! We Gentiles, who are called "goyim" or cattle, are in 
the Jewish view mere animals. Yahweh gave us human faces, however, so as to 
spare the Jews the distress of having servants who looked like animals. 
[Paraphrased] 
 
The first provisional government [after the abdication of Tsar Nicholas II and just 
before the 1917 Bolshevik Revolution] consisted exclusively of [Corrupted] 
Freemasons of Romance-language initiation, from France or Italy, and funded by 
[Jew Rothschild] English money.  
 
The criminality of this "provisional government" knew no bounds, because it did 
the most despicable thing a government could do. It ignored the promises, 
purposes and ideals for which it was put into power, and for which it had 
overthrown the Tsar, head of state. The nine months of this "government" was 
nothing but a gestation period, and horribly pregnant Russia gave birth to the 
miscarriage on October 27, 1917. It can rightly be said that power was lying there 
on the street and the Bolsheviks merely picked it up. To provide a show for the 
friendly democracies abroad, there had to be street battles in Russia. And so the 
prime minister Kerensky, a half-Jew whose real name was Kirbis, meaning 
"pumpkin", deliberately sent a battalion of women and young officer cadets into 
the jaws of a howling and murderous mob, where they were sadistically 
annihilated. Meanwhile Kerensky, dressed in a sailor suit, fled St. Petersburg. 
Just before that, Kerensky had signed, for publicity reasons, an arrest warrant 
against the "traitor Trotsky" [Bronstein]. But when General Polovtsev showed up 
with his Cossacks in Trotsky's apartment to arrest him, there sitting in a plush 
armchair with Trotsky was Kerensky, sipping a liqueur. He took the arrest warrant 
from the astonished general's hand, theatrically tore it up, and sent the general 
on his way — a man who lacked the courage to simply arrest both these scum — 
for in a revolution, the first one to pick up his stick is on top. 
 
In any case, the Russian and foreign publics were to be treated to scenes of 
urban warfare and bloodshed, Aryan blood, of course. 
 
5. [Jew] Lenin, a syphilitic psychopath 
The Mensheviks, or "majority people," wanted a peaceful socialist welfare state 
and limited state ownership of industries as in Sweden. The Bolsheviks, or 
"minority people" [i.e., mostly Jews] wanted a reign of terror and total 
nationalization under Lenin and Trotsky. The Mensheviks made only one 
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condition: that Lenin explain himself with respect to allegations of theft from the 
Party. When the convention began and Lenin was challenged to give an account 
of himself, he stood up, stuck his hands in his pockets and proclaimed that his 
standing was so high in the party that he owed no one any answers. 
 
When Lenin first arrived in Russia from Germany, he was already demented from 
untreated or poorly treated syphilis. With this softening of the brain, a sort of 
gumming of the tissues, he was now fully qualified to pour his criminal fantasies 
into the ears of the foaming mob. 
 
Russia already stood in flames, and the shabby gang of brigands were 
encouraged by Lenin's slogan, "Rob back what they robbed from us!" And so the 
mob hurled themselves upon the meager remains of Russian society. Under the 
joyful croakings of Jewry, Mother Russia was submerged. Truly, truly the 
"international proletariat" can be proud: its leader a [Jew] thief, its prophet a 
syphilitic, its greatest man a mass murderer. Instead of leading mankind into the 
bright light above the clouds, it has jammed humanity down into the sewer, and it 
is no accident that his mausoleum, "Lenin's tomb," looks today like a public 
lavatory. 
 
After the February Revolution of 1917, Nicholas II abdicated his throne and took 
refuge with his family in a house in Yekaterinburg. The Bolsheviks murdered the 
Czar, his wife, his son, his four daughters, his servants, and family doctor in the 
same room on the night of July 17, 1918. It has since been confirmed that Lenin 
ordered the clandestine killings from Moscow.  
 
Veteran British journalist Robert Wilton explains in his cult classic, “The Fall of 
the Romanovs”, how the murder of the Tsar and his family was orchestrated 
entirely by Jews:  
"The whole record of Bolshevism in Russia is indelibly impressed with the stamp 
of an alien invasion. The murder of the Tsar, deliberately planned by the Jew 
Sverdlov, and carried out by the Jews Goloshchekin, Syromolotov, Safarov, 
Voikov, and Yorovsky, is the act not of the Russian people, but of this hostile 
invader." — Robert Wilton, The Fall of the Romanovs, p.148. 
 
6. Trotsky, another killer of Gentiles 
Lenin's great rival was a man who nearly exceeded him in treachery, 
viciousness, and sadistic love of executions: the Jew Laibe Bronstein, who called 
himself Leon Trotsky. This Bronstein-Trotsky character was formerly an ultra-
radical writer of gall-dripping articles for Jewish newspapers, but long before the 
war, he was an agent of the tsarist secret police in Vienna, reporting on Russian 
Jews who had deserted from the Russian armed forces. Trotsky, a full-blooded 
Jew, betrayed his racial brothers to the Russian government for 150 gold crowns 
a month [about $200]. This perhaps tells us all we need to know about him. 
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He moved to St. Petersburg and founded a very bourgeois and capitalist freight-
moving business. Later he got into the business of lopping off heads when it 
became more advantageous to be a Communist. The entire Communist system 
under Soviet Judea is shot through with corrupted values. While pure 
communism is said to promise a community of sharing, the slogan of Russian 
communism seems to be: "What's mine is mine — and what's yours is mine, too!" 
 
FAMOUS TROTSKY QUOTE [1917]: 
"We must turn Russia into a desert populated by white negroes upon whom we 
shall impose a tyranny such as the most terrible Eastern despots never dreamt 
of. The only difference is that this will be a left-wing tyranny, not a right-wing 
tyranny. It will be a red tyranny and not a white one. We mean the word `red' 
literally, because we shall shed such floods of blood as will make all the human 
losses suffered in the capitalist wars pale by comparison. The biggest bankers 
across the ocean will work in the closest possible contact with us. If we win the 
revolution, we shall establish the power of Zionism upon the wreckage of the 
revolution's funeral, and we shall become a power before which the whole world 
will sink to its knees. We shall show what real power is. By means of terror and 
bloodbaths, we shall reduce the Russian intelligentsia to a state of complete 
stupefaction and idiocy and to an animal existence." 
 — From the `Memoirs of Aron Simanovich', quoted in “The Nature of Zionism” by 
Vladimir Stepin, Moscow, 1993, and translated from Russian into English by 
Clive Lindhurst. 
 
7. Fiendish tortures devised by the Jewish Cheka 
An entire shelf of books with both written and photographic documentation has 
been published on this theme. I need mention only “The Blood Intoxication of the 
Bolsheviks” by Nilostonsky, “The Battle Against Bolshevism” by Avalov, “The 
Plague over Russia” by Albert Rosenberg, “Soviet Russia” by Katharina Haug-
Houg, and “The Cheka” by Georg Popov. 
 
[My note- when Adolf Hitler was still a solider in the Germany Army he was in 
one of the units that was brought to deal with the Jewish Communist insurgency 
in Germany. He personally, along with thousands of other German Nationalist 
fighters, saw the remains of innocent Germans murdered the same way by the 
Jewish Bolsheviks in the city].  
 
Hundreds of reports and letters coming back from the East during the war, from 
Axis troops and commanders, mentioned finding the same, the bodies of Gentile 
victims of similar atrocities [killed by the Jewish NKVD] in liberated cities, towns 
and villages. This is what led to the pogroms, as hundreds of outraged Gentiles 
who had suffered for over a decade under the Jewish Red Terror Machine took 
to the streets to find those Jews within their kosher prized communities who had 
been their tormenters and murderers of their friends and family members for 
years. As recent KGB reports also show, the majority of the Russians in the 
liberated Axis territory welcomed and worked with the Axis forces on every level 
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willingly, and thanked them for liberating them from the Jewish terrorism and 
oppression. Over a million also fought as volunteers for the Axis force to help 
liberate the rest of Russia from Communist Jewry. Most were murdered by the 
Jewish Communist occupation state after the war to the sum of millions. Their 
crime was only wanting to be free. 
 
Here now are some of the gruesome tortures devised by the Jewish Cheka for its 
mostly Russian Gentile victims. When the Reds occupied a city, they took 
hostages, such as people wearing ties or workers in their Sunday best. They 
stripped them naked and then bound onto the stomach of the murder victim an 
empty flowerpot into which a ravenous, starving rat was placed. Through the 
small water hole in the base of the flower pot, a red-hot iron rod was pushed to 
torment the rat and make him wild, causing him to try to burrow himself away 
from the rod, and deep into the abdomen of the horrified human victim. 
 
They lined up other victims in military formation, and then ordered the first row to 
place one hand upon a wooden table. A nail was driven through the hand into the 
wood. Then they cut a full circle around the wrist skin, drenched the hand in 
boiling water, and pulled the hand and finger skin right off. This they called 
"making gloves." Interestingly, each torture chamber had its own special torture 
lady, always a Jewess or [Jew] Latvian female, usually with a nickname such as 
"Dora, the glove maker" or "Rosa, the glove lady." 
 
It comes as no surprise to us to learn that the chief justice of a criminal court in 
Moscow was also a Jewess, Anya Glusmann, who was said to love pronouncing 
death sentences above all else, and, according to a fawning newspaper article 
about her, she loves flowers and perfume after a "hard day's work." 
 
There is more, such as placing a man's head on an anvil, then slowly exploding it 
using a huge iron hammer with ever-increasing weights. Those fated to suffer the 
same death the following day were ordered to pick up the brain and bone pieces, 
the nerve tissue and blood, which they witnessed flying around the room. When 
ordered to their work they were told: "You are digging your own grave. You must 
be happy that tomorrow your own kind will be picking up the pieces of your 
cadavers." 
 
People had their eyes gouged out, their tongue severed, and their ears sliced off, 
then they were buried alive, or their abdomen was opened with a knife and the 
first section of their intestines was nailed to a telephone pole. They were then 
forced to run around the pole as their entrails unwound until death came. Officers 
of the Russian navy were steamed to death in their own engine rooms. They 
were chained to cement blocks and hurled off the piers so that their tethered 
corpses, decomposing and rising under the waves, formed hideous, tossing 
forests of the dead. General Viren of Kronstadt had both his arms hacked off and 
was then paraded around the downtown area until it became boring, whereupon 
he was shot. Human beings had burning cigars pushed into their open eyes until 
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they were blind, their entire body being roasted on spits. Heads were squeezed 
slowly to the bursting point with special brain vises. 
 
The German Army discovered a chamber full of these and similar devices, 
including a testicle-cracker, in an underground chamber in Ukraine in 1941. 
Adapted dentist drills were used to drill deep into the brain. They sawed off the 
top of people's skulls and forced others to eat their brains, whereupon the eaters 
then came under the saw and in turn had their own brains eaten. [Paraphrased] 
Entire families were arrested and children tortured before the eyes of their bound 
parents, or the wife was tormented before the eyes of her husband or the 
reverse. 
 
The Bolsheviks drove nails into empty wooden barrels, then jammed human 
beings inside, rolling the barrels around merrily. The White Army found mass 
graves of people buried alive. Victims of live burial usually have dirt in their 
mouth and nostrils from trying to breathe. The writhing bodies of these people 
were found in the most bizarre contortions, and all this in the sweet name of 
freedom and democracy! 
 ________________________________________________________________ 
 
 
Another examination of the situation: An Orgy of Murder, Extreme Torture, and 
Pillage  
The orgy of murder, torture, and pillage, which followed the Jewish triumph in 
Russia, has never been equaled in the history of the world. For more than a 
thousand years, the White Russians, descendants of German settlers in Russia, 
had provided an economic climate in which Russia, the "breadbasket of Europe", 
had prospered. In a few days, this stable civilization vanished, perhaps never to 
return. The fortunate ones were those who recognized the peril in time to flee 
with nothing but the clothes on their backs. Those who dallied or sought to save 
others were shot down in mass executions persisting through the night; the 
constant rattle of machine guns muffled by the roar of truck engines raced at full 
throttle to drown the sound of the shots and the screams of the dying. Had you 
experienced the high standard of living in feudal Russia, perhaps you would have 
a different opinion of this alleged “prosperity.”  
 
The Tsar's exquisite daughters. At first, the girls did not die because of the jewels 
sewn into their corsets. These jewels were for protection but also so that the 
family could have some money for when they fled the country. The shooters were 
horrified at how the girls were able to withstand the bullets. To solve that 
problem, the shooters tried to stab them with bayonets. That failed, too, because 
of the jewels, so then, they were shot in the head at close range. The key word 
here is "hatred." The Jews were free to indulge their most fervent fantasies of 
mass murder of helpless victims. Gentiles were dragged from their beds, tortured 
and killed.  
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Some were actually sliced to pieces, bit by bit, while others were branded with 
hot irons, their eyes poked out to induce unbearable pain. Others were placed in 
boxes with only their heads, hands, and legs sticking out, and then hungry rats 
were placed in the boxes to gnaw upon their bodies. Some were nailed to the 
ceiling by their fingers or by their feet, and left hanging until they died of 
exhaustion.  
 
Yakov [Yankel] Mikhailovich Yurovsky [Jew] is best known as the chief 
executioner of Russia's last emperor, Tsar Nicholas and his family after the 
Russian Revolution of 1917. Others were chained to the floor and hot lead 
poured into their mouths. Many were tied to horses and dragged through the 
streets of the city, while the mob attacked them with rocks and kicked them to 
death. Mothers were taken to the public square and their babies snatched from 
their arms. A Red terrorist would take a baby, hold it by the head, head 
downward, he would toss the baby into the air, while another member of the mob 
rushed forward to catch it on the tip of his bayonet. Pregnant Gentile women 
were chained to trees and their babies cut out of their bodies.  
 
There were many places of public execution in Russia during the days of the 
Revolution, one of which was described by the American Rohrbach Commission, 
[Defender Magazine, October 1933]:  
"The entire cement floor of the execution hall of the Jewish Cheka of Kiev was 
flooded with blood; it formed a level of several inches. It was a horrible mixture of 
blood, brains, and pieces of skull. All the walls were bespattered with blood. 
Pieces of brains and of scalps were sticking to them. A gutter of 25 centimeters 
wide by 25 centimeters deep and about 10 meters long was along its length filled 
to the top with blood.  
 
"Some bodies were disemboweled, others had limbs chopped off, some were 
literally hacked to pieces. Some had their eyes put out, the head, face and neck 
and trunk were covered with deep wounds. Further on, we found a corpse with a 
wedge driven into its chest. Some had no tongues. In a corner we discovered a 
quantity of dismembered arms and legs belonging to no bodies that we could 
locate."  
 
The Jewish Communist Chekists took pleasure in brutally torturing their victims: 
Victims where nailed to trees, had their eyes gouged out, noses cut off, ears 
removed, and tongues removed. There were [Jewish] Chekists who cut open 
their victim's stomach, pulled out a length of small intestine, nailed it to a 
telegraph pole, and with a whip forced the victim to run circles around the pole 
until the whole intestine became unraveled. Eyes of Gentiles victims were poked 
out, their tongues cut off, and they were buried alive. A major Gentile member of 
the Voronezh area was boiled alive in a big pot, after which others of the 
community, revolvers at their heads, were ordered to drink. In Kharkov, people 
were scalped. In Tsaritsyn and Kamyshin peoples’ hands were amputated with a 
saw. In Poltava and Kremchug, the victims were impaled. In Odessa, they were 
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roasted alive in ovens or ripped to pieces. In Kiev, victims were placed in coffins 
with decomposing bodies and buried alive.  
 
On March 13, 1917, Jacob Schiff sent Milyukov, new Minister of Foreign Affairs 
of the Bolshevik Revolutionary Government, and a personal friend of Schiff, a 
telegram reproduced in the New York Times, April 10, 1917:  
"Allow me, as the irreconcilable enemy of the tyrannical autocratic government 
which pitilessly persecuted our co-religionaires [Jews], to congratulate through 
your intermission, the Russian people for what they have so brilliantly 
accomplished, and to wish success to your comrades in government and to 
yourself."  
 
We already know of the glee with which Jacob Schiff and other Jewish bankers 
greeted the news that their co-Jews in Russia were now engaged in the favorite 
Jewish practice of mass murder, but what of American government officials, who 
were well informed by a number of intelligence sources about these atrocities?  
 
The Overman Committee in 1919 published a report of its findings, which are 
pertinent to this subject. Titled, "Bolshevik Propaganda Hearing Before the Sub-
Committee of the Committee on the Judiciary, United States Senate, 65th 
Congress," it records the testimony of Dr. George A. Simons, former 
superintendent of the Methodist Missions in Russia, from which we briefly quote:  
"We were told that hundreds of agitators had followed in the trail of Trotsky-
Bronstein, these men having come over from the lower east side of New York. 
Some of them, when they learned that I was the American pastor in Petrograd, 
stepped up to me and seemed very much pleased that there was somebody who 
could speak English, and their broken English showed that they had not qualified 
as being real Americans.  
 
"A number of these men called on me and were impressed with the strange 
Yiddish element in this thing right from the beginning, and it soon became 
evident that more than half the agitators in the so-called Bolshevik movement 
were Jews. I have a firm conviction that this thing is Yiddish, and that one of its 
bases is found in the east side of New York.  
 
"The latest startling information, given me by someone with good authority, is 
this, that in December, 1918, in the northern community of Petrograd ~ that is 
what they call the section of the Soviet regime under the Presidency of the man 
known as Apfelbaum [Zinoviev] ~ out of 388 members, only 16 happened to be 
real Russians, with the exception of one man, a negro from America who calls 
himself Professor Gordon.  
 
"I was impressed with this, Senator, that shortly after the great revolution of the 
winter of 1917 there were scores of Jews standing on the benches and soap 
boxes, talking until their mouths frothed, and I often remarked to my sister, 'Well, 
what are we coming to anyway. This all looks so Yiddish.’ Up to that time we had 



 68 

very few Jews, because there was, as you know, a restriction against having 
Jews in Petrograd, but after the revolution they swarmed in there and most of the 
agitators were Jews.  
 
"I might mention this, that when the Bolshevik came into power, all over 
Petrograd, we at once had a predominance of Yiddish proclamations, big posters 
and everything in Yiddish. It became very evident that now that was to be one of 
the great languages of Russia; and the real Russians did not take kindly to it."  
 
A widely known French journal, "L'Illustration", of September 14, 1918, 
commented, "When one lives in contact with the functionaries who are serving 
the Bolshevik Government, one feature strikes the attention, which is nearly all of 
them are Jews. I am not at all anti-Semitic, but I must state what strikes the eye: 
everywhere in Petrograd, in Moscow, in provincial districts, in commissariats, in 
district offices, in Smolny, in the Soviets, I have met nothing but Jews and again 
more Jews.' "The more one studies the revolution, the more one is convinced 
that Bolshevism is a Jewish movement which can be explained by the special 
conditions in which the Jewish people were placed in Russia."  
 
Alexander Solzhenitsyn relates that some sixty-six million "real Russians" have 
been murdered since the Bolshevik Revolution at the hands of the Yiddish 
revolutionaries, and now two hundred million citizens of the United States await 
their turn in the abattoirs of the bloodthirsty Jewish terrorists.  
 
Rev. Denis Fahey, in his book, "The Rulers of Russia", exposed the real names 
of many of the Jewish terrorists who operated the Soviet murder machine in 
Russia. Trotsky was Bronstein, Martov was Zederbaum, Zinoviev was 
Apfelbaum, Kamenev was Rosenfeld, Parvus was Helphand, Bohrin was 
Nathanson, and so on.  
 
Many of the White Russians fled towards the Pacific, from Vladivostok to the Port 
of Dairen. The Russian women, who had presided over the most gracious 
palaces known to European civilization, were forced to turn to prostitution to find 
bread for their starving children; while others, finding the degradation unbearable, 
committed suicide, or slowly starved to death. Decades after the Russian 
Revolution, some of the White Russian women could still be found in houses of 
prostitution in Shanghai, Peking, and Tokyo.  
 
The male survivors of the Marxist Terror, many of them highly cultured scholars, 
philosophers, and scientists, found no means of support from their highly 
specialized talents in the harsh Asiatic world of the refugee. One Russian 
General was seen pulling a rickshaw as a coolie in Shanghai for a few days; he 
later hung himself in his barren room.  
 
Those who survived the initial Terror in Russia were fated for an even harsher 
death, a slow agonizing one as a prisoner in a Jewish operated concentration 
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camp. For many years the Jews, through their total control of the media in 
Gentile nations, prevented any word of the horrors of which they perpetrated 
daily upon Gentiles in Soviet Russia from reaching the outside world.  
 
Finally one victim, who had survived a sentence in a concentration camp, 
Alexander Solzhenitsyn, reached safety. In his book, "The Gulag Archipelago", 
he informed an incredulous world that the blood-maddened Jewish terrorists had 
murdered sixty-six million victims in Russia from 1918 to 1957!  
 
Solzhenitsyn cited Cheka Order No.10, issued on Jan. 8, 1921: "To intensify the 
repression of the bourgeoisie." It was this order on which the establishment of the 
terrible Siberian camps, Kolyma and many others were based. Solzhenitsyn also 
brought to the Gentile world the names of the mass murderers who ran these 
camps.  
 
All of them were Jews. Typical was one Lazar Kogan, who watched thousands of 
slave laborers die during his stint as boss of the White Sea Canal construction. 
He would sometimes remark to a new prisoner, "I believe that you personally 
were not guilty of anything, but, as an educated person, you have to understand 
that social prophylaxis was being widely applied."  
 
"Social prophylaxis" was one of the vicious Jewish phrases that they used as 
euphemisms for their massacre of the Gentiles. Their victims, once they were 
consigned to the camps, were no longer considered human, as the Jews 
considered all others to be non-human. They were known simply by the 
nickname of "zeks", slang for "zakluchenny", which means "prisoner" in Russian.  
 
The Jews were given another opportunity to massacre helpless Gentiles during 
the Spanish Civil War [Communist attempted take over of Spain]. Ernest 
Elmhurst states in "World Hoax," p. 157, "Of no less significance was the transfer 
of Soviet Russia's former peace delegate at Geneva ~ the Jew Rosenberg 
[Moses Israelsohn] with his staff of 140 members to the office of Ambassador to 
Spain in August of 1936."  
 
This cadre of highly trained specialists in torture and murder passed over a reign 
of terror, which was largely ignored by the rest of the world, because the 
journalists covering the Spanish War, Ernest Hemingway and many others, were 
themselves sympathetic to the Communists and they sought only to discredit the 
Spanish patriots, the "Fascists" as they contemptuously termed them.  
 
The [Jew] Rosenberg murder teams were called "World Revolutionary Movement 
Purification Squads." Their "purification" consisted mainly of massacres of 
priests, nuns, choirboys and women and children. In Madrid, it was estimated 
that one tenth of the population of Spain was murdered by the Communist Jews 
by 1939. De Fonteriz in "Red Terror in Madrid" tells how Cheka crews organized 
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by Dimitrov and Rosenberg carried out a program of torture and murder so 
obscene that it cannot be repeated or described.  
 
Early in World War II, the Communists delighted in the opportunity to indulge in 
their favorite sport of mass murder. During the first days of the war, 15,000 Polish 
officers, who were the flower of the nation, were captured. They were taken to 
three Jewish operated Communist camps, Starobiesk, Kozielsk, and Ostashkov. 
Only 448 were ever seen alive again. The rest vanished, but not without a trace.  
 
The Kozielsk camp was situated on the grounds of a former Orthodox monastery, 
five miles from the Kozielsk railway station. In this camp, about 5000, were sent 
away in small groups, the process continuing until April 1940. Parfeon Kisselev 
said that in the spring of 1940, prisoners were brought to Katyn Forest in three or 
four buses daily. From his house, he heard shots and shouts. It was rumored that 
10,000 Poles were shot there. When the German Army occupied the area in 
1943, an investigation was begun.  
 
The Final Report of the German Police dated June 10, 1943, states that, "It was 
proven, without exception, that death was caused by a shot in the back of the 
neck. The seven mass graves of murdered Polish officers, which have been 
cleared, covered a relatively small area. From the translation of diaries, of 
memoirs and other notes found with the bodies, it was proved that the officers 
who had been taken prisoner by the Soviet Army in 1939 were sent to various 
camps: Kozielsk, Starobielsk, Ostashkov, Putiviel, Bolotov, Pavlishcev Bor, 
Shepyetovka, Gorodok.  
 
"The majority of those killed in Katyn Forest had been in the Kozielski camp. 
From the end of March, until the first day of May 1940, the prisoners from 
Kozielsk arrived by rail. The exact dates cannot be established. A few short 
intervals apart, a batch left almost every day, and the number of prisoners varied 
between 100 and 300 persons.  
 
"Thence, in the early morning, the prisoners proceeded in special lorries to the 
Katyn Forest. There the officers were immediately shot, thrown into the waiting 
graves, and buried, as may be seen from the evidence of the witness Kisselev, 
who had seen the ditches being prepared. That the shooting took place 
immediately after the arrival of a group of prisoners is proved by witnesses who 
heard shots after every such arrival.  
"There was no accommodation in the forest apart with the rest house, which had 
a limited capacity. From the position of the bodies, it may be assumed that the 
majority were murdered outside the graves. Very many of the dead men had their 
hands tied behind their backs. The evidence of witnesses confirmed that access 
to the forest was forbidden. — Voss, Secretary of the Field Police." Professor 
Butz's Report stated, "Documents found on the victims [identity cards ~ but not 
military passports ~ diaries, letters, postcards, calendars, photographs, drawings, 
etc. gave the names, age, profession, origin and family relations of the victims. 
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Pathetic entries in the diaries testify to the treatment of the victims by the 
[Jewish] NKVD.  
 
"Letters and postcards from relatives in Upper Silesia, in the 'General 
Government' and in the Russian-occupied zone, written, to judge the post office 
stamps, between Autumn 1939, and March or April 1940, clearly point to the time 
of the crime [spring, 1940]."  
 
The Katyn Case came before the Nuremberg tribunal as part of the general trial 
of German "war criminals," the Soviets having claimed this atrocity had been 
committed by the Germans. Although it was on the agenda, the Soviets omitted it 
from the judgment, nor was any Pole allowed to testify about it. Mr. G.F. Hudson 
wrote in the quarterly, "International Affairs," "The unquiet dead of Katyn still walk 
the earth." In subsequent years, a number of Congressmen have sought to 
reopen the case, including Hon. George A. Dondero, Hon. Ray Madden and 
others.  
 
A U.S. Congressional Select Committee, 2 July 1952, reported that "The 
committee unanimously agrees that evidence dealing with the first phase of its 
investigation proves conclusively and irrevocably that the Soviet NKVD [People's 
Commissariat of Internal Affairs] committed the massacre of Polish Army officers 
in the Katyn Forest near Smolensk, Russia, not later than the spring of 1940.  
 
"The committee further concludes that the Soviets had plotted this criminal 
extermination of Poland's intellectual leadership as early as the fall of 1939, 
shortly after Russia's treacherous invasion of the Polish nation's borders. There 
can be no doubt that this massacre was a calculated plot to eliminate all Polish 
leaders who subsequently would have opposed the Soviets' plan for 
communizing Poland."  
 
The end of World War II gave the Communists the opportunity to wreak revenge 
on all who had opposed them during the war. As a result, from two to five million 
victims were massacred by Jewish terrorists in France, Italy, Czechoslovakia, 
and in other countries in which the Communists were allowed by their Allies to 
murder at will all anti-Communists or "Fascists".  
 
The Sunday Oklahoman shed some light on this horror, Jan. 21, 1973: 
"Document tells Allied Part in Deaths of Thousands" "A former White House 
consultant has provided the Sunday Oklahoman with a secret document 
exposing for the first time what appears to be Allied complicity in the deaths of 
thousands of unsuspecting, liberated prisoners of war and displaced persons 
after World War II.  
 
"The document, a 10-page British Army report, is believed to be part of 
voluminous Anglo-American files on the forcible repatriation to the Soviet Union 
of an estimated 2 to 5 million unwilling anti-Communists between 1944 and 1948. 
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The files, codenamed Operation Keelhaul, are still kept under tight security in 
London and Washington as virtually the last major secret of World War II.  
 
"The secret British report summarizes one repatriation operation in Italy in which 
Russian POWs were turned over to the Red Army and almost certain execution 
after being duped by the British into believing they would be given asylum in the 
West. It tells of the agony and the horror experienced by the prisoners." The 
leading criminal in this mass execution of two to five million anti-Communists was 
~ who else ~ our grinning Ike, head of the European sector for the Allied armies, 
or, as you may know him, our former President, [Jew] Eisenhower. The crime of 
Operation Keelhaul was not on the agenda at Nuremberg.  
 
To finance the State of Israel, which was created as a direct result of the Jewish 
victory over the Gentile nations in World War II, Jews, who had committed all the 
atrocities, now imposed enormous "reparations" demands on the conquered 
German people. To date, they have extorted more than thirty-five billion dollars 
from German workers; money which has been collected at the points of 
bayonets, not Jewish bayonets, but the bayonets of the American Army, which 
has been maintained as an occupying force in West Germany for nearly four 
decades, solely to provide military power behind the puppet German 
Government, which has as its primary function, the furnishing of money for the 
parasitic State of Israel.  
 
Some twenty years after World War II, the Jews began to fear that scholars might 
focus on the terrible massacres of women and children during that war by armies 
directed by the Jews. The incineration of thousands of families by mass fire-
bombings of the cities of Cologne, Hamburg, Berlin, Dresden, and other 
European cultural centers; the firestorms which killed many thousands of families 
in Tokyo; as well as the nuclear holocausts unleashed on civilian populations at 
Hiroshima and Nagasaki in the last days of the Japanese War, when the Imperial 
Staff was already suing for peace [the Jews did not want to lose this opportunity 
to test their new Jewish H-Bomb on human targets]; these and their numerous 
other war crimes, began to concern the Jews.  
 
Their guilt was inescapable; it seemed a mere matter of time until their crimes 
would call down retribution upon their heads. To forestall this possibility, the Jews 
began a furious campaign of their own; a highly synchronized and coordinated 
worldwide campaign publicizing their new myth, the "Holocaust", in which six 
million Jews were said to have been exterminated.  
 
Six million Jews were also said to have been gassed. Whether this meant there 
were actually twelve million Jews "killed" no one seems to know. That 
holocausts, or mass murders by fire, occurred during World War II was a matter 
of historical record.  
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There existed photographs of stacks of burned corpses, which had been made in 
Cologne, Hamburg, and Dresden after the mass firebombing of those cities by 
Allied aircraft. The problem the Jews faced was that there had been no 
holocausts of Jewish victims during World War II, nor were there any 
photographs of burned Jewish bodies.  
 
Not to worry ~ the Jews simply appropriated the photographs of the bodies of 
their German victims, which are exhibited today in gruesome "museums" in 
Germany as exhibits of dead Jews. It was a matter of record that the Jews 
actually faired quite well during World War II.  
 
In Germany, incredible sagas of bribery and corruption on the home front had 
secured the mass evacuation of all Jews from German cities just before the fire 
bombings began. When entire German families perished amid scenes of 
unspeakable horror, the Jews were safely ensconced in comfortable quarters in 
such refugee camps as Auschwitz.  
 
The ultimate testimony as to their rescue by being segregated in these remote 
camps, far from the danger of the mass bombing raids, comes from ~ who else ~ 
the Jews themselves. As they never cease to assure us, ~ they "survived."  
 
Although they survived amid scenes of genocide or massacres of non-Jews in 
many countries, they realized several decades later that it was necessary for 
their purposes to claim that they had been "exterminated."  
 
The protection camps in which they had been safely segregated by the Germans 
during World War II now became "death camps." Not only were they death 
camps, but they were camps such as Auschwitz, memorialized in the Atlantic 
Monthly, Sept. 1981, as having "its own soccer stadium, its own library, its own 
photo lab, and its own symphony orchestra."  
 
The same article proudly boasts that "the hospital at Auschwitz grew to 
considerable size, with about twenty doctors and more than three hundred 
nurses." This was a "death camp?" The fact was that there was not a single 
German military field hospital near any combat front as sizeable or as well 
equipped as the hospital at the "death camp" of Auschwitz, yet Auschwitz is 
always cited by the Jews as the place were millions of Jews were "put to death."  
 
The purpose of the large modern hospital has never been satisfactorily 
explained, since the Jews now claim that within hours after arriving at Auschwitz, 
the Jews were hurried to the "gas chambers". This claim might have more validity 
had it not been for one unfortunate oversight by the Jews ~ they did not build the 
gas chambers at Auschwitz until after World War II had ended.  
 
In most forty years after the war, in which "six million Jews were murdered by the 
Nazis", as they claim, there are annual festivals, conventions, and other mass 
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gatherings of many thousands of the "survivors of the death camps". Even more 
peculiar, hardly any of these prosperous, healthy, and well-fed "victims" claimed 
to have been the survivor of only one "death camp."  
 
Nearly all of them claim to have been a prisoner in five or six of the camps, this at 
a time when Germany, fighting a two front war, could not keep its troops supplied 
in the combat areas. The Jews ask us to believe that every few months they 
were transferred from one camp, put on a train and carried hundreds of miles to 
another "death camp" to be killed, and then a few months later, apparently not 
having been killed, they were entrained to yet another "death camp", where they 
remained without being harmed until the end of the war.  
 
The reason for the otherwise inexplicable claims of the Jewish "Survivors" that 
they were in many different "death camps" is revealed by a simple explanation, 
"gelt." The "survivors" regularly receive monthly payments from the conquered 
Germans.  
 

· "Garfinckel" receives a monthly payment in Israel from Germany because 
he was a prisoner in Auschwitz.  

 

· "Rosenfeld" receives a monthly payment from Germany in Israel because 
he was a prisoner in Treblinka.  

 

· "Steinberg" receives a regular monthly payment in Israel from Germany 
because he was a prisoner in Dachau.  

 

· Garfinckel, Steinberg, and Rosenfeld ~ you don't know them? He's the 
same fat, grinning Jew you saw in the news coverage of the Holocaust 
convention.  

 
The Myth of the Holocaust or the "vanished six million Jews" is not solely a 
matter of collecting revenue from defeated enemies. It is also one of the most 
powerful weapons of propaganda in the hands of the Jews in their drive for total 
world power. Today, all officials seeking to continue in office or to seek higher 
office in the United States must make a ritual pledge of eternal and 
unquestioning faith in the Myth of the Holocaust. To question the Myth of the 
Holocaust means a challenge to the Jewish world dictatorship, and must be 
punished at once by the most severe sentence. Thus, the most fantastic 
elaborations on the basic lie of the "six million" appear regularly on American 
religious programs, in educational books, and in the press.  
 
Among the rare public figures who have dared to question the Myth of the 
Holocaust are such individualists as the actor Robert Mitchum, who told an 
Esquire interviewer, in response to a question about "the six million," "So the 
Jews say." "So the Jews say?" shrieked the horrified interviewer. "Yeah," growled 
Mitchum, "so the Jews say."  
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Another actor, Ronald Reagan, while seeking public office, told a Jewish 
audience in California "It might help your cause if you would limit your claims of 
victims to numbers that you could actually prove." A reporter noted, "The 
audience began to hiss like geese, in a rapidly rising cacophony while the 
aspiring politician dashed to the wings, never to reappear in the particular 
auditorium." Whatever Reagan's doubts about "the six million," he has since kept 
them to himself. The Reagan Administration will be remembered for the ultimate 
enshrinement of "the final solution." Two government buildings on the 
Washington Mall have now been given by "our government" to the Jews for a 
"Holocaust Memorial."  
 
The Washington Mall, like the Roman Forum, is the center of American 
aspirations for our Republic, and runs from the White House to the Capital with 
its principal adornment, the magnificent Washington Monument. To the 
consternation of most Americans, the Washington Monument can now be called 
"Jew Alley." Many native Washingtonians have begun to express criticism of this 
amazing development. In the Washington Post, April 25, 1983, William 
Raspberry wrote on the editorial page, "I simply don't understand it." He points 
out that although this is to be an official American monument; neither the 
perpetrators nor the victims were Americans.  
 
He quotes a Harvard University professor as wondering why there shouldn't be a 
Slavery Memorial on the Mall to honor the memory of the slaves, or a Wounded 
Knee Memorial for the Indians. What he doesn't say is that the erection of a 
Jewish Memorial on the Washington Mall is a boast of absolute power, that the 
Jews have achieved absolute power over their goyim slaves in America. We can 
understand that there is a huge memorial to Karl Marx erected in Red Square in 
Moscow. Are we incapable of understanding why a memorial to the Jews was 
erected on the Washington Mall?  
 
Raspberry, who is black, goes on to tweak the big noses of his Jewish 
employers, the Meyer family who own the Washington Post, by saying that "a 
pledge that nothing of this sort will ever be permitted to happen again" worries 
him, because it is happening right now.  
 
He doesn't mention the obvious example, the Rosh Hashanah Massacre of Arab 
women and children in Lebanon, but of course Raspberry fails to understand two 
crucial factors; first, that "it" never happened at all, and second, that the Jews are 
attempting to place the rest of the world on notice that "the Chosen People" are 
sacred, and that no one must ever harm a hair on their heads. It's quite all right to 
massacre all the goyim or non-Jewish cattle, in Cambodia, Vietnam, Africa, or 
Lebanon; as this has nothing to do with the "sacred" presence of the Jew.  
 
"Never Again?" the well-publicized slogan of the Jews which refers to the Myth of 
the Holocaust, should more properly be "Never," meaning that not only did it 
never happen, but that it is all right for the Jews to massacre the gentile cattle 
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whenever it suits their purposes, because the Myth of the Holocaust gives carte 
blanche to the Jews to kill as many gentiles as possible, "The diminution, the 
killing of the Goyim," as old Anselm so lustfully put it, because it is obvious that 
the more gentiles that are killed, the fewer remain alive as a possible threat to the 
Jews.  
 
The Myth of the Holocaust is interpreted by the Jews as giving them permission 
to maintain international murder squads whose assassins routinely carry out 
executions in every country of the world, not only against "enemies of Israel", but 
also against those who are merely suspected of being "potential enemies of 
Israel". It pays to be careful.  
 
In no other country, are the murder squads of the Mossad, the Israeli Intelligence 
Service, given greater freedom than in the United States. Cooperation with the 
Jewish assassins is the first line of business for the CIA, the FBI, and the IRS. 
The Mossad routinely gives these government agencies lists of American 
individuals on its hate lists, who are to be given "special attention". These lists 
comprise more than half of all the IRS "special audits" of American citizens.  
Despite the frenetic cooperation of official American bureaus with the Israeli 
assassins, the favor is rarely returned. The Jews treat the American goyim with 
justifiable contempt, and rarely lose an opportunity to spit in their faces. Our 
Marines soon found this out in Lebanon, when the Israeli soldiers routinely 
threatened them, offensively cut across Marine lines, and shot at them. 
Menachem Begin's political stance at the present time is to maintain a strong 
Israeli military presence in Lebanon, despite President Reagan's frequent 
whining that the Israelis really ought to pull out of that war torn country.  
 
At these requests, the Israelis responded with the assassination of President 
Gemayel, and the Rosh Hashanah Massacre of women and children. The latest 
requests for Israeli withdrawal were met with the "mysterious" explosion, which 
blew up the U.S. Embassy in Beirut, with great loss of life. It is confidently stated 
that this explosion will never be solved. As long as the Jews, Walt Rostow and 
Henry Kissinger [both Zionists] were selling out U.S. interests, things were fine.  
 
Secretary Shultz must wonder when Begin will order him to be murdered, and 
President Reagan and others as well. The Israelis are the most likely suspects in 
the U.S. Embassy explosion. An extremist named Abu Nidal was named in Jack 
Anderson's column, April 25, 1983, Washington Post, that "secret State Dept. 
reports quoted two highly placed intelligence sources’ explanation that the 
explosion was in Israel's interests, as it aided to 'divide and conquer' to disrupt 
the PLO by setting one faction against the other. The sources said Israel had 
secretly provided funds to Abu Nidal's group."  
 
From the outset, the Myth of the Holocaust has had its problems with "the 
numbers game". It has not been easy to sell the story of the "extermination" of an 
entire people, when that people is more numerous, more visible, more 
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prosperous, and more powerful in more countries than at any time during its 
history.  
 
It is even more difficult to sell the story of "survivors of death camps", who 
survived, not one year, but stays of four to six years in "death camps", in which, 
according to the testimony of the "survivors," "everyone was being killed every 
day;" survival, not merely in one "death camp", but tours of five or six camps over 
a period of four to six years. The casualty rate would be higher on a bus tour of 
the Bronx. It took a certain amount of raw courage to fix on the number of those 
"exterminated" at the magic figure of "six million" during a period when the world 
census of Jews showed an increase from ten million to twelve and a half million. 
Even the most hardened Jews shrank from the certain exposure and censure of 
peddling such fantastic lies to the most gullible of the goyim.  
 
Fortunately, they did not have to. If Ronald Reagan expressed some hesitancy at 
accepting the magic figure of six million early in his career, other goyim, notably, 
the great evangelists, showed no such qualms. There is now some rivalry among 
the million dollars a week stooges who jumped on the Golden Bandwagon, but 
there seems to be little doubt that it was not Billy James Hargis, the Bible-
thumper, but Billy Graham, "that nice boy from North Carolina," who first struck 
gold in the Myth of the Holocaust.  
 
Graham soon proved his loyalty to the State of Israel, while Billy James Hargis 
and Rev. Carl McIntire huffed and puffed in his well-tailored rear. In recent years, 
they have been surpassed by two even smoother peddlers of "fundamentalist 
Christianity," Jerry Falwell and Pat Robertson. Each day these servile shabez goi 
pay homage to the Myth of the Six Million, urging their bewitched television 
audience to send more money to them, and of course, to Israel. 
 
Sources cited in the article.  
Related articles: 
 
§ Adolf Hitler Man Of Peace: topic318.html 
§ The New Zion: topic173.html 
§ The Jewish Communizing of America: post253.html?hilit=bankster#p253 
§ Jewish Banksters War On America: topic109.html 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 78 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 79 

JEWISH RITUAL MURDER 
 
 
By means of the press [Jewish control] and by their great wealth, the Jews are 
able to stifle any impartial investigation into ritual murder.  
—Thomas Burbage 1916  
 
"Alilath Seker" a slush found in today terms, provided bribe money and expenses 
[for Jews] to combat blood accusations.  
—Dr Philip Devier, "Blood Ritual"  
 
"A secret fund, the Alilath Seker [fund for bloody calumnies] set up by the Council 
of the Four Nations, served chiefly for this purpose." Leon Poliakov "History of 
Anti-Semitism" cited by Dr Harrel Rhome.  
 
If you want to learn and understand why the Jews can commit such insane 
crimes as ritual murder, you must know the secret Jewish teachings. You must 
know the teachings of the Torah, the Talmud, and the Schulchan Aruch. These 
laws and teachings are proof that the Jews feel themselves superior to all 
nations, that it has declared war on all other races, and that it is the sworn enemy 
of the whole of non-Jewish humanity."  
 
Even Tacitus, the Roman historian wrote:  
"The Jews are a race that hates the gods and mankind. Their laws are in 
opposition to those of all mortals. They despise what is to us holy. Their laws 
condone them in committing acts which horrify us." [Historian V.3-8]  
 
The Jew knows that when the non-Jewish world knows his laws and sees 
through his plans, that he is lost. Therefore, by threat of death, he forbids their 
translation and publication. A well-known Jewish scholar [Dibre David] writes:  
 
"If the Gentiles knew what we are teaching against them, they would kill us." The 
Jewish secret laws are based on the fundamental principle that states:  
"Only the Jew is human. In contrast, all non-Jews are animals. They are beasts 
in human form. Anything is permitted against them. The Jew may lie to, cheat, 
and steal from them. He may even rape and murder them."  
 
There are hundreds of passages in the Talmud in which the non-Jews are 
described as animals. Some of them are:  
 
§ "The Jews are called human beings, but the non-Jews are not humans. 

They are beasts." [Talmud: Baba Mezia 114b]  
 
§ "The Akum [non-Jew] is like a dog. Yes, the scripture teaches to honor the 

dog more than the non-Jew." [Ereget Raschi Erod. 22 30]  
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§ "Even though God created the non-Jew they are still animals in human 
form. It is not becoming for a Jew to be served by an animal. Therefore he 
will be served by animals in human form." [Midrasch Talpioth p. 255, 
Warsaw 1855]  

 
§ "A pregnant non-Jew is no better than a pregnant animal." [Coschen 

hamischpat]  
 
§ "The souls of non-Jews come from impure spirits and are called pigs."  

 [Jalkut Rubeni gadol 12 b]  
 
§ "Although the non-Jew has the same body structure as the Jew, they 

compare with the Jew like a monkey to a human." [Schene luchoth 
haberith, p. 250 b]  

 
So that the Jew will never forget that he is dealing with animals, he is reminded 
by eating, by death, and even by sexual intercourse constantly. The Talmud 
teaches:  
 
"If you eat with a Gentile, it is the same as eating with a dog." [Tosapoth, 
Jebamoth 94b]  
 
"If a Jew has a non-Jewish servant or maid who dies, one should not express 
sympathy to the Jew. You should tell to the Jew: `God will replace "your loss," 
just as if one of his oxen or asses had died." [Jore dea 377]  
 
"Sexual intercourse between Gentiles is like intercourse between animals." 
[Talmud Sanhedrin 74b]  
 
It is written in the Talmud about the murder of the Gentiles:  
 
§ "It is permitted to take the body and the life of a Gentile." [Sepher ikkarim 

IIIc 25]  
 
§ "It is the law to kill anyone who denies the Torah. The Christians belong to 

the denying ones of the Torah." [Coschen hamischpat 425 Hagah 425. 5]  
 
§ "Every Jew, who spills the blood of the godless [non-Jews], is doing the 

same as making a sacrifice to God." [Talmud: Bammidber raba c 21 & 
Jalkut 772]  

 
These laws of the Talmud and the Torah were given to the Jews over 3000 years 
ago. They are just as valid today as they were back then. This is how the Jews 
are taught from childhood. The result of this stands before us. It is Jewish ritual 
murder.  
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"Further, there is a law concerning the slaughter of foreigners, who are the same 
as beasts. This slaughter is to be carried out in a lawfully valid manner. The ones 
who do not follow the Jewish religious law have to be offered to God as a 
sacrifice. It is to them that Psalm 44:22 refers: `Yea, for thy sake are we killed all 
the day long; we are counted as sheep for the slaughter.'"  
[Thikune Zohar, edition Berdiwetsch 88b]  
 
Dr. Bischoff [the trial of 30th Oct. - 4th Nov. 1931] established the correct 
translation of this law: This translation and publication of the law of human 
sacrifice is the greatest blow that ever struck the Jews in this controversy. THIS 
LAW COMMANDS THE JEWS TO BUTCHER NON-JEWS. THIS IS TO BE 
DONE IN A "LAWFULLY VALID WAY." THIS MEANS THAT THE GENTILES 
ARE TO BE SACRIFICED IN THE SAME WAY AS ANIMALS. THEY ARE TO 
BE SACRIFICED TO THE JEWISH GOD. THEREFORE, WE ARE DEALING 
WITH A LAW THAT DOES NOT ONLY PERMIT THE PRACTICE OF RITUAL 
MURDER, BUT COMMANDS IT!  
 
For one on the long history, see 2000 Years of Jewish Ritual Murder 
http://gblt.webs.com/Jewish_Ritual_Murder.htm 
 
Ritual murder in America:  
In America, such a case came to light in 1955 in Chicago, with the kidnapping 
and murder of five children that year, the time of the major Jewish holiday. The 
bodies of the children show they where murdered in accordance to Jewish 
ritualistic laws. Chicago is also an area of large and powerful Jewish 
communities. The victims where of murder were John and Anton Schuessler, Jr., 
Robert Peterson, Barbara and Patricia Grimes.  
 
The facts of the case reveal:  
They had been kept alive for some time after being abducted. Their dead bodies 
were naked. Ligature marks suggested they had been bound by wrists and were 
held in confinement before being bled by small cuts and puncture wounds. The 
marks on one body matched up with the floor mats of a luxury Packard 
automobile, so the killers where mostly likely upper class.  
 
The two little girls had repeatedly been punctured with a sharp pointed object in 
the upper torso, thighs and buttocks. This may have been part of the blood 
collecting process. The two boys showed signs of having been nailed through the 
hands and feet, along with injuries to the mouth and eyes. Both groups of victims 
revealed enough similar evidence indicating the murders were committed by the 
same group of killers.  
 
Something more revealing:  
One of the wounds to the victims contained an unspecified grain, possibly wheat. 
The Jews are known for using human blood from such rituals for creating wheat-
based meals as Matzo balls soaked in the blood of the victims of such rituals. In 
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the case, it was openly stated in the Chicago Sun-Times: "Religious cult might be 
involved."  
 
Note it only stated "Religious Cult" and nothing more, indicating it could of been 
just about anyone or anything, but how did the Jews react? Immediately after the 
article was released, fleets of trucks were sent out and all the newspapers were 
removed from the stands and literally burned. The Jews, from the writings of 
Crowley, did the same in England when such facts were ever bought to light 
regarding such cases, even going as so far as to buy every copy of every book or 
paper to burn them.  
 
Another recent case of the Jews doing this was when Toafler, the son of the 
Chief Rabbi of Rome and professor of history in Israel, wrote the book "Blood 
Passover," which is a record of the Jewish ritual murders in medieval Italy. 
Toafler's main source of documentation was from the synagogue tracts of the 
time of the murders. The Jewish network combined heaven and earth to ban, 
remove, and burn every copy made.  
 
Now back to the 1955 case, note how the Jews worked to cover it up further: The 
Jewish Sheriff of the County, named Lohman, sent a Jewish deputy, Horowitz, to 
investigate the father of the two of the murdered boys. Lohman did this as away 
to shift blame and be able to put the Gentile family under house arrest, thus 
making it impossible for them to talk to anyone about the case. Then Lohman, 
the Jewish Sheriff quickly ordered another Jew on his force, Gloss to head the 
"investigation."  
 
Two other Gentile detectives on the case Lieutenants Lynch and McMahon 
stated that Cook County investigators "destroyed evidence, threatened 
witnesses, and worked to impede their investigation at every turn."  
 
The father was ordered by the Police into a Sanitarium [even after passing lie 
detector tests], under the control of a Jewish Doctor, Leon Steinfeld, where he 
literally died the same day. The official report was that he died from natural 
causes, being a heart attack. However, it was revealed very shortly thereafter 
that he was murdered by electro-shock treatments, performed on him within very 
hours of after his arrival.  
 
The coroner for Cook County, a Gentile named Doctor Thomas McCarron openly 
called Steinfeld a murderer and liar, after important documents to that fact were 
brought to the District Attorney. Shortly after Dr. McCarron's house was bombed 
and he was ordered to keep silent by the District Attorney. Nothing ever came 
from the faint investigation into the affair. Later Steinfeld, after fleeing the 
Country, was found dead in a hotel room from what appeared to be a suicide. 
The Family of the two murdered boys was then paid One Hundred Thousand 
dollars from the local Jewish community to stay silent. Obviously, this is not the 
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only case in America. Workers once tearing down a synagogue in Manhattan in 
1989 found the human skeleton of a young girl in the basement's coal bin.  
 
Note that every year; thousands of Gentile Children go missing in America, many 
around the time of the major Jewish holidays, such as Passover, where such 
rituals are done. Why are no bodies showing up? A look at the names of the 
owners of many animal processing plants reveals them to be owned by Jews. 
You can put two and two together on this. After all, we are by the Jews' own 
words and deeds, nothing but animals to them.  
 
Good authors and scholars on the subject: Dr. Arnold Leese, Dr. Hellmutt 
Schramm, Dr. Philip DeVier, Dr. Harrell Rhome, Dr. Edward Fields, Attorney and 
Duma Member G.G. Zamyslovsky,  
 
Other disgusting truths on the Jews:  
Rome, Italy – Italian and Russian police, working together, broke up a ring of 
Jewish gangsters who had been involved in the manufacture of child rape and 
snuff pornography.  
 
Three Russian Jews and eight Italian Jews were arrested after police discovered 
they had been kidnapping non-Jewish children between the ages of two and five 
years old from Russian orphanages, raping the children, and then murdering 
them on film. Mostly non-Jewish customers, including 1700 nationwide, 600 in 
Italy, and an unknown number in the United States, paid as much as $20,000 per 
film to watch little children being raped and murdered.  
 
Jewish officials in a major Italian news agency tried to cover the story up, but 
were circumvented by Italian news reporters, who broadcasts scenes from the 
films live at prime time on Italian television to more than 11 million Italian viewers. 
Jewish officials then fired the executives responsible, claiming they were 
spreading "blood libel."  
 
Throughout history, various groups have accused sects of Jews of ritually 
murdering small children. One such account, that of Hugh of Lincoln, led to the 
expulsion of all Jews from Britain in the 13th Century. Such accounts have 
generally been "discounted" but are so wide spread that Jewish organizations 
have developed a name for them — "blood libel."  
 
The American group the ADL was founded to defend a Jew, Leo Frank, accused 
of raping and murdering a five year old girl, Mary Fagan, in his Atlanta pencil 
factory in 1913. The ADL claims he was innocent. A mob lynched him after the 
governor commuted his death sentence to life in prison.  
 
Though AP and Reuters both ran stories on the episode, US media 
conglomerates refused to carry the story on television news, again saying the 
story would prejudice Americans against Jews.  
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Jewish gangsters in Russia have become increasingly linked to traffic in "white 
slaves" and prostitutes through Israel, according to a recent report in the 
Jerusalem Post. Israel turns an official blind eye to forced prostitution, and does 
not punish Israeli citizens who choose to own "sex slaves," as long as the slaves 
are foreign and non-Jews.  
 
According to the Talmudic Encyclopedia: "He who has carnal knowledge of the 
wife of a Gentile is not liable to the death penalty, for it is written: 'thy fellow's 
wife' rather than the alien's wife; and even the precept that a man 'shall cleave 
unto his wife' which is addressed to the Gentiles does not apply to a Jew, just 
there is no matrimony for a heathen; and although a married Gentile woman is 
forbidden to the Gentiles, in any case a Jew is exempted.' This does not imply 
that sexual intercourse between a Jewish man and a Gentile woman is permitted 
- quite the contrary, but the main punishment is inflicted on the Gentile woman; 
she must be executed, even if she was raped by the Jew: 'If a Jew has coitus 
with a Gentile woman, whether she be a child of three or an adult, whether 
married or unmarried, and even if he is a minor aged only nine years and one 
day - because he had willful coitus with her, she must be killed, as is the case 
with a beast, because through her a Jew got into trouble. The Jew, however, 
must be flogged, and if he is a Kohen [member of the priestly tribe], he must 
receive double the number of lashes, because he has committed a double 
offense: a Kohen must not have inter-course with a prostitute, and all Gentile 
women are presumed to be prostitutes.  
—Israel Shahak, Jewish History, Jewish Religion, Pluto Press, London 1994, 
page 87  
 
British Link to 'Snuff' Videos  
 
Jason Burke in London, Amelia Gentleman in Moscow, Philip Willan in Rome 
Observer - Sunday October 1, 2000  
 
Britain is a key link in the largest ever, international investigation into the 
production and supply of pedophile 'snuff' movies - in which children are 
murdered on film - an Observer investigation can reveal. The key suspect in the 
inquiry, a Russian who was arrested last week in Moscow for distribution of 
thousands of sadistic child porn videos and pictures, was traced following the 
seizure of his products from British pedophiles.  
 
Dmitri Vladimirovich Kuznetsov, a 30-year-old former car mechanic in Moscow, 
was identified after British Customs and police traced the origin of violent child 
porn videos found in the UK back to Russia.  
 
Last week Italian police seized 3,000 of Kuznetsov's videos on their way to 
clients in Italy, sparking an international hunt for pedophiles who have bought his 
products. The Italian investigators say the material includes footage of children 
dying during abuse. Prosecutors in Naples are considering charging those who 
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have bought the videos with complicity in murder. They say some may have 
specifically requested films of killings.  
 
British authorities yesterday confirmed that scores of Kuznetsov's videos, 
produced in his small flat in Moscow's rundown Vykhino district, have been found 
in the UK. They are concerned that 'snuff' movies in which children are killed may 
have also been imported.  
 
Around a dozen British men have already been arrested and charged with 
offenses alleged to be connected to the Russian tapes. A second Russian child 
porn ring, which allegedly had a British distributor, was broken up earlier this 
year. The investigation into the importing of violent Russian child porn, which led 
to the identification, and subsequent imprisonment of Kuznetsov started about 15 
months ago after Customs seized material coming into the country. Since then 
there have been dozens of other finds.  
 
'We have seen some very, very nasty stuff involving sadistic abuse of very young 
children, but actual deaths on film takes it a whole step further. That is very 
worrying,' said one senior customs officer this weekend. British pedophiles were 
paying between £50 and £100 for Kuznetsov's tapes, the officer said. Further 
fees were paid for access to a website that features pictures of extremely violent 
abuse. Though two men arrested with Kuznetsov have also been imprisoned by 
Moscow authorities, only one of the three remains behind bars. Dmitri Ivanov 
was sentenced to 11 years for actually participating in the abuse that was being 
filmed. The others were released under an amnesty aimed at clearing Russia's 
overcrowded prisons.  
 
When officers from the Moscow Criminal Investigation Department raided 
Kuznetsov's flat they found two boys in a makeshift studio. They seized a huge 
quantity of films and other pornographic material as well as lists of clients in Italy, 
Germany, America, and Britain.  
 
Last week Italian detectives moved in, following months of inquiries, and arrested 
eight people. The police searched more than 600 homes and say they now have 
evidence against about 500 people. Among the suspects were businessmen, 
public employees and a university student. Several of them were married, with 
children of their own. Hundreds of people are also under investigation in 
Germany.  
 
The Russian videos, which had been ordered over the internet, were intercepted 
when they came into Italy by post, repackaged, and then delivered by undercover 
police officers. They cost between £300 and £4,000, depending on what type of 
film was ordered. Covert film of young children naked or undressing was known 
as a 'SNIPE' video. The most appalling category was code-named 'Necros Pedo' 
in which children were raped and tortured until they died. Police in Russia and 
the UK believe that Kuznetsov and his associates have been in business for 
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more than two years in which time they are believed to have recruited around 
100 boys - aged between 9 and 15 - to be filmed.  
 
'Most of the children were rounded up from railway stations. A lot of them came 
from the suburbs, or surrounding regions and were from deprived, problem 
families,' said Kiril Mazurin, a police spokesman. 'Usually when children like this 
arrive in the capital, they've got no idea where to go and hang around in the 
station. It's very easy to entice this kind of teenager - with a promise of a warm 
bed or a trip to the cinema.' Many were lured away from orphanages. 'Children 
are not locked in,' said Mazurin. 'Anyone can come along and promise them a 
meal at McDonalds. It doesn't take any more than that."  
 
Some children were paid a commission to find other boys willing to be filmed, 
according to reports in the Russian press, for a fee of between 100 and 300 
roubles [£2.50 - £7]. Kuznetsov had given up his job in 1998 to devote himself to 
the lucrative pornography industry. A self-taught computer expert, he was in the 
process of upgrading his equipment to allow him to e-mail videos directly to 
clients when police raided him.  
 
Many customers repeatedly ordered videos from him. The Naples newspaper Il 
Mattino published a transcript of an alleged email exchange between a 
prospective client and the Russian vendors.  
 
"Promise me you're not ripping me off," says the Italian.  
 
"Relax, I can assure you this one really dies," the Russian responds.  
 
"The last time I paid and I didn't get what I wanted."  
 
"What do you want?"  
 
"To see them die."  
 
________________________________________________________________  
 
http://www.whale.to/b/amnesty.html 
 
Friday, May 19 2000 [14 Iyar 5760]  
 
Amnesty: Israel Failing to Deal with White-slave Trade by Dan Izenberg and 
Heidi J. Gleit  
 
JERUSALEM [May 19] - Israel has failed to take adequate measures against 
human rights abuses of women who have been brought here and forced to 
provide sexual services, Amnesty International charged.  
 
"This is so," a special Amnesty report on the trafficking of women from the former 
Soviet Union said, "even though many of them have been subjected to human 
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rights abuses such as enslavement or torture, including rape and other forms of 
sexual abuse, by traffickers, pimps, or others involved in Israel's sex industry."  
Amnesty International also criticized Israel for not providing a procedure to grant 
asylum to women who have been smuggled into the country often on the basis of 
false promises of work having nothing to do with sex.  
 
Fighting the trade in women and bringing foreign women here to work as 
prostitutes is a priority for the Israel Police, but it is a very difficult phenomenon to 
fight, police investigations head Cmdr. Yossi Sedbon said yesterday. One of the 
main problems is that there is not a law against selling women, he explained, 
adding that he is aware of the initiatives to pass such a law and hopes they are 
successful.  
 
Justice Minister Yossi Beilin told Amnesty International representatives yesterday 
that Deputy Attorney-General Yehudit Karp is preparing an amendment to the 
Penal Law, which would address the trafficking phenomenon and provide 
immunity for trafficked women. He predicted that the legislation would be 
presented to the Knesset at its winter session. According to Amnesty 
International, hundreds of women are brought to Israel from the former Soviet 
Union every year. According to Amnesty International, Israel is bound by 
international law and by international covenants that it has signed to stamp out 
the sex trafficking.  
 
Police are arresting suspects on related charges such as kidnapping, pimping, 
raping, and assaulting the women, Sedbon said. The other major problem is that 
the women are scared to file police complaints and testify against the pimps, he 
said. Since most of them are in the country illegally, they are scared to approach 
police. Fear of reprisal by the pimps further paralyzes them. Police try to get 
around this both by promising to protect complainants and by initiating operations 
to collect evidence against and raid brothels, he said.  
 
An additional complication is that prosecutors need the women who complain to 
testify in the court cases against the pimps, which can be months after the initial 
complaint is filed. Since the women are here illegally and there is a chance that 
the pimps will harm them if they are left to their own devices here, they have 
often ended up sitting in jail until the trial is completed. Sedbon said that they 
now try to send the women home and bring them back here for the trial.  
Sedbon declined to comment on the complaints filed against Afula police chief 
Ch.-Supt. Shlomo Marmelstein and Tel Aviv Police Chief Cmdr. Shlomo 
Aharonishky for not acting against the problem, saying he could not comment on 
specific cases.  
 
Sedbon emphasized that the issue is a priority for police and that each police 
district's serious crimes division is dealing with the problem. Statistics police 
released earlier this year show an increase in the number of cases opened 
against pimps: 279 in 1997; 370 in 1998; and 506 in 1999. Sedbon also said that 
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only a minority of the foreign women working here as prostitutes are kidnapped 
and forced into prostitution.  
________________________________________________________________ 
 
Jews are allowed by their God to keep slaves. The modern day Israel takes 
advantage of this divine permission. "Your male and female slaves are to come 
from the nations around you; from them you may buy slaves. You may also buy 
some of the temporary residents living among you and members of their clans 
born in your country, and they will become your property. You can will them to 
your children as inherited property and can make them slaves for life, but you 
must not rule over your fellow Israelites ruthlessly." [Leviticus 25:44-46]  
http://www.ety.com/HRP/jewishstudies/snuffporn.htm  
 
The Jewish Ritual Murder of Andrei "Alilath Seker" a slush found in today terms 
provided bribe money and expenses [for Jews] to combat blood accusations.- Dr 
Philip Devier, "Blood Ritual"  
 
In 1911, Kiev Russia, the most notorious case of ritual murder occurred. The 
body of Andrei Youshchinsky, a child from the local area was found in a cave, 
drained of all his blood, and a local Jew, Beiliess, was charged with the crime. 
Jews from around the world poured the modern equivalent of 115 million dollars 
into concealing the facts of the case and for his defense. After the discovery of 
the body, the police arrested the mother and did not allow her to attend her sons' 
burial. During this time, the family was approached by a local Jewish lawyer who 
attempted to bribe them into silence. Jewish owned newspapers then attempted 
to slander the mother with the false claims that she ran a criminal network that 
killed her son. Once again, the Jew is the master of projection and lies.  
 
Several witnesses including two children of the Chebariak family, who witnessed 
the kidnapping of Andrei by local Jews, where murdered during the case. It was 
also revealed that the local head of the Police had planted false evidence to get 
Beiliess off the hook for the murder. The children who had been with Andrei at 
the time of the abduction and who were witnesses, were all given pieces of cake 
by the investigator. All three became severally ill the next day and two died, one 
survived after being ill for months, and when she recovered, she testified in the 
court as to what she witnessed: "We started to ride the clay-mixer, and suddenly 
Beiliess and two other Jews ran toward us. We jumped off the clay-mixer and 
tried to run away Andrei and my brother [Zhenya] were caught by Beiliess and 
the other Jews, but my brother freed himself. The Jews then dragged Andrei 
away; my sister [Valentina] also saw this." —Court testimony of Chebariaks' 
daughter.  
 
John Grant, the American Consulate stationed in Odessa Russia at the time, 
reported the findings of the jury. The jury had officially found that "A certain boy, 
Andrei, in Kiev, Russia had been killed by fanatical Jews, and that Jews for 
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occult purposes, had carefully drawn all blood from the dying child and that it was 
instance of Jewish ritualistic murder, and that Beiliess was innocent."  
 
While the murder, which was proven to have taken place inside the synagogue of 
a local Jewish owned and operated brick factory, the Jury could not determine for 
certain if it was Beiliess who had wielded the implement that punctured Andrei 
over 45 times around his body killing him, and drawing as much blood possible 
carefully from Andrei's body in the process. It was stated the puncture marks on 
the side of the child's head where done specifically for a special part of the ritual 
as a sacrifice so the Jews could overthrow the Czar.  
 
Medel Beiliess went free because 6 of the 12 members of the jury could not 
determine if he had murdered the child, [in spite of an eyewitness account from 
Chebariaks' surviving daughter]. He was one of the kidnappers of Andrei along 
with two other Jews, and too many witnesses had been killed along with too 
much evidence being destroyed and covered up before the trial, by the Jews.  
 
In 1917, G.G Zamyslovsky the prosecuting attorney wrote a 525-page book on 
the subject called "The Murder of Andrei Youshchinsky" in which he detailed the 
facts of the case in depth. During the Judeo-Bolshevik revolution, Zamyslovsky 
was given a show trail by the Jewish CHEKA then murdered by them mainly for 
his book on the subject, which revealed all the aspects of the case. His book was 
then classified until 1997, to keep the contents secret. The Jews also "executed" 
the judge of the case and all of the original surviving witnesses.  
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THE JEWISH COMMUNZING OF AMERICA 
 
 
On Communism, from the Jews: 
"Some call it Marxism, I call it Judaism." – Rabbi Stephen Wise [1]  
 
“In this New World Order, the children of Israel will furnish all the leaders without 
encountering opposition. The Governments of the different peoples forming the 
world republic will fall without difficulty into the hands of the Jews. It will then be 
possible for the Jewish rulers to abolish private property everywhere to make use 
of the resources of the state. Thus will the promise of the Talmud be fulfilled, in 
which is said that when the Messianic time has come, the Jews will have all the 
property of the whole world in their hands." 
 
Baruch Levy, Letter to Karl Marx [Mordechai Levi], 'La Revue de Paris', p.574, 
June 1, 1928: 
"The Bolshevist revolution in Russia was the work of Jewish brains, of Jewish 
dissatisfaction, of Jewish planning, whose goal is to create a new order in the 
world. What was performed in so excellent a way in Russia, thanks to Jewish 
brains, and because of Jewish dissatisfaction, and by Jewish planning, shall also, 
through the same Jewish mental and physical forces, become a reality all over 
the world.” —American Hebrew Magazine, Sept 10, 1920 [2] 
 
"Under USSR law active anti-Semites are liable to the death penalty!"  
—Stalin to the Jewish News Agency in America in 1931 [3] 
 
The New York publication, "Jewish Voice," July and August of 1941, page 23, 
states as follows: "Anti-communism is anti-Semitism." Another quote, from the 
publication "Jewish Life," also New York, "Scratch a professional anti-Communist 
and you will find an anti-Semite." [4] 
 
"There is much in the fact of Bolshevism itself, in the fact that so many Jews are 
Bolshevists, in the fact that the ideals of Bolshevism at many points are 
consonant with the finest ideals of Judaism." [5] 
 
March 25 1906, Dr. Nathan read to the meeting a circular addressed to the 
garrison of Odessa, calling upon the soldiers to "rise and crush the traitors who 
are plotting to upset the holy Government of the Czar and substitute for it a 
Jewish empire." 
He concluded with an appeal to the Jewish money powers of the world to arrest 
Russia's career as a borrower. The financiers of the world should call a halt to 
Russia, not only for humanitarian reasons, but for practical reasons. Russia's 
bankruptcy is an established fact, he added." [6] 
 
Gentiles stating the same regarding the Jews admit: 
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In November 1917, Count Ottokar von Czernin, the Foreign Minister of the 
Austro-Hungarian empire wrote: 
"I have during the last few days received reliable information about the 
Bolsheviks. Their leaders, nearly all of them Jews with altogether fantastic ideas, 
and I do not envy the country that is governed by them." [7] 
 
The U.S. ambassador in Russia at the time of the Communist revolution, David 
Rowland Francis wrote a dispatch to Washington on the subject: 
"The Bolshevik leaders here, most of whom are Jews and 90 percent of whom 
are returned exiles, care little for Russia or any other country, but are 
internationalists and they are trying to start a worldwide social revolution." [8] 
 
William Welsh, an American banker who had worked in Russia from July 1916 - 
Sept 1918, stated: 
"It might be well to explain the general fact that most of the Bolshevik leaders are 
Jews, in order to avoid misunderstanding. In Russia it is well known that three-
fourths of the Bolshevik leaders are Jewish." [9] 
 
Jewish Banksters funded the Communist Revolution: 
"In the spring of 1917, Jacob Schiff openly boasted of having been instrumental 
in the overthrowing the Czarist regime by his financial support of the revolution." 
[10] 
 
"The important part played by the wealthy American [Jewish] Banker, Jacob 
Schiff in the events in Russia, though as yet only partially revealed, is no longer a 
secret." [11] 
 
Today it is estimated by Jacob's grandson, John Schiff [Jew], that the old man 
sank about $20,000,000 for the final triumph of Bolshevism in Russia." [12] 
 
"The establishment of a central bank is 90% of communizing a nation." 
—Lenin 
 
It was reported that the Rothschild's were angry with the Russians because the 
Russians were not prepared to allow them to form a central bank within their 
nation. They therefore gathered groups of Jewish spies and sent them into 
Russia to drum up a revolution for the benefit of the common man, which was 
actually a takeover of Russia by a Rothschild controlled Jewish elite. These 
Jewish spies were, in age-old deceptive Jewish tradition, given Russian names, 
for example, Trotsky was a member of the first group, and his original name was 
Bronstein. These groups were sent to areas throughout Russia to incite riots and 
rebellion. 
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The Jewish Post International Edition, week ending January 24th 1991, confirms 
Vladimir Lenin was Jewish. Lenin is also on record as having stated, "The 
establishment of a central bank is 90% of communizing a nation." 
 
These Jewish, Rothschild funded Bolsheviks would go on in the course of history 
to slaughter 60 million Gentiles and Non-Jews in Soviet controlled territories. 
Indeed the author Aleksandr Solzhenitsyn in his work, "Gulag Archipelago, Vol. 
2," affirms that Jews created and administered the organized Soviet 
concentration camp system in which these tens of millions of Non-Jews died. 
 
On page 79 of this book, he even named the administrators of this the greatest 
killing machine in the history of the world. They are Aron Solts, Yakov Rappoport, 
Lazar Kogan, Matvei Berman, Genrikh Yagoda, and Naftaly Frenkel. All six are 
Zionist Jews. In 1970, Solzhenitsyn was awarded the Nobel Peace Prize for 
literature. 
 
The opportunity for manifesting their Zion arrived with the Russian Revolution, 
which was financed by the Jewish bankers. One of their own, the German Jew, 
Karl Marx [Mordechai Levi], had catalyzed the event with the publication of his 
Communist Manifesto." 
 
From Russia with Talmudic hate, list of Major Heads of the Communist 
Revolution in Russia: 
http://www.cephas-library.com/israel/is ... ewish.html 
 
The most detailed description of Jewish influence in the Bolshevik Revolution 
comes from Robert Wilton, the Russian correspondent of The Times. In 1920, he 
published a book in French, Les Derniers Jours des Romanofs, which gave the 
racial background of all the members of the Soviet government. [This does not 
appear in the later English translation, for some odd reason]. After the publication 
of this monumental work, Wilton was ostracized by the press, and he died in 
poverty in 1925.  
He reported that the Central Committee of the Bolshevik Party [ringleaders] was 
made up as follows: [Note – “Lett” means Latvian and sometimes Baltic] 
 
§ Lev Davidovich Bronstein [Trotsky] – Ukrainian Jew 
§ Ovsei-Gershon Aronovich Radomyslovsky Apfelbaum [Zinoviev] – 

Russian Jew 
§ Mikhail Aleksandrovich Luria [Yuri Aleksandrovich Larin] – Ukrainian Jew 
§ Moisei Solomonovich Uritsky – Ukrainian Jew 
§ Moisei Markovich Goldstein [V. Volodarski] – Ukrainian Jew 
§ Rozenfeld [Lev Borisovich Kamenev] – Russian Jew 
§ Pyotr Germogenovich Smidovich – Belarusian Jew 
§ Yakov Mikhailovich Sverdlov [Yankel Movshevich Eiman] – Russian Jew 
§ Ovshey Moiseyevich Nakhamkis [Yuri Mikhailovich Steklov] – Ukrainian 

Jew 
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§ Vladimir Illyich Ulyanov [Lenin] – Russian Jew 
[My note Lenin was a Jew: Lenin's maternal grandfather was a Jew, this ancestry 
of the founder of the Soviet state had been suppressed."—New York Times 
1992]. "He came from a poor Jewish family and was, according to his baptismal 
certificate, the son of Moses Blank, a native of [the western Ukrainian city of] 
Zhitomir," Ulyanova wrote in a 1932 letter to Josef Stalin, who succeeded Lenin 
after his death in 1924. [13] 
 
§ Nikolai Vasilyevich Krylenko – Russian 
§ Anatoly Vasilyevich Lunacharsky – Ukrainian  

 
"The Council of the People's Commissars comprises the following: 
 
§ President: Vladimir Illyich Ulyanov [Lenin] – Russian Jew 
§ Foreign Affairs: Georgy Vasilyevich Chicherin – Russian 
§ Nationalities: Josef Vissarionovich Djugashvili [Stalin] – Georgian Jew  
 

[My note—Stalin, whose real name was Joseph David Djugashvili was Jewish 
himself: 
In the Georgian language, "shvili" means son of, or son, as in Johnson. "Djuga" 
means Jew, therefore, Djugashvili means Jewison; “son of a Jew.” 
Therefore, Joe Stalin's real name, before he changed it, was Joe Jewison. It gets 
better, his name was Joseph David Djugashvili, a typical Jewish name. During 
his revolutionary days, he changed his name to "Kochba," the leader of the Jews 
during one of the anti-Roman uprisings of the Jews. Russians don't change their 
names. Georgians don't change their names. Jews change their names. [14] 
 
§ Agriculture: Prosh Proshyan – Armenian 
§ Economic Council: Mikhail Aleksandrovich Luria [Yuri Aleksandrovich 

Larin] – Ukrainian Jew 
§ Food: Alexander Grigorievich Schlichter – Ukrainian Jew 
§ Army & Navy: Lev Davidovich Bronstein [Trotsky] – Ukrainian Jew 
§ State Control: Lander, Jew 
§ State Lands: Kauffman, Jew 
§ Works: V. Schmidt, Jew 
§ Social Relief: E. Lelina [Knigissen], Jewess 
§ Public Instruction: Lounatcharsky, Russian 
§ Religions: Spitzberg, Jew 
§ Interior: Apfelbaum [Zinovief], Jew 
§ Hygiene: Anvelt, Jew 
§ Finance: Isidore Goukovski, Jew 
§ Press: Volodarski, Jew 
§ Elections: Ouritski, Jew 
§ Justice: I. Steinberg, Jew 
§ Refugees: Fenigstein, Jew 
§ Refugees: [assist.] Savitch, Jew 
§ Refugees: [assist.] Zaslovski, Jew 

 



 95 

"The following is the list of members of the Central Executive Committee: 
 
Achkinazi Imeretian 
Apfelbaum [Zinovief], Jew 
Avanessof [sec.], Armenian 
Babtchinski, Jew 
Bronstein [Trotsky], Jew 
Bruno, Lett 
Bukharin, Russian 
Chklianski, Jew 
Danichevski, Jew 
Dimanstein, Jew 
Encukidze, Georgian 
Erdling, Jew 
Ermann, Jew 
Feldmann, Jew 
Froumkine, Jew 
Gailiss, Jew 
Ganzburg, Jew 
Joffe, Jew 
Kaoul Lett 
Kaprik, Jew 
Karakhane, Karaim [Jew] 
Karkline, Jew 
Knigissen, Jew 
Krassikov Sachs, Jew 
Krylenko, Russian 
Landauer, Jew 
Lander, Jew 
Latsis, Jew 
Levine [Pravdine], Jew 
Linder, Jew 
Lounatcharski, Russian 
Nakhamkes [Steklof], Jew 
Ouritski, Jew 
Peters, Lett 
Peterson, Lett 
Rose, Jew 
Rosenfeldt [Kamenef], Jew 
Rosental, Jew 
Rosine, Jew 
Roudzoutas, Jew 
Sachs, Jew 
Scheikmann, Jew 
Scheinmann, Jew 
Schikolini, Jew 
Sclichter, Jew 
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Skrytnik, Jew 
Smidovitch, Jew 
Sobelson [Radek], Jew 
Sosnovski, Jew 
Souriupa, Ukranian 
Starck, German 
Stoutchka Lett 
Sverdlov [president], Jew 
Tchavtchevadze, Georgian 
Telechkine, Russian 
Teodorovitch, Jew 
Terian, Armenian 
Ulyanov [Lenin], Jew 
Weinberg, Jew 
Wolach, Czech 
 
"The following is the list of members of the Extraordinary Commission of 
Moscow: 
 
Alexandrevitch, Russian 
Antonof, Russian 
Biesenski, Jew 
Blioumkine, Jew 
Chklovski, Jew 
Daybol, Lett 
Delafabre, Jew 
Deylkenen, Lett 
Dzerjinski [president], Pole 
G. Sverdlof, Jew 
Glaperstein, Jew 
I. Model, Jew 
Jacob Goldine, Jew 
Janson, Lett 
Karlson, Lett 
Khaikina, Jewess 
Kheifiss, Jew 
Kniggisen, Jew 
Kronberg, Jew 
Latzis, Lett 
Leontovitch, Jew 
Liebert, Jew 
Peters [vice-president], Lett 
Pines, Jew 
Razmirovitch, Jew 
Rivkine, Jew 
Roskirovitch, Jew 
Routenberg, Jew 
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Sachs, Jew 
Saissoune, Armenian 
Schaumann, Jew 
Schillenkuss, Jew 
Tsitkine, Jew 
Zeistine, Jew 
Vogel, German [My note Vogel is a common Jewish last name: 
http://gblt.webs.com/Jewish_Surnames_UV.htm 
Zakiss, Lett 
 
Now, on to the Frankfurt School and Communism in America. The Frankfurt 
School was founded when it was evident that the overt and open Communist 
Revolution that would sweep Europe and America under the Jewish yoke had 
failed to fully materialize as planned. After a long struggle that began when the 
Bolsheviks, after being outnumbered in government, and losing support from the 
Russian people in the political sphere of the new Russian Democracy, stormed 
the Duma [Russian Parliament] at gun point, in an act of terrorism, sparked the 
Bolshevik Revolution [terror] of which they had won due to massive funding from 
Rothschild's and other Global Jewish banking groups. Much of the East had also 
fallen to the Red banner after a brutal freedom struggle against the Reds that 
lasted longer then the Second World War. The Jew Trotsky's Red Army had 
been stopped in it's invasion of Poland at the battle of Vistula in 1920 [after 
overrunning the Ukrainian Republic], and the attempts to take Germany down via 
open Revolution had failed when the Nationalist Forces crushed them in the 
1919 Spartacus uprising in Berlin [lead by Jewesses Rosa Luxemburg], along 
with the fall of the Soviet in Bavaria lead by Jew Eisner and the fall of the brief 
Communist "Republic" of Jew Bela Kun's in Hungary.  
 
The failure of the armed Communist Revolution in Germany: 
"The Marxists realized their revolution would have to accelerate, since they would 
not win at the polls. In Berlin, the Jews Karl Liebknecht and Rosa Luxemburg 
[Jewess] had amassed 100,000 supporters, two thousand machine guns and 30 
artillery pieces. They invaded Berlin, took over most of the government buildings, 
and declared the Ebery government overthrown by their glorious Communist 
revolution. On 10 January, Noske, and 30,000 ex-soldier volunteers swarmed 
into Berlin. These were highly disciplined men used to carnage and slaughter on 
the front. They brutally broke through and decimated the 200,000 defenders, 
though vastly out-manned and with less equipment. The leaders of the Red 
revolution were shot or bayoneted. The glorious Communist revolution in Berlin 
did not last a week." 
 
"The Free Corps re-took Munich, and were angered that the Russian soldiers 
they had recently defeated were now armed and active against them, yet again. 
After the city had been taken, the Free Corps marched through the town with 
swastika emblems on their helmets. Cheering crowds lined the roads to thank 
their liberators. http://www.adolfthegreat.com/ 
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The Thule Society and Hitler stopped them in Germany. When the Bolsheviks 
realized the revolution of the Workers was not going to happen as hoped and 
believed, they simply went back to the planning table and developed another 
strategy to enact their Globalist scheme. 
 
"Near the end of 1922 the Communist International [Comintern] began to 
consider what the reasons were. With [Jew] Lenin's initiative, a meeting was 
organized at the Marx-Engels Institute in Moscow.” The aim of the meeting was 
to clarify the concept of, and give concrete effect to, a Marxist cultural revolution. 
Amongst those present were Jew Georg Lukacs [a Hungarian aristocrat, son of a 
banker, who had become a Communist during World War I; a good Marxist 
theoretician, he developed the idea of ‘Revolution and Eros' - sexual instinct used 
as an instrument of destruction]. Jew Willi Munzenberg, whose proposed solution 
was to ‘organize the intellectuals and use them to make Western civilization 
stink.’ “Only then, after they have corrupted all of its values and have made life 
impossible, can we impose the dictatorship of the proletariat.’ Ralph de Toledano 
[1916-2007], the conservative author and co-founder of the `National Review' 
stated, “It was a meeting perhaps more harmful to Western civilization than the 
Bolshevik Revolution itself.' " 
 
"Georg Lukacs[Jew] was the son a wealthy Hungarian banker. Lukacs began his 
political life as an agent of the Communist International. His book ‘History and 
Class Consciousness’ gained him recognition as the leading Marxist theorist, 
since Karl Marx. Lukacs believed that for a new Marxist culture to emerge, the 
existing culture must be destroyed. He said, ‘I saw the revolutionary destruction 
of society as the one and only solution to the cultural contradictions of the epoch.’ 
‘Such a worldwide overturn of values cannot take place without the annihilation of 
the old values and the creation of new ones by the revolutionaries." 
 
"This ‘School' [designed to put flesh on their revolutionary programme] began at 
the University of Frankfurt in the Institut für Sozialforschung. To begin with, the 
school and Institute were indistinguishable. In 1923, the Institute was officially 
established, being funded by [Jew] Felix Weil [1898-1975]." 
 
Major points of the Frankfurt School agenda:  
§ The creation of racism offenses. [Making racial awareness illegal as part 

of the Jewish war against the White Race.] 
§ Continual change to create confusion. 
§ The teaching of sex and homosexuality to children. [The aim of which to 

create a huge backlash against sexual freedom in society. Problem, 
reaction, solution. The Jews are the ones who created the taboo against 
Homosexuality via Christianity] 

http://www.exposingchristianity.com/Sexuality.html 
 
§ The undermining of schools' and teachers' authority. [Replacing it with 

Jewish backed ideology]. 
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§ Massive immigration to destroy racial and cultural identity.[Open war on 
the White Nations, many of these non-Whites are then programmed into a 
system of hostile thought against the native Whites, thus making them 
effective Jewish tools against the White Race.] 

§ The promotion of excessive drinking. 
§ An unreliable legal system with bias against victims of crime. 
§ Dependency on the state and/or state benefits.  
§ Control of and the dumbing down of media. 
§ Encouraging the breakdown of the family. 
§ Race mixing. 
§ Destruction of Gentile Cultural Norms 

 
In 1933, when the National Socialist Party came to power in Germany, the 
members of the Frankfurt School fled. Most came to the United States. Note the 
books the Nazi's burned were the works of the Jewish Frankfurt School, such as 
the Jew Freud [more on him later] and others who admit their works were 
designed to act as a cultural poison against the German people. A free people 
have the right to ensure the health of their culture and to defend it against any 
would be poisoner. 
 
Interesting note here regarding what the Jews did following: 
"The members of the Frankfurt School conducted numerous studies on the 
beliefs, attitudes, and values that they believed lay behind the rise of National 
Socialism in Germany. The Frankfurt School's studies combined Marxist analysis 
with Freudian psychoanalysis to form the basis of what became known as 
‘Critical Theory.’ Critical Theory was essentially destructive criticism of the main 
elements of Western culture, the identification of certain factors that allowed the 
German People to rally against the Jewish subversion of their nation and culture 
and throw the Jewish yoke off themselves, so that such elements could be then 
destroyed via subversion and better weaken the host Nations in favor of the 
Jewish parasite.” 
"Criticisms were reflected in such works of the Frankfurt School as [Jew] Erich 
Fromm's ‘Escape from Freedom’ [Jew] Wilhelm's Reich's ‘The Mass Psychology 
of Fascism’ and Theodor Adorno's ‘The Authoritarian Personality’." 
 
"’The Authoritarian Personality’, published in 1950, substantially influenced 
American psychologists and social scientists. The book was based upon one 
main idea, that presence in a society." 
 
The premise of this Jewish work was to state that the very elements which make 
a Gentile Nation strong are actually evil and unenlightened, and thus need to be 
removed, as a gate to a higher civilization. Don't you just love how the Jew 
always frames his agenda as everyone's agenda and hides its parasitic behavior 
behind bogus humanitarian claims?  
 
"The Authoritarian Personality became a handbook for a national campaign 
against any kind of prejudice or discrimination, on the theory that if these evils 
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were not eradicated, another Holocaust might occur on the American continent. 
This campaign, in turn, provided a basis for Political Correctness. 
 
"Critical Theory incorporated sub-theories which were intended to chip away at 
specific elements of the existing culture, including "matriarchal theory," 
"androgyny theory," "personality theory," "authority theory," "family theory," 
"sexuality theory," "racial theory," "legal theory" and "literary theory." Put into 
practice, these theories were to be used to overthrow the prevailing social order 
and usher in social revolution based on cultural Marxism." 
 
"The Critical Theorists of the Frankfurt School opened the door to the racial and 
sexual antagonisms of the Trotskyites [another faction of Judeo-Bolshevism]. 
Leon Trotsky [Jew] declared that oppressed blacks could be the vanguard of a 
Communist revolution in North America. He denounced white workers who were 
prejudiced against blacks and instructed them to unite with the blacks in 
revolution. Trotsky's ideas were adopted by many of the student leaders of the 
1960s counterculture movement, who attempted to elevate the black 
revolutionaries to positions of leadership in their movement." 
 
The Jews are the ones who brought the Blacks to North America in the first 
place, as they owned and operated the slave trade. This is a fact, recorded in 
many historical works on the subject, such as the "Secret Relationship between 
Blacks and Jews" filled with documentation from mainly Jewish sources that 
admit that not only did the Jews own the slave trade, they were upwards to 75% 
or more of slave owners in the New World, with the rest being a mixture of 
wealthy whites, freed blacks, and Native Americans. 
 
Today the Jewish owned Media and its proxy the school systems, openly blame 
Whites for the crimes that the Jews committed against the Blacks, resulting in 
generating a racial hatred in the Black population towards innocent Whites that 
has led to the deaths of thousands of Whites in racially motivated attacks. This 
culture of anti-White hatred among the Blacks is further encouraged by Jewish 
owned music/media corporations that promote and create anti-White themes in 
popular Black music.  
 
"We must realize that our Party's most powerful weapon is racial tension. By 
propounding into the consciousness of the dark races, that for centuries, they 
have been oppressed by the whites, we can mold them to the program of the 
Communist Party. In America, we will aim for subtle victory. While enflaming the 
Negro minority against the Whites, we will instill in the Whites a guilt complex for 
the exploitation of the Negroes. We will aid the Negroes to rise to prominence in 
every walk of life, in the professions, and in the world of sports and 
entertainment. With this prestige, the Negroes will be able to intermarry with the 
Whites, and begin a process which will deliver America to our cause."  
—A Racial Program for the Twentieth Century, published in 1913 by Israel 
Cohen. 
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Rep. Thomas G. Abernathy read this passage on June 17, 1957, to the 
Congressional Record: 
"The student revolutionaries were also strongly influenced by the ideas of [Jew] 
Herbert Marcuse, another member of the Frankfurt School. Marcuse preached 
the ‘Great Refusal,’ a rejection of all basic Western concepts, sexual liberation, 
and the merits of feminist and black revolutions. His primary thesis was that 
university students, ghetto blacks, the alienated, the asocial, and the Third World 
could take the place of the proletariat in the Communist revolution, in his book, 
An Essay on Liberation." 
 
The famous Jewish front to push such Agenda is the NAACP: 
"Jacob Schiff [Jew and major funder the Communist Revolution in Russia], the 
Rothschild's man in America, decided that the best way to create racial tension 
was to establish leadership among the blacks. In 1909, he laid out plans for the 
National Association for the Advancement of Colored People [NAACP]. It was the 
merging of the Communist-controlled Niagara Movement, a group of blacks led 
by W.E.B. Dubois, and a group of white social activists. In the beginning, the top 
leaders of the NAACP were a group of Jews appointed by Schiff. Their goal was 
to fight segregation and discrimination. They are now the largest black 
organization in the country, with well over 1500 chapters, and about a half-million 
members." 
 
This is the reason for the Jewish created GLBT "rights" groups; the NAACP [see 
above] and the promotion of legions of sundry orgs and lobbies today. The 
growing one is the communization of the illegal aliens in American by Jewish 
agents who send the brightest of the Mestizo's to special Red based schools in 
America, free of charge, to train them to be the next generation of Commissars 
who then go back and communize the hordes of illegals, angry over their poor 
treatment by the Jewish owned Capitalist Transnational mafia corporations in the 
first place. Once again, the Jews lie to them and blame the Whites for their 
suffering, when it fact, the Jews are to blame. There is that Jewish Hegelian 
Dialectic again- problem, reaction, solution. It all culminates with the obtainment 
of a revolutionary force needed to topple Nations and bring about absolute 
Jewish rule under the banner of Communism. 
 
"The aim of our Party in our work among the Negro masses is to create a 
powerful proletarian movement, which will fight and lead the struggle of the 
Negro race against exploitation and oppression in every form. This will be a 
militant part of the revolutionary movement of the entire American working class, 
connecting them with the struggles of national minorities and colonial peoples of 
the entire world and thereby the cause of world revolution and the dictatorship of 
the proletariat." —Communist Party U.S.A 1925 
 
South Africa is the foreshadow of what is coming to America, the same as the 
Jews are doing to them via the Jewish arms of the Bolshevik Blacks hordes 
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[multi-culti "love"] and Judeo-Christian "love" what is already on our shores here 
now. Detroit anyone? ”Critical Theory; and a linguistic rebellion that would 
amount to a methodical reversal of meaning. As for racial conflict, [Jew] Marcuse 
wrote that white men are guilty and that blacks are the most natural force of 
rebellion." 
This is an admission that the culture of White Guilt today, is a Jewish created 
psychological weapon against the White populace to deceive them into going 
along with their own destruction and enslavement; to whip the fighting spirit right 
out of them. This is Christianity updated to the crime of being born with the sin of 
White skin. Of which the "oppressed" non-Whites races of the world suffer and 
died for the sins of. Now repent! Screams the Jew via a thousand different 
outlets. 
 
"Communists seek to advance the cause of communism by injecting themselves 
into racial situations and in exploiting them, [1] to intensify the frictions between 
Negroes and Whites to 'prove' that discrimination against the minorities is an 
inherent defect of the capitalistic system, [2] to foster domestic disunity by 
dividing Negroes and Whites into antagonistic, warring factions, [3] to undermine 
and destroy established authority, [4] to incite racial strife and riotous activity, and 
[6] to portray the Communist movement as the 'champion' of social protest and 
the only force capable of ameliorating the conditions of the Negro and the 
oppressed."—J. Edgar Hoover 
 
The most famous of these Jewish agents of the Frankfurt School in America is 
Martin Luther King, who was trained in such a Communist school in Tennessee 
and was a paid agent: 
"King was photographed in 1957 at the Highlander Folk School, a Communist 
training school in Tennessee, with [Jew] Abner Berry who held a post on the 
Central Committee of the Communist Party. The Joint Legislative Committee on 
Un-American Activities reported that his Southern Christian Leadership 
Conference was "substantially under the control of the Communist Party through 
the influence of the Southern Conference Educational Fund and the Communists 
who manage it." King had connections with over 60 Communist front 
organizations. Nine of his closest aides were high-ranking Communist activists 
and one of those later became an aide to Rev. Jesse Jackson. Stanley Levison, 
who had been a King advisor since 1956, had been involved with the Communist 
Party up to 1955 and brought other known Communists onto King's staff." 
 
Karl Prussion, an FBI agent who infiltrated the Communist Party and for five 
years attended meetings in California, testified in 1963:  
 "I further swear and attest that at each and everyone of the aforementioned 
meetings, one Reverend Martin Luther King was always set forth as the 
individual to whom Communists should look and rally around in the Communist 
struggle on many racial issues." 
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Julia Brown, a former Communist, stated:  
 
"We were told to promote Martin Luther King to unite Negroes and also Whites 
behind him. He was taking directions from Communists. I know for a fact the 
Communists would never have promoted him, financed him, and supported him if 
they couldn't trust him. I am certain as I can be that he knew what he was doing." 
 
"Although a 1977 court order sealed the FBI's extensive surveillance records on 
King in the National Archives for 50 years, a book by Sen. Jesse Helms in 1998 
titled ‘The King Holiday and Its Meaning’ stated that Charles D. Brennan, an 
Assistant Director of the FBI who was personally involved in the surveillance, 
characterized his activities as "orgiastic and adulterous escapades" in which he 
could be "bestial in his sexual abuse of women." He also observed that "King 
frequently drank to excess." 
 
King's famous dream speech was in fact written by his Jewish handler, the same 
Jew Levinson who was the head of the America Communist Party in the 1950's, 
and is full of lies and historical perjuries. It is a document that attempts to 
communize the memories of the Leaders and Founders of American named 
within. It's the Jewish big lie in action. 
 
 As Dr. Duke wrote in his book "My Awakening" on the subject: 
 “Stanley Levinson, wrote many of King's speeches, including, some say, the "I 
Have a Dream" speech delivered at the March on Washington.” 
 
King privately declared himself to be a Marxist, and told his inner circle that his 
efforts were a part of the "class struggle." His personal secretary, Bayard Rustin, 
was a Communist. When King had to replace Rustin in 1961, he chose another 
Communist, Jack O'Dell. His main advisor ["handler" would probably be a more 
apt term], as I've mentioned, was Jewish Communist Stanley Levinson, who 
edited and probably wrote a good deal of King's book ‘Stride Toward Freedom’. 
Levinson prepared King's income tax returns, controlled King's fundraising 
activities, and was also in charge of funneling Soviet money to the Communist 
Party, USA. [15] 
 
"In 1925, a dozen blacks were recruited for propaganda training in Russia. That 
same year, the American Negro Labor Congress was established. In 1930, they 
changed their name to the League of Struggle for Negro Rights. They merged 
with the United Negro Congress when it was founded in 1936 in Washington 
D.C. By 1940, Communists made up two-thirds of its membership. In 1947, they 
united with the Civil Rights Congress, a Communist front group." 
Remember King was promoted as an agent of racial integration, thus promotion 
of race mixing and the destruction of both Gentile races, which is part of the 
Jewish Globalist Agenda. Blacks who promoted racial separation were attacked 
by the Jews. 
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"One of the most important contributors to Political Correctness was Betty 
Friedan [Jew]. Through her book ‘The Feminine Mystique’, Friedan became the 
mother of the modern feminist movement in America. Friedan was not a member 
of the Frankfurt School, but she was strongly influenced by it. Her work offers a 
useful case study of the Marxist roots of Political Correctness." 
 
The ancient Jewish tactic of divide and conqueror, pit Gentile women against 
Gentile men, and thus weaken the ability of the host Nation to stand as a unified 
front against the Jewish parasite.  
Matthew 10:34-35 
"Think not that I came to send peace on the earth: I came not to send peace, but 
a sword. For I came to set a man at variance against his father, and the daughter 
against her mother, and the daughter in law against her mother in law"  
 
"Friedan [Jew] devoted nearly an entire chapter of ‘The Feminine Mystique’ to 
[Jew] Abraham Maslow's theory of self-actualization. Maslow was a social 
psychologist, who in his early years did research on female dominance and 
sexuality. Maslow was a friend of [Jew] Herbert Marcuse at Bandeis University 
and had met [Jew] Erich Fromm in 1936. He was very impressed by Fromm's 
Frankfurt School ideology. He wrote an article, ‘The Authoritarian Character 
Structure,’ published in 1944, that reflected the personality theory of Critical 
Theory. Maslow was also impressed with the work of [Jew] Wilhelm Reich, who 
was another Frankfurt School originator of personality theory." 
 
"The significance of the historical roots of Political Correctness cannot be fully 
appreciated unless Betty Friedan's revolution in sex roles is viewed for what it 
really was – a manifestation of the social revolutionary process begun by Karl 
Marx. Friedan's reliance on Abraham Maslow's reflection of Frankfurt School 
ideology is simply one indicator. Other indicators include the correspondence of 
Friedan's revolution in sex roles with Georg Lukacs' annihilation of old values and 
the creation of new ones." 
"Marcuse's [Jew] trans-evaluation of values, but the idea of transforming a 
patriarchy into a matriarchy, which is what a sex-role inversion is designed to do, 
can be connected directed to Friedrich Engel’s book ‘The Origin of the Family, 
Private Property, and the Sate.’ First published in 1884, this book popularized the 
now-accepted feminist belief that deep-rooted discrimination against the 
oppressed female sex was a function of patriarchy." 
 
Open admission "Feminism" is another tentacle of Jewish Communism. 
 
"The belief that matriarchy was the solution to patriarchy flows from Marx's 
comments in ‘The German Ideology,’ published in 1845. In this work, Marx 
advanced the idea that wives and children were the first property of the 
patriarchal male. The Frankfurt School's matriarchal theory [and its near-relation, 
androgyny theory] both originated from these sources." 
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Note, you can see the Jewish hand in Wicca and other New Aged movements 
here, as they preach the same Jewish nonsense mentioned above as a major 
core of their belief, not to mention the blatant Christian themes. 
 
When addressing the general public, advocates of Political Correctness – or 
cultural Marxism, to give it its true name – present their beliefs attractively. It's all 
just a matter of being "sensitive" to other people, they say. They use words such 
as "tolerance" and "diversity," asking, "Why can't we all just get along?" 
 
The Jews have created a climate of thought criminality where it is a crime to be 
"insensitive." This is done to enforce taboos they have created in society, thus 
getting the sheep to police each other, and giving them a way to shut down 
debate on any subject that is a threat to the Jewish Agenda. “Anti-Semite” is a 
more blatant example of this tactic. 
 
"The reality is different. Political Correctness is not at all about "being nice," 
unless one thinks gulags are nice places."  
 
"Political Correctness is Marxism, with all that implies: loss of freedom of 
expression, thought control, inversion of the traditional social order and, 
ultimately, a totalitarian state. If anything, the cultural Marxism created by the 
Frankfurt School is more horrifying than the old economic Marxism that ruined 
Russia. At least the economic Marxists did not exalt sexual perversion and 
attempt to create a matriarchy, as the Frankfurt School and its descendants have 
done." 
 
The Boas wing pseudo science gone wild: 
The Jew Boas was the major paradigm created for the fake science that "PC" 
Social Marxist dogma is build upon. 
 
Dr. Duke in his book in the chapter "Jews, Communism, and Civil Rights" states: 
Franz Boas is the accepted father of the modern egalitarian school of 
anthropology. He was a Jewish immigrant from Germany with little formal training 
in the anthropological field, having his doctoral thesis on the color of water. Boas 
introduced what he called "cultural anthropology" to the discipline. Until his 
arrival, anthropology fell in the realm of physical science. Boas effectively divided 
anthropology into the separate disciplines of cultural and physical anthropology. 
 
Early physical anthropologists were truly race scientists because they studied 
man and his evolutionary development through the study of the measurable 
physical characteristics of the human races, both past and present. Any 
competent physical anthropologist could pick up a human skull and, based upon 
its characteristics, quickly identify the race of the specimen. Of course, this 
physiological knowledge was vital in sorting out the unearthed remnants of early 
man, along with piecing together man's prehistory and evolutionary development. 
Cultural anthropology dealt more with the different contemporary cultures of 
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humanity, and culturally related questions of antiquity and prehistory, making it a 
far less precise science, and one open to wide interpretation. 
 
Surprisingly, before he became such a prominent anthropologist, Boas 
expressed his acceptance of racial differences in mental characteristics. In “The 
Mind of Primitive Man,” he wrote: 
Differences of Structure must be accompanied by differences of function, 
physiological as well as psychological; and, as we found clear evidence of 
differences in structure between races, so we must anticipate that the differences 
in mental characteristics will be found.  
 
Both of Boas' parents were radical socialists in the revolutionary movement that 
swept over Europe in 1870. In his biography of Boas, his student Melville 
Herskovits wrote that Boas' political sympathies "leaned towards a variety of 
socialism." The United States House of Representatives cited Boas' involvement 
with 44 Communist-front organizations. Coinciding with the rise of Nazism in 
Germany and the increasing influence of racially aware anthropologists in the 
world scientific community, Boas began to marshal his anthropological influence 
in service of his political sympathies. He began to advance the quack idea that 
there are really no such things as individual human races. He argued that 
although they had variations of skin colors and features, the groups called races 
possessed little difference genetically and that, whatever their superficial 
differences, solely their environment created them. By 1938, Boas dropped the 
above quotation from the new edition of his book. 
 
He gathered many Jewish disciples around him, including Gene Weltfish, Isador 
Chein, Melville Herskovits, Otto Klineberg, and Ashley Montagu. He also had 
among his followers the Negro K. B. Clark and two women, Ruth Benedict and 
Margaret Mead. Mead later wrote her famous book on Samoa [Coming of Age in 
Samoa] suggesting that indiscriminate sexual relations would lessen teenage 
traumas and problems. [Her opus was later soundly refuted by Derek Freeman, 
who showed that Mead had falsified her data on Samoa.] 
 
Boas and his entire cadre of disciples had extensive Communist connections. He 
repeatedly proclaimed that he was in a "holy war against racism" and he died 
suddenly during a luncheon, where once again and for the last time, he stressed 
the need to fight "racism." Boas and his comrades gained control over the 
anthropology departments of most universities by encouraging their egalitarian 
comrades to use their positions to support their own in academic appointments. 
While traditional anthropologists had no ax to grind and no sacred cause to 
champion, Boas and his followers embarked on a holy mission to extirpate racial 
knowledge from the academic establishment. They succeeded. 
 
Whenever egalitarians achieved positions of influence and/or power, they aided 
their comrades to rise in the teaching departments of the colleges and academic 
departments they administered. They could count on fellow Jews who held 
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influential university positions to assist their co-religionists, as well as Gentile 
egalitarians, in getting professorships and research appointments and 
promotions. Similar collusion took place in the ranks and on the boards of 
anthropological associations and journals. However, the coup de grâce was the 
massive support given the egalitarian dogma by the media establishment, which 
was overwhelmingly in Jewish hands. 
 
Racial equality was [and still is] presented to the public as scientific fact, opposed 
only by the "bigoted" and the "ignorant." Egalitarian writers such as Ashley 
Montagu and others received great praise in magazines, newspapers, and, later 
on television. Whether one was a Jew or a Gentile, professing a belief in racial 
equality became essential dogma for anyone who wanted to advance in 
anthropology or any other part of the academic world. Adherence to the 
"politically correct" line led to prestige and acclaim, money and success. Racial 
truth telling led to personal attack and often economic hardship.  
 
Ashley Montagu became the best-known spokesman for the equality hoax, 
superseding Boas as the most popular exponent of anti-racism. His well-
modulated British accent and aristocratic name added instant credibility to his 
racial pronouncements. I can still remember, after thirty years, his impressive 
appearances on the Today television program. His book, Race: Man's Most 
Dangerous Myth, became the bible of equality, and it profoundly impressed me 
before I had a chance to read the other side. Montagu's real name was Israel 
Ehrenberg. In a brilliant exercise of psychological camouflage, Ehrenberg 
changed his name a number of times, finally settling on not simply an Anglo-
Saxon moniker, but the name Montagu, which is one of Britain's most aristocratic 
and oldest medieval-titled families.[16] 
 
Let us not forget a major member of the Frankfurt school and the Jew whose 
psychological warfare tactics formed another cornerstone of Social Marxist 
paradigm.  
 
Scholar E. Mullin's states the following in his book "The biological Jew." On the 
Freud situation: 
“Few Americans realize that the principal tool of Communist penetration in the 
United States is the pseudoscience of psychotherapy. Not only have many 
patriots who opposed Communist subversion been imprisoned for life without 
trial, but many others have been rendered helpless, their fortunes seized, and 
their exposures of Communist treachery discredited by the accusation of "mental 
illness". In 1848, Karl Marx issued his Communist Manifesto, detailing the Jewish 
plans for subduing the Gentile, but it was not until 1896 that the most workable 
system to achieve this goal, "psychoanalysis", was unveiled by his fellow Jew 
Sigmund Freud.” 
 
No one suspected at the time that Freud had invented the indispensable tool for 
the biological parasite in his quest to gain absolute control over the life of the 



 108 

Gentile host. Psychoanalysis became the instrument that the Jew used to probe 
the deepest recesses of the mind of the host, thereby learning his best secrets, 
as well as the hidden fears and doubts, which could be exploited by a clever 
enemy in order to become his master. 
 
Thomas Szasz, in The Myth of Psychotherapy, wrote most revealingly of Freud's 
creation of "the science of psychotherapy" as an instrument of the Jew to be 
used to gain power over the gentiles. Szasz titled his chapter, "Sigmund Freud, 
the Jewish Avenger." Freud himself was born a Jew, and was given the Jewish 
name of Schlomo after his grandfather, a rabbi.  
 
Szasz further comments: 
"The inconsistency between Freud's passionate anti-religious tirades and his 
profound commitment to Jewishness significantly highlights an important aspect 
of Freud's personality and predilections, namely, his anti-gentilism. The popular 
image of Freud as an enlightened, emancipated irreligious person who, with the 
aid of psychoanalysis, discovered that religion is a mental illness, is pure fiction." 
Szasz then defines the Freudian psyche permanently by writing: "Freud was 
throughout his life, a proud, chauvinistic, even vengeful Jew."  
In his "science" of psychoanalysis, Freud focused the hatred of centuries, which 
the biological parasite had cultivated against the host, a hatred irreconcilably 
rooted in the biological situation of the parasite that must live off the host, and 
that can have no existence without this relationship.  
 
Shortly after the Crash of 1929, when many gentiles had been impoverished by 
Jewish money manipulation, the psychiatrists began to show their hands as the 
new masters. In May 1930, an International Congress on Mental Hygiene was 
held in Washington, D.C. Four thousand psychiatrists from fifty-three countries 
were welcomed by the President of the United States, Herbert Hoover. The new 
masters drafted a charter stating that they alone had the knowledge to 
"understand and control human behavior... Psychiatry must now decide what is 
to be the immediate future of the human race." 
The new pronouncement also boasted that "Psychiatrists alone possess the 
superior intelligence and knowledge to alter materially and permanently human 
behaviors." Many of the bureaucrats got the message, and promptly signed up 
for lengthy series of "analysis". Soon afterwards, a number of Communist cells 
were established in the government bureaus, chief amongst them, the Harold 
Ware cell. Ware was merely the office boy for Felix Frankfurter, who 
masterminded this Communist group, placing Communist agents high in the 
official levels of every government department in Washington. [17] 
 
Freud set the stage to attack and tear down every organic bond of Gentile 
peoples and societies under the premise of psychoanalysis and give the Jews 
legitimacy to simply denounce all their critics and anything or any obstacle in 
their way with an entire host of pseudo-medical sounding jargon, and down the 
road for America as in the Soviet Union declare anyone against their system as 
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mentally ill, and have them locked away. They tried this on Naval Commander 
George Lincoln Rockwell in America as well, when he denounced and exposed 
them to the public. 
 
Today the Jews are pushing to have racial awareness [Gentiles wish to remain 
as diverse, pure and separate races] and anti-Semitism [anyone who tells the 
truth about the Jews] labeled as "mental illness" along with anything threatening 
to their agenda. We see in the Jewish created label of "Racism" a propaganda 
term to vilify the organic bonds and natural love for one’s people or what social 
biology calls "Kin altruism" today, as it stands in the way of the creation of a one 
world mongrelized race that the Jews want as part of their globalist agenda.  
 
An important note on this: 
In “Memories, Dreams, and Reflections,” Jung wrote [p.149]: 
"Above all, Freud's attitude towards the spirit seems to me highly questionable. 
Wherever in a person or in a work of art, an expression of spirituality [in the 
intellectual, not the supernatural senses] came to light, he suspected it, and 
insinuated that it was repressed sexuality." It took Jung several years to realize 
that the earthbound Jew was unable to comprehend anything spiritual, having to 
interpret it in the grossest physical sense, and he finally parted company with 
him. 
 
One can see an example of this Jewish psycho-trickery as attack in action and 
the fact the Jews are working to pave the way for a materialist, atheist state 
where anyone with any psychic abilities or spiritual beliefs will be labeled under a 
host of jargon, drugged up, locked away, and viewed as insane. This allows that 
Gentiles will remain powerless on the spiritual level. In fact, we see the first 
waves of this already in place. The Jews are pushing this foreword. 
 
Today the Jewish atheists are literally trying to convince Gentiles they are 
nothing but Goyim, two legged animals without a soul and that even the 
understanding of having a soul, psychic ability and thus even the idea of 
developing these are a major threat to the Jews.  
 
"IT IS INDISPENSABLE FOR US TO UNDERMINE ALL FAITH, TO TEAR OUT 
OF THE MIND OF THE "GOYIM" THE VERY PRINCIPLE OF GOD-HEAD AND 
THE SPIRIT, AND TO PUT IN ITS PLACE ARITHMETICAL CALCULATIONS 
AND MATERIAL NEEDS." 
—Protocols of the Elders of Zion [18] 
 
They use the Freudian tactics in attacking these concepts and those who hold 
them under a host of buzzwords, revolving around nothing but smears and 
medical sounding jargon. They push the centuries-old and outdated Newtonian 
[five-sense universe only] paradigm still in science to act as the needed platform 
to do this with and legitimize their lies to the Gentiles. While working to [as Dr. 
Radin has exposed], openly create strict taboos in the scientific fields such as 
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physics to keep any Gentiles from researching the spiritual direction. This is no 
different from the taboos placed in Christianity to keep Gentiles away from any 
spiritual knowledge and power. The little that has shined though the keyhole 
[thanks to Gentiles scientists] has revealed that the powers of the mind and soul 
do exist. 
 
The Jewish led atheist's movements push a Communist moral system under the 
banner of liberalism, using an individualist tactic over the collectivist tactics the 
open Social Marxists use; the other side of the same coin, a tactic of which the 
Jewess Rand made popular. Rand was a major example of Jewish subterfuge in 
their agenda: 
" Ron Paul, like Alan Greenspan, was heavily influenced by the Russian Jewess 
"Ayn Rand." "Rand" was born Alisa Zinov'yevna Rosenbaum in St. Petersburg, 
Russia in 1905. I became acquainted with Rosenbaum's subversive activities 
while battling against one of the most ardent modern proponents of her 
philosophies, a radical Zionist Jew who many years ago proposed the nuclear 
annihilation of Iran, and who defended Einstein's reputation with falsehoods and 
smears. 
"Ayn Rand" came to America from Russia, presenting herself as a radical anti-
Communist. Hers was the typical modus operandi of Bolshevik operatives, 
working for an official Soviet organization known as The Trust. These agents, 
many of them crypto-Jews, came to the West in search of anti-Communists and 
infiltrated anti-Communist organizations and Western intelligence agencies. 
 
Their objective was to forward the interests of communism by creating a 
controlled opposition to communism which would serve the interests of the 
Communists while pretending to fight against them. They also subverted all 
authentic anti-Communist movements. 
 
Rand promoted negative stereotypes of women, attacked homosexuals, 
advocated laissez faire Capitalism, and taught selfishness and disregard for 
humanity. She opposed charity and objected to any governmental assistance for 
those without means. She wanted to place America on the ruinous Gold 
Standard. Rosenbaum's "good advice" to the blacks only held them back by 
preventing them from using the political process to forward their interests. Her 
good advice to the Goyim only held the Gentiles back, by making them selfish 
and irresponsible, and also by preventing them from using their government to 
better themselves and their neighbors. She taught the Gentiles to hate the poor, 
undermine the middle class, and concentrate wealth in the hands of the 
wealthiest Jews, all in the name of "fighting communism". Her "good advice" 
pitted Gentiles against one another at the time when they should have been 
helping one another to become successful. She taught Gentiles to shun any 
efforts to cooperate in their communities and improve the lot of one another. 
 
While Jews famously provided communal support and charitable assistance for 
their own, Rosenbaum helped to create the destructive "me generation" attitudes 
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in Americans, weakened communities and inhibited the advancement of the poor 
and middle class. Her beliefs also fostered the drug culture, pornography and the 
destruction of public education. While Jews promoted strong community ties, 
Rosenbaum taught Gentiles to be selfish and "independent,” meaning without 
any sense of social responsibility or communal cohesion. 
 
While Jews wisely took from the public schools all they could, Frederick T. Gates, 
an agent of World Jewry, used Rockefeller/Rothschild money to finance 
institutions of higher learning, which benefitted Jews, while promoting the idea 
that Gentile students should be readied for factory work and work as field hands 
and farmers. While World Jewry took the monies they stole from Gentiles and 
distributed them charitably to their own. Rosenbaum taught Gentiles to abandon 
all social responsibility, obsessively focus on themselves, and destroy all 
government institutions that better the lot of the American middle class and poor. 
 
Alisa Rosenbaum's "anti-Communist" philosophies weakened Americans, 
opening the door for Communism," and of course, always remember that 
Communism could not exist without Christianity to provide the template for it: 
http://see_the_truth.webs.com/Xianity_and_Communism.htm 
 
"Some call it Marxism, I call it Judaism.” —Rabbi Stephen Wise  
 
The final end of this is the enacting of the Talmud on the earth in a Jew World 
Order where Jews are the open rulers, the "Chosen" and we are the goyim, 
micro-chipped, dumb two-legged animals without any spiritual power, knowledge, 
past, or organic identity, who slave for the Jew night and day on a global 
plantation. 
 
Quote from the Jewish Talmud: Nidrasch Talpioth, p. 225-L:  
"Jehovah created the non-Jew in human form so that the Jew would not have to 
be served by beasts. The non-Jew is consequently an animal in human form, and 
condemned to serve the Jew day and night."  
 
Baruch Levy, Letter to Karl Marx [Mordechai Levi], 'La Revue de Paris', p.574, 
June 1, 1928: 
"In this New World Order, the children of Israel will furnish all the leaders without 
encountering opposition. The Governments of the different peoples forming the 
world republic will fall without difficulty into the hands of the Jews. It will then be 
possible for the Jewish rulers to abolish private property everywhere to make use 
of the resources of the state. Thus will the promise of the Talmud be fulfilled, in 
which it is said that when the Messianic time has come, the Jews will have all the 
property of the whole world in their hands." 
 
"The Jewish doctrine of Marxism rejects the aristocratic principle of nature and 
replaces the eternal privilege of power and strength with the mass of numbers 
and their dead weight. Thus, it denies personal worth, contests the significance 
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of folk and race, and thereby withdraws from humanity the premise for its 
existence and culture. As a foundation of the universe, it would lead to the end of 
any order intellectually conceivable to man. If, with the help of his Marxist creed, 
the Jew is victorious over the peoples of the world, his crown will be the funeral 
wreath of humanity and this planet will, as it once did for millions of years move 
through the ether devoid of men."— Adolf Hitler 
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