
mud	flood
Welcome	 to	 Aryan	 Practical	 Idealism.	 Today	 we	 have	 two	 guests	 on	 the	 show	 from
different	regions	of	North	America,	with	myself	being	in	the	north,	the	northernmost,	and
the	 others	 forming	 somewhat	 of	 a	 different	 pattern	 in	 totally	 different	 regions	 of	 the
states.	So	welcome	aboard,	Southerner,	and	another	guest.

Yeah,	whatever	you	like,	I	don't	care.	So	I	guess	the	whole	topic	of	the	discussion	will	be
a	sort	of	analysis,	maybe	a	psycho	behavioral	analysis	of	non-whites	and	our	 relations
with	them	and	how	to	deal	with	them,	and	different	groups	and	their	particular	different
behaviors.	 So	 it's	 sort	 of	 a	 bio-anthropological,	 anthropo-psychological,	 whatever,
podcast	here.

So	I	guess	first	we	can	start	with	Southerner.	Tell	us	about	your	experiences.	You	don't
have	to	be	overly	specific	 in	your	region,	your	geographical	region,	to	whatever	extent
you	feel	you	want	to,	and	 let	us	know,	you	know,	your	perspectives	on	these	 issues	of
the	mud	flood.

Yeah,	 it's	getting,	as	 time	 flies	by,	especially	since	 I	 live	not	 too	 far	 from	the	city,	 this
whole	mud	flood	is	just	getting	out	of	hand,	especially	compared	to	20	years	ago.	So	you
—	With	 all	 these	Negroes,	 especially	 being	 southeast.	 You	 have	 in	 your	memory,	 you
know,	you've	been	around	for	more	than	20	years,	I	guess,	so	you	have	a	recollection	of
the	difference	in	time.

Most	definitely,	especially	since	I	grew	up	in	a	practically	white	ethno-state	of	an	area,
too,	 basically	 in	 the	 middle	 of	 nowhere.	 Yeah,	 I	 guess	 that's	 very	 similar	 to	 myself,
because	 I	 also	 grew	 up	 in	 the	 middle	 of	 nowhere.	 We'll	 talk	 about	 me	 and	 my
experiences	later,	but	I	guess	from	your	perspective,	now	that	you've	experienced	that
change	 and	 the	 rapidity	 of	 change	 that	 has	 been	 going	 on,	 obviously	 because	 of	 the
Kalergi	Plan,	the	Jewish	white	genocide	agenda	of	pumping—	It's	not	always	that,	but	it's
the	mind	control	of	our	own	people,	too,	it's	just	how	they're	just	so	oblivious	to	what	is
truly	going	on.

Yeah,	they	are	sort	of	like	a	zombie	in	the	nest	of	time.	A	zombie,	yep.	And	that	might
also	be	related	to	the	electromagnetic	fields	that	are	being	transmitted	from	cell	towers
to	manipulate	people's	brainwave	activity	and	force—	They	can	most	definitely	do	that
with	radioactive	frequency,	like	right-of-way	frequencies.

Yeah,	 radio	 frequencies,	 RF	 generators,	 because	 there's	 a	 guy	named	Royal	Raymond
Rife,	 R-I-F-E,	 right	 around	 the	 turn	 of	 the	 last	 century	who	 had	Rife	machines	 that	 he
would	use	to	try	to	cure	people's	diseases	by	targeting	certain	vibrational	frequencies	of
bacteria	and	stuff,	and	he	could	destroy	them	through	simply	bombarding	them	with	or
exposing	 them	to	 those	 radio	 frequencies.	So	obviously	 that	manipulates	and	modifies
your	 consciousness	 when	 you	 have	 certain	 vibrational	 frequencies,	 radio	 frequencies,



transmitted	 into	 your	 mind,	 into	 your	 brain.	 The	 brain	 is	 like	 an	 electromagnetic
transceiver	that	processes	 information	and	that	can	be	manipulated,	so	the	people	are
definitely	robots,	robotized—	It's	not	always	that.

We're	just	surrounded	by	all	sorts	of	radio	wave	frequencies,	these	days	especially,	with
like	these	cell	towers,	you	know,	the	Wi-Fi	routers,	cell	phones,	5G.	That's	going	to	be	an
absolute	 weapon.	 A	 lot	 of	 people	 are	 speculating	 that	 5G	 is	 going	 to	 be	 used	 as	 like
some	sort	of	weapon	to	even	possibly	destroy	people	in	some	way.

It	could	very	well	be,	but	I	think	they're	mainly	doing	it	for	surveillance	purposes.	I	think
it's	 surveillance,	 but	 it's	 also,	 like	 we	 had	 just	 said,	 the	mind	 control	 aspect.	 They're
basically	looking	to	implant	people's	minds	with	whatever	sort	of	thought	forms	that	they
generate	and	transmit.

I	 guess	 that'd	 be	 called	 synthetic	 telepathy,	 voice-to-skull	 technology	 that	 they're
utilizing.	And	what	they're	doing,	given	what	I've	researched	in	my	personal	experience
to	some	extent	 through	 the	gang	stalking	protocols,	 is	 they're	 stalking	people,	 they're
chipping	people.	Obviously	they	can	chip	dogs	and	criminals,	so	it's	not	a	far	stretch	of
the	imagination	that	they	would	chip	humans.

And	 then	 they're	monitoring	 their	 behavior	 and	 their	 behavioral	 reactions.	 24	 hours	 a
day,	they've	got	people	on	targeted	individuals	where	they	can	use	radar	to	look	through
the	 walls	 of	 their	 properties	 and	 possibly	 even	 thermography	 to	 observe	 their
physiological	reactions	to	stimuli.	And	then	they	deliberately	try	to	rile	you	up	and	harass
you	and	observe	how	you'll	behave	and	respond	to	those	stimuli.

And	then	also,	you	know,	they're	implanting	thoughts	in	your	mind	so	they	can	possibly
turn	you	into	like	a	Manchurian	candidate,	like	a	false	flag	operative	that	they'll	set	up.
And	that	of	course	will	help	to	build	the	police	state	more	and	so	forth	and	to	fearmonger
the	population.	So	obviously	that's	going	on.

And	 yeah,	 how	do	we	 combat	 that	 exactly?	And	also,	 they	 actually	 have,	 they've	had
technology	for	over	100	years	to	manipulate	the	weather	to	their	liking	as	well.	Yeah,	I
guess	that's	Tesla	technology.	Mm-hmm.

Something	 like	 that.	 Yeah,	 and	 they've	 obviously	 been	 doing	 that	 with	 forest	 fires	 all
over	 the	 place.	 I	 mean,	 how	 do	 you	 think,	 I	 mean,	 where	 do	 you	 think	 all	 these
hurricanes	have	come	from	the	past	few	decades?	Right,	exactly.

Especially	in	my	region,	it's	almost	every	year.	Hurricane	Sandy,	Hurricane	Katrina.	Why
don't	you	tell	us	about	your	experiences,	now	that	we're	on	that	topic,	about	Hurricane
Katrina	and	that	region,	if	you	might	have	personal	experiences.

Well,	that	was	around	Louisiana.	Was	it	Louisiana	that	was	most	affected	by	it?	Yes,	New
Orleans.	In	New	Orleans,	exactly.



But	yeah,	I	think	they	mainly	create	these	so-called	travesties	that	make	people	go	out
and	 just	 buy	 a	 bunch	 of	 shit	 they	 really	 don't	 need.	 Not	 only	 that,	 the	 insurance
companies	are	raking	in	money	through	the	roof.	They	sabotage	the	economy	and	then
they	can	buy	up	people's	property	at	pennies.

When	they	default	their	mortgages	or	they	lose	their	business	or	something	like	that.	 I
think	that's	what	they're	doing	now.	Yes,	with	the	corona.

These	 small	 businesses	 go	 out	 of	 business	 because,	 well,	 they're	 not	 getting	 any
customers	because	they're	not	going	out	as	much	and	thus	their	business	fails.	Then	the
Jews	can	come	in	and	snag	up	these	cheap	assets	without	having	to	pay	for	much.	Yeah,
that's	obviously	what	their	one	of	their	protocols	is	anyway.

Obviously,	 there's	 even	 larger	 protocols,	 which	 is	 just	 justifying	 the	 existence	 of	 the
police	state	in	the	mind	of	the	average	person	so	that	the	average	person	learns	to	love
their	 slavery.	 They	 look	 upon	 the	 police	 or	 the	 state	 as	 their	 saviors	 and	 those	 who
control	it,	the	politicians	as	their	pastoral	priest	kings	who	will	lead	them,	the	sheep,	to
comfort	and	safe	pastures	and	so	 forth.	That	 ties	 itself	 in	with	 the	biblical	narrative	as
well.

The	priest	of	the	orders	of	Melchizedek,	this	pastoral	shepherd	kings	who	are	the	ruling
elite.	 It	 reinforces	 that	 subordinate	 consciousness	 of	 the	 masses	 and	 works	 in
conjunction	 with	 biblical	 prophecy	 that	 they	 create	 to,	 you	 know,	 it's	 like	 they're
reenacting	 biblical	 prophecy.	 Since	 you're	 in	 the	 South,	 you	 would	 know	 a	 lot	 about,
because	you're	sort	of	around	the	Bible	Belt	type	area,	I	guess.

Yes.	Oh,	my	gosh.	Most	definitely.

But	you	are	not	a	Bible	believer?	Not	 fully,	per	 se.	 It	was	kind	of	 just	 forced	upon	me
during	my	childhood,	but	I	sort	of	just	instinctively	knew	that	this	isn't	what	we	should	be
fully	believing	in,	per	se.	Yeah,	so	I	guess	you	have...	It	doesn't	pertain	to	reality,	is	what
I'm	trying	to	say.

I	just	sort	of	instinctively	knew	it.	Yeah,	they	sort	of	would...	You	don't	want	to	tell	your
family	members	 about	 it	 because	 you'll	 be	 afraid	 that	 they'll	 disown	 you,	 you	 know?
Well,	basically	what	 they	do	 is,	you	know,	 like	what	you're	saying	about	your	 family	 is
they	sort	of	program	you	from	your	early	childhood	to	sort	of	think	that	that's	how	the
world	is	and	that's	the	absolute	truth.	And	if	you	question	it,	you	know,	there's	a	whole
fear	and	shame	narrative	that	if	you	question	it,	you're	going	to	go	to	hell,	you're	going
to	fry	in	a	pot	furnace	for	the	rest	of	eternity.

And	that's	why	at	times	in	my	life	where	I	never...	Everyone	else	thinks	I'm	right	type	of
mentality.	I'm	the	only	one	who's	right.	That's	the	Christian	boomer	in	a	nutshell.

They	have	that	narrow-minded	sectarianism	type	of	mentality.	Yeah.	So	they're	all	sort



of	like	Southern	Baptist	types,	I	guess.

I	went	to	a	Baptist	church,	actually.	So	yeah.	And	I	did	not	like	it,	let's	just	say	that.

I	know	that	that	conspiracy	theorist	who	is	affiliated	with	Alex	Jones,	Texie	Mars,	claims
to	have	been	a	Southern	Baptist.	I	guess	he	was	probably	putting	that	position	to	try	to
market	 to	 that	demographic	 through	 fear-mongering	 them	with	 the,	you	know,	 it's	 the
Freemasons	and	the	Illuminati	type	disinfo	shift	away	from	Jews.	So	that's	sort	of	like	the
culture	of	the	Southern	states.

Is	this	largely	based	around	the	Bible	still,	or	is	there	a	lot	of...	 I	think	more	people	are
starting	to	wake	up,	especially	the	younger	ones,	but	the	older	crowds	is	lost	and	gone
the	way	I	see	it.	Yeah,	it	seems	like	that.	Into	the,	still	plugged	into	the	matrix.

Yeah,	it	definitely	seems	like	that.	In	terms	of	biblical	prophecy	or	whatnot.	Right.

Yeah.	There's	a	lot	of	the	Israeli	flag	wavers.	That's	their	main,	like,	hotbed.

Yeah,	exactly.	I	actually	got	photos	of	this	one,	this	one	bitch	who	owns	a,	what	do	they
call,	thrift	stores?	She's	the	owner	of	a	thrift	store.	And	I	figured	this	out	because	I	saw
the	sticker	on	the	bumper	sticker	on	the	back	of	her	van	at	this	thrift	store.

I	 found	 it	 elsewhere	 within	 this	 town	 near	 me.	 So,	 yeah,	 it's	 one	 of	 these	 Zionist
Christians.	 Yeah,	 strangely	 enough,	 that's	 sort	 of	 a	 perfect	 encapsulation	 of	 America
right	there.

You	know,	 like	Siege	Man	says,	 it's	a	Freemasonic	shopping	mall.	Yeah.	You've	got	the
Zionist	flag	waver	and,	you	know,	obsessed	about	money	and	so	forth	in	their	thrift	store
where	they're	selling	Chinese	garbage.

Yeah,	 I	 actually	 saw	Chinese	 shit	 in	 there	 too.	 Like	 literally	 statues	 from	 like	Korea	 or
China.	I	swear	to	God,	that's	a	good	description.

Postmodern	pastiche	 in	a	nutshell.	Yeah,	where	 I	am	here,	 it's	very	similar	 in	 terms	of
the	Zionist	nuttiness.	For	Canada,	that's	sort	of	like	an	anomaly	because	most	people	in
Canada,	so	far	as	I	know	or	have	experienced,	they	don't	really	seem	to	be	very	Zionist
oriented.

They're	 more	 of	 a	 liberal	 minded.	 Yeah,	 pretty	 much.	 Canada,	 in	 my	 opinion,	 is	 like
maybe	75%	liberal	and	then	25%	Christian	and	America	would	probably	be	 like	maybe
50-50.

Yeah,	I	don't	know.	Depends	where	you're	located.	Yeah,	true.

They	aren't	very	different	in	terms	of	how	they	zealously	look	at	things	and,	you	know,
how	 if	 you	are	 outside	 of	 their	 line	 of	 thought,	 they	 sort	 of	will	 give	 you	 this	 passive-



aggressive	 stare	 or	 whatever	 that	 may	 be	 or	 just	 sometimes	 scream	 at	 you.	 If	 they
pretend	like,	oh,	I	respect	your	opinions	or	your	beliefs	and	then	they	try	to	suck	you	into
their	own	death	cult	using	passive-aggressive	sort	of	speech	patterns,	they	just	will	sort
of	 stare	 at	 you	 or	 look	 at	 you	 like	 you're	 evil	 or	 there's	 something	wrong	with	 you	 or
you're	crazy.	I	get	a	lot	of	that,	you	know,	extreme	hostility	look.

And	here	I	am	just	walking	around,	you	know,	minding	my	own	affairs.	Sort	of	mind	my
own	business.	 Yeah,	 but	 if	 you	 criticize	 their	 Jewish	masters	 and	 they'll	 just	 go	 out	 of
their	way	to	rip	you	to	pieces.

That's	pathetic.	Yeah,	pretty	much	that	anyone	would	worship	another	biological	group
and	 when	 their	 own	 It's	 cuckoldry	 the	 way	 I	 see	 it.	 Exactly,	 spiritual	 cuckoldry	 and
spiritual	slavery	or	pseudo-spiritual	because	 it's	not	even	really	spirituality	anyway,	 it's
just	a	lot	of	emotion	for	the	most	part.

They	 get	 put	 into	 their	 emotional	 state	 of	 consciousness	 and	 then	 just	 disengage	 the
rational	brain	and	 they're	not	capable	of,	you	know,	 rational	 thought	once	 it	 comes	 to
their	dogma.	But	yeah,	so	I	guess	that's	the	sort	of	context	you're	in	right	now	that	the
younger	generations	are	shifting	away	from	Christianity.	Pretty	much.

And	 in	 the	 so-called	 younger	 Christians,	 the	 one	 that	 called,	 they're	 only	 Christian	 in
name,	 not	 in	 character,	 really.	 They're	 just	 probably	 doing	 it	 just	 so	 they	 don't	 get
completely,	you	know,	disowned	or	ostracized	from	society.	Yeah,	I	guess	there's	a	lot	of
social	pressure	they	have	to	go	along	with	in	order	to	get	money	and	a	job	or	whatever
the	case.

I	sort	of	see	it	as	a	corpse,	 like,	you	know,	these	people	 like	E.	Michael	 Jones	and,	you
know,	 Fuentes	or	whatever,	 there's	 sort	 of	 like	a	 last	gasp	of	 that,	 you	know,	 just	 the
whole	cult,	the	Christian	cult.	I	think	that	as	time	goes	on,	it's	certainly	going	to	die	out.
Seems	 like,	obviously,	 the	Christians	are	 really	big	on	bringing	 the	non-whites	 in	 to	 fill
their	empty	pews.

That's	 what	 really	 makes	 me	 go.	 Yeah,	 that's	 sort	 of	 seen	 now	 with	 the	 poor	 feral
savages.	Sorry,	go	on.

Yeah,	that's	sort	of	what	made	me,	makes	me,	it	scratched	my	head.	It's	like,	why	would
you	want	 to	 bring	 these	 feral	 savage	niggers	 that	 are	 nothing	 but	 a	 burden	upon	 our
society?	Yeah,	well,	for	them,	that's	how	they	make	their	money.	I	know	in	Canada,	they
get	more	money.

It's	 cheap	 labor.	 Yeah,	 it's	 like	 giving	 a	 monkey	 a	 wrench,	 basically.	 They	 can't	 get
anything	done	properly.

They're	getting	what	they	pay	for,	essentially.	Yeah,	it's	like,	hey	monkey,	hey	monkey,
go	screw	that	in	over	there.	Okay,	no,	no,	don't	smash	that	monkey.



You	screw	it	in.	You	don't	smash	that.	You	screw	it	in.

But	 that's	why	all	 this	 construction	never	gets	done,	because	all	 they	do	 is	hire	 these
cheap	ass	niggers.	Yeah,	that's	what	I	see	around	here.	They	don't	do	anything.

They	just,	half	the	time	I'm	looking	at	them,	they're	just	standing	around.	Yeah,	it's	the
same	here	when	I'm	in.	Good	monkey,	you	get	your	$10	an	hour.

Good	job.	In	this	country,	it's	predominantly	white	in	this	town,	and	the	only	construction
companies	 I've	 ever	 seen	 were	 run	 with	 Jewish	 foremen	 overlording	 Arabs,	 Negroes.
Wait,	that's	a	thing?	They	don't	actually	work,	though.

They're	 just	 sort	 of	 overseeing	 their	 little	 slaves.	 They	 just	 sit	 around	 there	 and	 do
nothing.	It	takes	forever	for	them	to	do	the	slightest	efforts.

And	 there	 are	 companies	 from	 the	 major	 city	 here,	 the	 nearest	 major	 city,	 which	 is
Calgary,	which	 is	 like	two	hours	and	45	minutes	drive	away.	So	the	 Jews	are	more	 like
overseers	 of	 their	 little	 slaves,	 pretty	 much?	 Pretty	 much,	 yeah.	 That's	 the	 sort	 of
template.

Everywhere	you	go	in	this	country,	the	only	people	you	see,	I	don't	know	if	it's	the	same
in	America	entirely,	but	the	only	people	you	see	are	Jews	in	the	back	room	controlling	it
all.	And	then	in	the	front,	you've	got	a	bunch	of	non-white	minorities	and	then	a	couple
of	white	females.	And	that's	pretty	much	the	general	pattern	that	you	see.

The	only	white	men	working	are	 those	who	are	 slightly	 older.	 You	 know,	 all	 the	white
men	are	working	in	construction.	Those	are	pretty	much	the	types	that	can't	really	retire
either.

Yeah,	where	I'm	at,	if	you	go	to,	I	don't	know	if	it's	where	you're	at,	but	where	I'm	at,	if
you	go	to	any	fast	food	restaurant,	I	never	really	see	any	white	people	working	at	any	of
them.	 It's	 kind	 of	 sad,	 actually.	 That's	 kind	 of	 why	 I	 don't	 like	 going	 to	 places	 like
McDonald's	or	whatever.

Well,	their	food	is	garbage.	It's	not	food.	It	is	garbage,	but	it's	still	amazing	to	just	go	to
those	places	and	just	not	see	really	any	white	people	working.

You	walk	into	the	Walmart,	you'll	just	witness	nothing	but	cultural	decadence	when	you
walk	 into	 the	stores.	Those	stores	somehow	 just	attract	 the	 lowest	of	 the	 low	 types	of
people.	Exactly.

They're	always	these	fat,	homeless,	cholo,	wigger	types.	There's	a	lot	of	baby	boomers	in
Walmart	too.	Yeah,	there's	a	lot	of	race	mixers	as	well.

When	 you	 go	 to	 those	 places,	 yeah,	 I	 saw	 that	 about	 a	 year,	 I	 remember	 a	 specific
instance,	this	was	a	year	or	so	ago,	where	I	went	over	there	and	there	was	a	blonde	with



a	negro	and	I	just	sort	of	looked	at	them	and	I	was	like,	oh,	that's	weird	or	whatever.	And
then	I	left	and	I	was	walking	out.	In	one	night,	I	saw	three	of	those.

What	was	weird	about	 that	was	 I	walked	outside	and	 I	was	walking	down	the	sidewalk
and	all	of	a	sudden,	 I	didn't	know	 it	was	 them.	 I	don't	know	 if	 it	was	 them	or	not.	But
somebody	threw	like	a	bottle	at	me	immediately.

It	was	really	weird.	 I	didn't	know	 if	 it	was	 them	or	 if	 it	was	 just	some	drunk.	 It's	 just	a
result	of	your	microaggression,	I	guess,	by	looking	at	them.

You're	 not	 allowed	 to	 look	 at	 race	 mixing.	 They	 caught	 wind	 of	 your	 Aryan	 essence.
Yeah,	I	guess.

They	gave	you	some	spirits.	It	looked	like	they	were	drunk,	too.	I	mean,	it	was	whatever.

It's	pretty	silly.	Oh,	boomers	and	alcohol	go	together	quite	well.	I	know	that	because	my
father's	a	drunken	no	account.

He	 just	 lived	 his	 life	 to	 drink	 away	 his	 parents'	 money.	 And	 he's	 a	 total	 liberal	 who
worships	Noam	Chomsky	and	various	other	of	these	Jew	leftist	spin	doctors	who	spend
their	like	Michael	Moore,	that	fat	piece	of	garbage.	It's	Jabba	the	Hutt,	man.

What's	so	special	about	 that	guy	anyway?	Michael	Moore.	He's	 just	an	aggressive	 Jew,
basically.	Life	is	terrible.

I	mean,	 like	 you	watch	his	 documentaries,	 like	what	was	 it,	 Bowling	 for	Columbine?	 It
literally	didn't	mention	Columbine	much	at	all.	It	was	just	like	a	gun	control	propaganda
video,	basically.	Yeah.

Oh,	yeah.	I	watched	that	when	it	came	out.	And	for	some	reason,	I	was	like,	yeah,	that's
really	profound.

That	was	more	than	likely	probably	a	false	flag	of	some	sort.	Well,	it's	kind	of	like	these
shows	where	 they	paint,	 you	know,	 like	 the	Big	Bang	Theory,	 for	 example,	where	you
have	a	bunch	of	like	so-called	smart,	like,	you	know,	Jewish	people	living	together.	And
it's	like	they're	trying	to	program	you	to	think	like,	oh,	they're	really	smart	or	whatever.

Like,	go	on.	I	thought	those,	you	know,	tithes	were	fags,	personally.	Well,	yeah,	I	mean,
that's	another	thing,	too,	 is	they	try	to	normalize,	you	know,	faggotry	or	whatever	with
these	shows.

Yeah,	 that's	 exactly.	 To	 make	 it	 seem	 like	 it's	 all	 normal	 when	 they	 really	 just	 take
something	that's	healthy	and	good	and	they	twist	 it	 in	a	sort	of	mocking	or	 ironic	way.
Yeah,	it's	typical.

Go	 on.	 I	 believe	 half	 of	 those	 so-called	 actresses	 are	 trannies.	 They	 just	 do	 not	 have



these	so-called	actresses	do	not	look	like	women.

I	mean,	a	lot	of	them	are	not.	They	don't	certainly	look	or	act	like	women.	Well,	a	lot	of
them	just	speak	in	a	very	vulgar	way	that	just	is	not	very	feminine.

It	sort	of	turns	women	into	men	and,	you	know.	Yeah,	that's	why	you	have	pants.	Makes
the	women	wear	the	pants	and	then	makes	the	men	into	passive.

I	don't	mean	to	talk	over	you.	I'm	just	trying	to	get	my	point	out.	Go	on.

Sorry,	I	don't	mean	to	talk	over	you.	Probably	just	connections	that	are	messed	up.	Yeah,
it	could	be	delay,	lag.

But	 yeah,	 that's	why	 you	 have	 all	 these	women	who	 act	 all	 hyper-masculine	 because
their	 subconsciousness	 is	 taking	 it	 in	 as	 it	 being	 normal,	 really.	 Yeah,	 that's	 the
behavioral	modeling	 and	 predictive	 programming	 that	 the	 Jew	Media	 does.	 You	 know,
they	put	this	brassy	Jewess	on	film	and	she's	like,	oh	yeah,	yeah,	I'm	a	feminist.

I'm	here	 to	 cut	 your	balls	 off,	white	man.	Not	going	 to	 let	 you	keep	me	down.	All	 the
other	women	just	go	along	because	they	want	to	be	popular.

Exactly.	That's	the	whole	nature	of	the	Jew	Messiah.	Yeah,	whatever	woman	I've	seen	in
real	life	is	like	a	feminist	or	whatever,	they're	most	likely	probably	a	lesbian	or	really	ugly
or,	you	know.

They're	just	very	vulgar	looking	and	behaviorally	too.	Yeah.	I	guess	most	women	who	are
more,	 what	 would	 the	 word	 be,	 archetypally	 feminine	 in	 appearance,	 you	 know,	 like
they're	very	good	looking	women,	that	they	understand	that	that's	their	meal	ticket	right
there	is	their	appearance.

So	they	try	not	to	mess	that	up	too	much	by	going	to	two	great	extremes	of	self-harm.
Yeah.	So	they	tend	to	avoid	that,	you	know,	extreme	feminist	position,	at	least	so	far.

But	 that's	what	 the	 Jew	wants,	 is	 to	 drag	 them	 to	 that	 position	 so	 that	 they	 can,	 you
know,	 obviously	 destroy	 them.	 Especially	 the	 party	 culture,	 you	 know,	 drinking	 and
listening	to	nigger	music	every	weekend	or	so.	Yeah.

So	it's	either	they	get	the	females	to	gravitate	toward	extreme	feminism,	and	it's	mainly
only	 the	more,	you	know,	ones	who	have	to	overcompensate	because	they	don't	have
the	natural	 beauty,	 or	 it's	 the	ones	who	are	natural	 beauties	who	get	 sucked	 into	 the
race	mixing	angle.	So	 it's	one	or	 the	other,	 typically	 for	 females	 that	 the	 Jews	are	on.
When	 I	 was	 in	 college,	 I	 couldn't	 even	 tolerate	 the,	 just	 the,	 how	 every	 time	 I'd	 go
outside,	I'd	always	have	to	hear	that	same	garbage,	fucking,	you	know.

Low	vibrational	jungle.	Jungle,	back	to	the	jungle	music,	as	they	call	it.	I'd	have	to	hear	it
every	time	I'd	go	outside,	and	it	just	got	so	annoying.



And	I	remember	these	guys	that	were	on	my	hall	at	the	time,	you	know,	 I	would	go	 in
this	guy's	car	or	whatever,	and	we'd	go	somewhere,	he'd	play	 the	same	garbage	any,
every	single	time	we'd	go	wherever,	and	I'd	just	kind	of	sit	there	and	try	to,	you	know,
uh,	pretend	 like	 I	don't	 feel	 like	my	ears	are	being	raped,	basically.	Yeah,	so	obviously
that	music	is	designed	to	just	completely	lower	your	subconsciousness	to	an	animal-like
state.	 I	was	 just	 going	 to	mention	 that	 the	 Jews	 obviously	 have	 deliberately	 contrived
that	musical	form,	if	we	can	call	 it	music,	as	a	means	not	only	of	that,	of	degenerating
the	consciousness,	 lowering	 it,	but	basically	as	 like	a	vehicle	of	primitivization,	so	 that
they	can	reduce	you	into	a	wigger	from	a	white	person,	and	then	that	way	it	opens	your
subconscious	 up,	 your	 consciousness,	 to,	 you	 know,	 being	more	 receptive	 to	 the	 non-
white,	and	that	way	it	enables	the	non-white	to	get	more	power	too,	and	to,	you	know,
take	away	 from	 the	power	of	whites,	because	 the	whites	have	directed	 their	attention
toward	non-whites	as	a	standard.

That	 becomes	 their	 culture,	 they	 look	 upon	 the	 Negro	 as	 the	 standard.	 I	 gravitated
toward	that	when	I	was	a	teenager	also,	the	wigger	culture,	and	it	basically	completely
dumbs	you	down	to	the	lowest	level	of	functional	consciousness	you	could	possibly	get
to,	basically.	 I	would	say	 the	same	thing	happened	to	me,	where,	 I	didn't	mean	to	cut
you	 off	 there,	 but	 basically,	 you	 know,	 I	 was	 sort	 of	 on	 an	 upward	 path	 before	 that
wigger	phase,	you	know,	I	was	sort	of	getting	to	higher	seats	of	consciousness,	and	then
I	stumbled	onto	this,	you	know,	garbage	rap	music	on	the	internet,	or	whatever,	when	I
was	 like	 13	 or	 so,	 and,	 you	 know,	 and	 then	 I	 basically	 was	 stuck	 in	 that	 sort	 of	 low,
dumbed-down	frequency	for	pretty	much	a	few	years,	and	then	I	luckily	was	able	to	pull
myself	out	of	it.

At	that	point,	 I	was	just	 listening	to	more,	 like,	obscure	groups	or	whatever,	and	then	I
sort	of	weaned	myself	away	from	just	this	simplistic	stuff	to	more	things	that	were	more
complex.	Yeah,	thankfully,	I've	never	really	circumscribed	the	whole	rap	culture,	number
one,	because	my	dad's	side	of	the	family	is	very	racialist,	and	I	find	that	as	a	very	good
upbringing	for	my	life.	Were	they	ever	in	the	KKK	or	in	any	groups	or	anything?	No,	not
that	I	know	of.

They're	 just,	 like,	 of	 a	 healthy	 mind	 for	 the	 most	 part?	 Yeah,	 maybe,	 except	 for	 the
Christian	 part.	 Other	 than	 that,	 they're	 pretty	 healthy.	 Yeah,	 that's	 my...	 Both	 of	 my
grandparents	were	farmers,	too.

I	guess	that's	also	one	of	the	major	factors,	I	guess,	if	you	could	call	it	that,	of	a	healthy
mind	 is	 to	 live	 in	 the	countryside	 in	a	more	organic,	holistic	environment,	whereas	the
cities	 being	 unnatural	 and	 artificial,	 they	 condition	 your	mind	 to	 be	 very	 deviant	 from
living	 an	 authentic	 life	 according	 to	 your	 own	 nature,	 because	 obviously	 nobody	 was
ever	born	in	a	city	as	an	organism.	You're	not	suited	to	living	in	a	chaotic	environment	of
that	nature.	Right,	and,	you	know,	what	Southerner	mentioned	about	my,	you	know,	with
your	 family	 or	 whatever,	 it's	 sort	 of	 like	 my	 family,	 they're	 either	 liberals	 or	 they're



Christians,	basically.

It's	 like	you're	either	one	or	 the	other,	and	 I'm	not	either,	 so	 I'm	sort	of	 like	 the	black
sheep	of	my	family,	in	a	way.	Go	on.	But	yeah,	that's	probably	the	only	downside	of	my
dad's	side	of	the	family.

But	 other	 than	 that,	 they	 were,	 you	 know,	 they're	 very	 naturally	 skilled	 in	 hunting,
farming,	you	know,	just	being	self-sustainable	in	that	sense.	Of	course,	my	grandfather
was	drafted	in	the	Second	World	War,	probably	done	so	on	purpose	because	for	being	a
white,	 self-sustainable	 farmer.	 Yeah,	 the	 Jews	 really	 look	 down	 on	 people	 like	 that	 for
whatever	reason.

Well,	 I	 think	 the	 reason	 is,	 as	 others	 have	 speculated,	 is	 because	 the	 independent
farmer,	I	think	that's	even	in	Mein	Kampf,	it	said	the	independent	farmer	is	the	basis	of
society.	They	are,	if	you	think	about	it,	because	if	you	don't	have	the	farmer,	where	are
you	going	to	get	your	 food?	Well,	 that's	sort	of	what	Stalin	did,	where	he	made	all	 the
farms,	 you	know,	publicly	owned	or	whatever.	And	 that	basically	 took	 that,	 you	know,
idea	of	private	property	away.

And	 that's	kind	of	what	 they	want,	 is	 they	have	a	communistic	mind.	So	 they	want	 to
basically	 own	 everything	 and	 have	 everything	 for	 you	 know,	 like	 you	 have	 something
that	 I	 don't	 have.	And	 then	 they	have	 that	 envious,	 you	 know,	 attitude	 towards	 those
that	have	something	that	they	don't.

They	don't	want	independence	because	they	know	that	that's	the	greatest	threat	to	their
powers.	People	who	live	in	the	country	are	typically	of	a	more	strong	and	healthy	nature
and	don't	get	so	easily	sucked	into	deviant,	twisted	ways	of	life	like	intellectuals	who	live
in	the	city.	And	so	that's	why	they	want	to	strike	against	the	middle,	against	the...	A	lot
of	city	types	don't	have	a	lot	of	life	experience,	such	as	us.

Yeah,	 that's	why,	 that's	why	 they're	so	easily	manipulated.	They're	easily	manipulated
because	 in	 their	mind,	 you	 know,	 reality	 is	 just	 this	 Freemasonic	 shopping	mall.	 It's	 a
theater	of	the	real.

You	know,	 it's	whatever,	whatever	 the	control...	Whatever	makes	you	 feel	good.	Yeah,
whatever...	Whatever,	 if	you	don't	 like	reality,	change	the	channel.	 If	you	don't	 like	 to,
you	know,	see	what's	going	on	around	here,	then	you	can	move	over	there.

You	know,	you	go	to	the	downtown	and	drink	your	 liquor.	And	then	when	you're	done,
you	 can	 go	 hide	 out	 in	 your	 suburb	 or	 something	 like	 that,	 or	 whatever,	 in	 your
bohemian	district,	you	know,	across	the	river	or	something	away	from	where	all	the	bad
people	live.	That's	sort	of	the	way	most	city	dwellers	think,	you	know,	that	they're,	they
typically,	 at	 least	 from	 the	middle	 class,	 they're	 always	 hiding	 away	 in	 their	 suburbs,
usually.



And	they	only	go	into	like	the	downtown	areas	when	they	work	or	when	they're	going	to
like	 an	 entertainment	 venue.	 Yeah,	 the	 bourgeois	 types.	 Yeah,	 and	 then	 when	 their
offices	 are	 shut	 down,	 then	 they're	 all	 basically	 commuting	 back	 to	 suburbia	 and	 the
whole	downtown...	They	move	away	from	their	non-white	brethren.

Yeah,	 hypocrisy,	 basically.	 Yeah,	 they're	 the	 biggest	 hypocrites.	 Yeah,	 the	 champagne
socialist	types.

That's	why	you	always	want	 to	get	 rid	of	 the	people	 in	 the	 rural	areas.	And	where	 I'm
contemplating	going,	the	politicians	there,	they're	trying	to,	you	know,	just	like	they	are
everywhere,	 to	 create	 these	 smart	 cities	 and	 force	 the	 people	 off	 the	 land	 through
countless	 regulations	 and,	 you	 know,	 even	 insidious	 criminal	 activities,	 like	 dumping
poison	on	their	 farmlands	and	slaughtering	their	cattle.	You	know,	they	could	be	doing
that	with	the	chemtrails.

Yeah,	that's	exactly	what	they're	doing.	 If	you	 look	up	the	case	of	this	guy	named	this
farmer	 named	 Werner	 Bock,	 B-O-C-K,	 his	 farm	 was	 basically	 totally	 sabotaged	 by	 all
these	gang	stalkers	who	are	all	like	the	hired	goons	of	Freemasons.	They	have	a	bunch
of	Chinese	pilots	flying	over	the	land,	dumping	poisons	on	it.

And	then	they	go	there	and	they	use	like	directed	energy	weapons	to	kill	the	cattle	and
so	forth.	Yeah,	that's	pretty	disgusting.	Yeah,	so	basically	that's	what	they	do.

Or	 they'll	 just	even	assassinate	 the	 farmers,	 too,	because	 I	heard	 that	 there	are	some
other	people	who	had	just...	Kind	of	like	what	happened,	what's	going	on	in	South	Africa,
how	 they	 use	 the	 Negroes	 to	 kill	 off	 the	white	 farmers.	 Yeah,	 and	 I	 think	 that's	 what
they're	 going	 to	 do,	 if	 not	 what	 they're	 already	 doing.	 I've	 heard	 some	 incidents	 in
Canada	about	how	they	use	the	Redskins,	you	know,	raiding	the	farms	and	so	forth,	and
just	going	up	to	people's	isolated	properties	and	so	on.

That's	 pretty	much	 the	 standard	 operating	 procedure	 of	 the	 Jew,	 is	 to	 use	 these	 non-
whites	 as	 like	 a	 bio-weapon	 to	 destroy	 white	 people.	 On	 the	 one	 hand,	 through
Christianity	and	liberalism,	oh,	open	up	your	hearts,	be	loving,	peace,	compassion.	And
then	what	 that	does,	once	 they're	 in	 there,	 then	 they	can	be	used	 to	create	 low-scale
crime	and	violence	on	a	continual	basis,	rape,	drug	dealing,	murdering.

And	then,	of	course,	draining	the	system	through	the	welfare,	building	up	their	numbers
and	ranks.	And	then	 from	there,	 I'm	sure	 the	 Jews	already	have	them	all	 in	place	with
their	 gangs.	 And	most	 of	 those	gangs	 are	 probably	 created	by	 Jews	 in	 the	 first	 place,
Crips	and	Bloods	and	Gangster	Disciples	and	MS-13	and	whatever	else.

And	then	from	there,	they'll	just	give	them	a	signal	to	go	and	kill	once	they	get	a	critical
mass.	You're	braining	your	mind	to	have	a	suicidal	mindset,	to	basically	 just	sort	of	 let
your	 emotions	 take	 the	wheel	 and	 let	 your	 enemies	walk	 all	 over	 you	and,	 you	know,



love	your	enemies,	 you	know,	 turn	 the	other	 cheek.	Yeah,	 I	 think	 that's	 sort	of	a	very
self-defeatist	mindset.

You	 know,	 it's	 not	 healthy	 for	 anyone	 to	 think	 like	 that.	 It's	 suicidal,	 basically.	 It's
suicidal.

Yeah,	that's	why	Klassen—	That's	the	easiest	way	for	them	to	pretty	much	wipe	us	out.
Klassen	 had	 a	 good	 reputation	 in	 Christianity	 with	 his	 creed,	 the	 White	 Man's	 Bible.
That's	definitely	a	better	Bible	than	the	King	James	Bible	or	whatever.

Right,	yeah.	 I	heard	King	 James	was	actually	a	homosexual	as	well,	as	probably—	You
know,	there	is	actually	a	quote	in	the	Bible,	if	I	can	remember,	there's	something	about,
like,	dressing	up	boys	in	gay	clothing.	Quote!	This	is	a	quote.

I	think	I	found	out	about	this	quote	from	one	of	Drew	Bergstein's	videos.	You'll	have	to
look	up	on	his	channel.	It's	pretty	interesting.

And	I	looked	at—I	didn't	believe	it	at	first,	so	I	grabbed—	I	actually	do	have	a	copy	of	the
Bible	 for,	 like,	 reference	 purposes.	 So	 I	 go	 over	 and	 grab	 the	 book,	 open	 it	 up	 to	 the
exact	verse,	and	yeah,	it's	pretty	much	along	the	lines	of	that.	Well,	there	was	one	where
—	It's	pretty	much	just	nothing.

Yeah.	Yeah,	the	whole	Bible	 is	basically	 just	a	tangled	skein	of	various	perversions	and
sneakiness,	 and	 then	 a	 lot	 of	 crazy	 messianic	 prophecies	 and	 worshiping,	 you	 know,
these	magic	man	in	the	sky,	and	the	magic	man's	going	to	kill	this,	and	he	says,	destroy
that.	But	when	you	actually	read	it	for	yourself,	can	I	interject?	Oh,	they	stage,	you	know,
like	generational	warfare,	like	Luke	14	26.

If	anyone	comes	to	me	and	does	not	hate	father	and	mother,	wife	and	children,	brothers
and	sisters,	yes,	even	their	own	life,	such	a	person	cannot	be	my	disciple.	So	basically,
it's	pushing	you	to	hate	yourself	and	hate	your	family	and	basically	just	self-destruction.
Go	on.

Anyhow,	I	was	going	to	say	that	once	you	actually	read	the	Bible	for	yourself,	you	begin
to	realize	that	it's	a	very	contradictory	book.	Yeah,	not	just	between	the	Old	and	the	New
Testaments,	but	throughout—	No,	it's	all	around.	It's	very	inconsistent.

It's	 just	 very	 inconsistent,	 and	 that's	 because	 a	 lot	 of	 these	 own	 stories	 and	whatnot,
quotes	 or	 whatnot	 are	 stolen	 from	 other	 cultures,	 really.	 Yeah,	 there's	 a	 really	 good
book.	I	think	it's	about	40	pages	called	The	Great	Jewish	Mask.

I	guess	you're	familiar	with	that	book.	Um,	I	think	I've	heard	of	 it.	Yeah,	 it	was	done	in
audiobook	format	by	Jan	Lamprecht,	some	South	African	author.

He	 basically	 just	 proved	 that	 the	 Bible	 was	 basically	 just	 thieved	 from	 Babylon	 and



Greece	and	various	other	areas	of	 the	ancient	world,	 that	all	 these	stories	 just	derived
from	 there,	 basically	 verbatim	 in	 some	 cases.	 They	 just	 changed	a	 couple	words	here
and	there	and,	you	know,	so	forth.	Changed	names.

Yeah,	there's	also—	You	know.	Go	on.	It's	just	doing	the	thing.

I'm	going	to	add,	let's	delay.	You	know	the	story	about	Abraham	sacrificing	his	son	Isaac
to	God?	Well,	about	Abraham,	it	doesn't	make	sense	about	that,	is	that	there's	a	story	in
that	 about	 Abraham	 and	 Sarah	 having	 a	 child	 at	 the	 age	 of	 90.	 I	mean,	 that	 doesn't
sound	very	realistic.

And	 then	another	 one	would	be,	 like,	Methuselah	 living	 to	900	years	old.	 I	mean,	 you
know,	things	of	that	sort	just,	you	know,	it	could	just	be	because	I	look	at	things	from	a,
you	know,	whether	or	not	 it's	realistic	and	could	happen.	 It	 just	sounds	 like	a	bunch	of
fiction,	really.

And	 I	 think	 that,	 you	know,	 there	 really	 isn't	 any	proof.	 You	 can	even	go	back	 to	 that
time	period.	There	isn't	really	any	proof	that	any	of	this	stuff	really	happened.

Like,	 they're	 sort	 of	 like	 when	 the	 Roman	 emperors	 were	 alive,	 there	 were	 actually
documents	 from	that	 time	period,	you	know,	 like	Levy	and,	you	know,	Tacitus	or	what
have	you,	you	know,	actual	documents	that	these	Roman	emperors	existed.	Meanwhile,
when	 Jesus	Christ	existed,	 there	were	no	statues,	 there	were	no	written	proof	of	 really
any	of	that.	That's	because	God	said	not	to	make	graven	images.

Don't	you	know,	that's	the	only	reason	that	Jesus	existed?	Of	course,	there's	a	website,
jesusneverexisted.com.	That's	a	good	reputation	right	there.	But	maybe	we	should	 just
focus	more	on	the	non-whites	now,	because	we	understand,	obviously,	that	Christianity
is	pretty	much	like	a	baleful	influence	on	the	consciousness	of	whites.	And	that's	one	of
the	major	reasons	why	non-whites	were	allowed	into	the	countries	of	white	people,	and
why	whites	didn't	even,	didn't	just	go	around	killing	them	all	and	taking	over	totally.

Like	with	the	Monroe	Doctrine	in	the	States,	 I'm	pretty	sure	that's	got	something	to	do
with	like	the	Freemasonic	deists	who	created	America,	probably	under	the	control	of	the
Jews.	Yeah,	 they	wanted	 to	hamstring	white	people	 from	 taking	over	 the	whole	of	 the
Americas,	 because	 that	way	 they	 could	 contain	 them	within	 America.	 And,	 you	 know,
more	easily	put	them	to	use	in	creating	what	they	would	call	the	New	Jerusalem.

Yeah,	I	personally	believe	that	the	Freemasons	were	always	controlled	by	the	Jews	from
their	very	 inception,	because	 they	borrowed	a	 lot	of	 their	 symbolism	 from	 the	Knights
Templar	and	the	Rosicrucians.	And	those	societies	were	also	controlled	by	the	you-know-
who.	Yeah,	I'm	not	sure	exactly.

It's	probably	the	case,	because,	you	know,	most	of	them,	they're	following	the	same	sort
of	path,	which	is	a	pantheistic	naturalism	slash	mother	goddess	worship	slash	becoming



a	god,	you	know,	the	sort	of	theurgical,	whatever	you	want	to	call	that,	being	a	member,
a	priest	of	the	Order	of	Melchizedek,	or	a	sort	of	bail	priest	type	figure,	where	they're	the
consort	 of	 the	mother	 goddess.	 And	 that's	 the	 whole	 gimmick	 with	 them,	 is	 using	 all
sorts	of	 like	sodomic	rituals	and	so	 forth	 in	order	 to	 transmute	their	consciousness.	So
it's	all	pretty	much	a	parallel	throughout	history.

That's	a	golden	cord,	I	guess	you	could	call	it.	It's	more	like	a	red	cord	for	the	most	part.
And	 they're	 either	 involved	 in	 themselves	 in	 all	 sorts	 of	 demonic	 practices	 related	 to
human	sacrifice,	which	Jews	have	always	been	involved	in.

Oh,	 it's	 been	 documented	 for	 centuries.	 Oh	 yeah,	 there's	 quite	 a	 few	 books	 on	 that.
Helmut	 Schramm,	 Jewish	 ritual	 murder,	 Arnold	 Lise,	 My	 Reflections	 on	 Jewish	 Ritual
Murder	in	Jail.

Where	do	you	think	the	depiction	of	vampires	came	from?	Well,	exactly,	yeah.	The	Jews,
they	made	all	 that	stuff	up	themselves	 too,	a	 lot	of	 these	novels	and	movies,	because
that's	 the	way	 they	have	of	 revealing	 themselves	 to	 other	 people	 for	 saying,	 here	we
are,	you	know,	where	we're	hiding	in	sight.	We're	letting	you	know	what	we're	doing	to
you	before	we	do	it.

Basically	 predictive	 programming.	 Yeah,	 therefore	 it's	 your	 fault,	 because	we	 told	 you
what	we	were	doing	to	you,	so	you	didn't	understand	it	exactly	and	didn't	do	anything
about	it.	Now	we're	exempt	from	our	karma,	apparently.

According	to	9-11	too,	you	know,	before	the	incident	even	occurred,	they	put	tons	and
tons	of	references	of	it	going	to	happen	in	the	past,	just	in	like	magazines,	TV	shows	and
whatnot.	Just	very	subtle,	subtle	imagery.	Yeah,	and	even	not	so	subtle.

Even	not	 so	 subtle,	 yeah.	 There's	 an	 album	where	 he's	 standing	 on,	 he's	wearing	 red
clothes	 and	 red	 shoes,	 and	he's	 dancing	 on	 a	 checkerboard	 and	 there's	 towers	 in	 the
background.	 There's	 this	 one	 painting	 of	 the	 Cookie	 Monster	 from	 Sesame	 Street
destroying	the	Twin	Towers.

Stepping	through	New	York.	He's	like	really	huge	and	it's	kind	of	discover,	so	yeah.	Yeah,
everything	with	them,	all	their	pop	culture	is	basically	just	predictive	programming.

That's	 why	 it	 becomes	 questionable	 whether	 anyone	 should	 even	 waste	 their	 time
reading	or	watching	anything,	because	it's	all	sort	of	garbled	up	and,	you	know,	confused
by	them.	 I'd	say	definitely	stay	away	 from	watching	TV	and	Hollywood	movies.	Yeah,	 I
stopped	watching	movies	in	like	early	2000s.

It's	 just,	 I	could	just...	 I	did	around	the	late	2000s,	which	I	was	still	pretty	young	at	the
time,	surprisingly.	Well,	how	old	are	you	right	now?	Or	do	you	want	to	review	it?	I'm	26
right	now.	So	you're	like	a	decade	younger	than	me.



So	for	that	reason,	obviously,	yeah,	that's	the	same	thing	as	the,	more	or	less	the	same
time	as	 I	got	 rid	of	 it	 in	my	 life,	 like	around	 the	age	of	17.	 I	 sort	of	 just	 felt	 like	 I	was
being	spoon	fed	and	didn't	pertain	to	reality.	It	was	just	all	scripted	and	contrived.

Well,	I	guess	we	could	continue	to	move	on	to	the	non-white,	try	to	focus	on	that.	Yeah.
So	it	all	sort	of	ties	in	together	in	terms	of	experiences.

This	is	the	one	of	the	major,	if	not	the	major	weapon	that	the	Jews	are	using	is	to	use	the
non-whites	against	us	by	vilifying	us	and	portraying	us	as	villains	who	have	harmed	the
non-white	in	some	way	and	instilling	in	the	consciousness	of	the	non-white,	that	they've
got	some	entitlement,	that	they	have	an	entitlement	to	attack	us	or	to	pay	us	back.	So	I
guess	we	can	start,	since	Southerner	hasn't	spoken	over	much,	we	can	continue	then	to
reveal	more	of	 your	personal	 experiences	and	 then	we'll	 try	 to	pass	 it	 around	here	 to
shed	 some	 insight	 onto	 their	 psycho-biology	 and	 what	 can	 be	 done	 about	 them,	 if
anything.	So,	yeah.

So	 when	 it	 comes	 to	 the	 Negro,	 working	 with	 these	 beastmen,	 savages,	 it's	 just
burdensome	at	the	end	of	the	day.	I	mean,	there's	just	nothing	these	people	can	really
do	to	act.	They	don't	actually	work.

That's	 the	 thing.	 It's	 like	 they're	 getting	 paid	 to	 just	 be	 there	 because	 of	 affirmative
action	laws	that	are	used	to	hinder	us.	You	know?	Yeah,	what's	funny	about	that	is	they
would	complain.

It's	slave	labor.	Yeah,	and	they	would	complain.	You	have	to	work	three	times	a	week.

Sorry,	go	on.	You	have	to	work	three	times	as	hard	 just	to	get	things	done	so	you	can
actually	get	a	break	for	yourself.	But	no,	these	niggers,	they	just	like	to	come	and	maybe
do	a	little	bit	of	work	for	five	or	ten	minutes	and	then	they	just	wander	off	for	hours	upon
hours.

But	no	one	does	anything	about	it,	nor	no	one	complains.	No	one	is	against	this.	Yeah,	I
was	just	going	to	say	that	they	also—	They're	clearly	plates	and	pieces	of	shit.

They	also	complain	about	not	being	paid	enough.	Yeah,	I'm	sorry.	Go	ahead.

I	was	just	saying,	 I	was	just	throwing	this	 in	there,	they	also	would	complain	about	not
being	paid	enough	despite	working	so	full.	Dude,	this	negro,	he's	like,	oh,	I	don't	make
enough	money.	Yeah,	he	actually	has	more	hours	than	I	do,	but	he	doesn't	work	as	much
as	I	do.

So	he's	actually	probably	making	more	than	I	am.	And	that's	the	whole	error,	I	guess	you
could	 say,	 about	 calculating	 wages	 based	 on	 simply	 man	 hours	 instead	 of	 actual
productivity.	Exactly.



Because	 that's	 how	 it	 should	 be	measured.	 If	 you	 don't	 produce	 anything,	 just	 sitting
around	 in	 some	 lazy	 office	 job	 or	 wherever	 in	 any	 job,	 obviously	 you're	 not	 doing
anything	at	all,	so	you	can't	call	 it	work,	so	you	shouldn't	be	rewarded	or	remunerated
for	not	doing	anything.	Exactly,	budget	needless	micro-management,	jobs	like	that.

I	 think	 that's	 basically	 the	 nature	 of	 the	 non-white,	 because	 they're	 organically
developed	 in	warmer	areas,	 typically,	 that	 in	 those	areas,	 they	don't	 really	have	 to	do
any	work,	whether	we	want	to	look	upon	them	as	having	evolved	or	whatever,	developed
somehow	through	whatever	process,	not	necessarily	Darwinian	evolution,	but	 they	are
who	 they	 are,	 and	 they've	 lived	 in	 those	 conditions	 for	 a	 very	 long	 time,	 in	 warm
conditions	where	they	could	just	reach	up	on	the	vine	and	snatch	off	a	banana	or	go	and
throw	 a	 rock	 at	 some	 animal	 and	 rip	 out	 its	 flesh	 when	 they	 get	 hungry,	 or	 have	 a
butcher	 shop,	 like	 that	 book,	 The	Negroes	 in	Negro	 Land	by	Hilton	 and	Hotema.	 They
could	have	a	butcher	shop	of	their	own	people	there,	where	they	have	whole	thighs	and
body	 parts	 hanging	 on	 down,	 and	 so	 on.	 Yeah,	 they're	 basically	 built	 to	 live	 in	 very
extreme	 situations,	 well,	 yeah,	well,	 they're	 built	 to	 live	 in,	 yeah,	 in	 climate-	 Extreme
environments.

Yeah,	in	climatic	conditions	where	things	are	comparatively	easy,	where	there's	a	super
abundance	of	fauna	that	they	can	feast	on,	fish	and	animals	and	whatever,	monkeys	and
so	 forth	 in	 the	 jungle,	 not	 necessarily	 in	Africa,	 but	 everywhere	 in	 South	America	 and
wherever,	and	so	for	that	reason,	they've	had	an	easy	life,	or	we	could	speak	of	it	from	a
more	 esoteric	 standpoint,	 that	 what	 most	 of	 them	 are	 is	 a	 result	 of	 devolution	 or
involution,	which	is	where	the	whites	 interbred	with	them,	or	the	whites	were	killed,	or
maybe	they	voluntarily	interbred	with	them,	and	then	that	led	to	a	sort	of	degradation	of
their	 soul,	 where	 they	 don't	 have	 any	 spirit,	 they	 don't	 have	 any	will,	 any	motivating
principle	that	motivates	them	to	achieve	something	beyond	the	immediate	moment,	so
they're	sort	of	trapped	in	this	state	of	imminent	consciousness,	where	whatever	they	see
is	 all	 reality	 is,	 there's	 no	 imagination,	 there's	 no	 future,	 no	 past,	 it's	 just	 whatever
exists.	Yeah,	you	tend	to	realize	that	they	really	do	not	think	about	consequences	or	the
future	very	much,	which	is	probably	why	they	end	up	getting	themselves	in	trouble	quite
a	bit.	Yeah,	they're	emotionally	reactive	because	they	don't	have	a	development.

And	when	they	get	caught	doing	these	things,	 they	 just	act	 like	 they're	 innocent,	 they
actually	believe	that	they've	done	nothing	wrong.	Exactly,	didn't	do	nothing.	And	that's,
of	 course,	 because	 they	are	basically	what	 is	 called	an	empiric,	 in	 Elizabethan	 jargon,
basically	some	being	who	is	just	like	an	animal,	basically,	that	just	reacts	to	stimuli	and
acts	according	to	weather	conditions	or	momentary	stimuli,	impulse.

They	 don't	 have	 any	 impulse	 control,	 they	 don't	 have	 any	 will,	 higher	 consciousness.
They're	very	self-centered	as	well.	Yeah,	so	to	the	extent	that	they	don't	even	really	care
about	their	own	people	at	all,	except	as	a	means	to	profit	themselves.



So	they're	always	like,	yeah,	yeah,	black	lives	matter	because	it's	like	a	state	breach	or
something.	But	the	reality	is,	obviously,	 it	only	matters	because	it	refers	to	themselves
as	 an	 individual	 ego,	 but	 they	 don't	 really	 care	 about	 their	 own	 people.	 And	 that's
depicted	in	the	Turner	Diaries	where	when	they're	being	kicked	out	of	Los	Angeles,	they
just	sort	of	like	have	their	old	Negroes	smashing	their	heads	on	the	ground	and	they're
just	laughing	at	them	and	so	forth.

I	don't	know,	have	either	of	you	experienced	anything	like	that,	like	witnessing	their	lack
of	regard	for	themselves?	Well,	a	lot	of	times	when	fights	would	break	out	when	I	was	in
school,	 it	 was	 pretty	 predictable	 about	 who	 generally	 were	 fighting	 each	 other.	 Yeah.
That's	basically	in	their	nature.

Or	their	emotional	outbursts,	just	over	stupid	things,	you	know?	Yeah.	There's	a	bit,	it's
just	 very	 emotional.	 You'll	 probably	 notice	 them	 just	 start	 smashing,	 just	 banging	 on
things	randomly.

Yeah.	I	saw	this	one	incident	of	a	couple	of	red-skinned	females	who	were	just	screaming
and	shouting	at	each	other	like	banshees	and	like	scratching	each	other.	And	then	they
fell	 on	 the	 ground	 and	 one	 of	 them	 was	 smashing	 the	 other	 one's	 head	 against	 the
concrete.

And	 then	when	 they	parted,	 like	animals	 sort	of	 scattering,	 then	 the	one	who	had	her
head	smashed	against	the	concrete	just	sort	of	like	popped	up	and	then	she's	like,	fuck
you,	eh?	And	then	they	just	went	away.	Like	there	was	nothing,	you	know,	just	like	par
for	the	course,	basically.	Because	that's	their	culture.

In	this	country,	I've	heard	that	the	red-skinned	males,	they	basically	fight	each	other	to
the	 death	 for	 females	 on	 their	 reserves.	 So	 they're	 basically	 like	 selected	 for	 violence
and	aggression.	And	they	just	like	dispose	of	the	corpse	of	the	one	that	loses	the	war.

Yeah.	They're	pretty	brain	dead.	Yeah,	there's	all	sorts	of	incidents	that	happened	to	me
here	with	the	redskins.

Like	my	uncle-	 I've	heard	of	 the	Pollocks	 too.	What's	 that?	So	 they're	major	alcoholics
too.	Yeah,	a	lot	of	people	call	them	chugs	here	because	they're	always	chugging	liquor.

In	my	hometown,	 there's	 this	brand	of	alcohol	 that	 they	would	always	buy	called	Cold
Duck.	And	it's	this,	you	know,	really	cheap	wine	or	something	like	that.	And	they	would
just	like	throw	the	bottles	all	over	the	ground	in	my	hometown.

And	I	would	go	around	with	a	baseball	bat	smashing	the	bottles.	Just	out	of	amusement.
Yeah,	my	uncle,	he	had	his	fly	and	fishing	cap	burnt	to	the	ground	by	a	redskin	before.

Oh,	that	sucks.	Yeah,	but	he	just	set	it	up	again.	Another	one.



It's	 pretty	 funny	where	 I'm	 from	 is	 the	most	 famous	 so-called	 native	 artist	 in	 Canada.
He's	from	there.	And	my	father's...	What's	that?	So	what	did	you	say?	The	most	famous
native	artist	in	Canada.

You	know,	they're	famous	for	their	paintings,	right?	In	this	country.	Or	at	least	they	were.
I	don't	know	if	they	still	are.

But	that's	what	the	Jews	always	do.	They	portray	the	non-white	as	a	sort	of	superstar	of
whatever.	You	know,	if	they	manage	to	make	some	shitty	little	painting	or	something	like
that.

Yeah,	 we'll	 pay	 you	 bronze.	 Pretty	 much.	 If	 you	 look	 up	 this	 guy	 named	 Norval
Morisseau,	he's	one	of	the	most	famous	redskin	painters	in	Canada.

And	my	father's	aunt	saved	his	life	when	he	was	in	a	drunken	state.	He	was	like	freezing
to	death.	And	then	she	brought	him	in	so	he	wouldn't	freeze	to	death.

And	my	dad	had	 like	an	art	gallery	and	he	would	sell	 redskin	paintings.	He	would	 just
give	them	like	bottles	of	liquor	for	their	paintings.	Weren't	you	mentioning	that	your	dad
was	selling	like	a	bunch	of	that	kind	of	garbage	literature	like	Charles	Bukowski	and	stuff
like	that?	Yeah,	well,	my	dad	reads	that.

He	reads	like	Che	Guevara	and	stuff	like	that	literature.	He's	even	got	books.	He's	even
got	books.

Or	like	commie	literature.	Yeah,	pretty	much.	Or	like	communist	literature.

It	is.	He	is	basically	a	communist,	but	he's	another	typical	champagne	socialist	scum	who
like	drank	over	a	million	dollars	of	his	parents'	money	and	so	forth.	But,	you	know,	that's
the	hypocrisy	of	liberals	of	that	kind	is	that,	you	know,	they're	pretending	that	they're	all
about	they	have	such	regard	for	the	innocent	nonwhite.

And	yet	they're,	you	know,	buying	up	their	paintings	for	like	bottles	of	liquor.	And	then
he	he	 lets	 the	Redskins	go	 into	his	washroom	 in	his	 store	and	 they	 just	 smear	shit	all
over	 the	walls	of	his	washroom.	Yeah,	 that's	 like	when	 I	was	 in	middle	school,	where	 I
basically,	you	know,	there	weren't	very	many	white	kids	there	really	at	all.

And	 I	 had	 some	 classes	 where	 I	 was	 the	 only	 white	 kid	 in	 the	 room.	 And	 basically,
whenever	I	go	to	the	bathroom,	people	would	be	like	they	would	be	smoking	or	they'd	be
rubbing	shit	on	the	walls.	It	was	really	just	horrible.

So	that's	a	lot	of	mestizos,	right	where	around	you	are?	Yeah,	yeah.	Yeah,	I	never	really
care	for	those	types	either.	You	have	an	idea	of	where	I'm	at.

Yeah.	Saying	too	much.	It's	like,	you	know,	you're	I'm	basically	on	the	other	side	of	the,
you	know,	country.



The	 Freemasonic	 shopping	mall.	 Yeah,	 you're	 in	 the	 barrio	 buying	 all	 the	maracas	 or
whatever	the	tortillas	and	so	forth.	And	he's	in	the	other	area	there.

Yeah,	you're	more	in	the	jungle.	Yeah.	Welcome	to	the	jungle.

Mm	hmm.	So	is	there	a	lot	of	gang	activity	where	you	guys	are?	Well,	basically,	I	went	to
school	with	a	lot	of	types	who	would	kind	of	pretend	like	they	were	bloods	or	whatever.	A
lot	of	like	cholo	types.

And	 basically,	 this	 one	 guy,	 you	 know,	 there	 were	 a	 few	 people	 where	 they	 were
expelled	because	they	had	a	knife	or	whatever	at	school.	And	I	would	always	be	called
by	 these	people,	 a	 school	 shooter,	 because	 I	was	 like	 the	 introverted	white	 kid.	And	 I
didn't	really	talk	much.

And	so	cholo	kids	would	always	say,	like,	oh,	school	shooter,	school	shooter.	And	I	would
basically	say,	you	know,	shut	the	fuck	up.	And	then	they	would	like,	you	know,	look	back
at	me	like	they	were	surprised	because,	you	know,	they're	so	used	to	pushing	the	white
guy	around.

Yeah,	 they're	 not	 used	 to	 seeing	 white	 people	 stand	 up	 for	 themselves.	 I	 know
Joubergstein	had	a	video	where	it	showed	some	Negro	mouthing	off	to	a	white	guy	and
then	a	white	guy	just	knocked	him	out.	Probably	deserved	it.

So	there's	no	gangs	around	where	you	guys	are?	There	probably	are	near	this	within	like
the	southern	part	of	the	city	near	my	area.	It	wouldn't	surprise	me	because	there's	a	lot
of	 crime	 in	 the	 area.	 And	 surprise,	 surprise,	 there's	 a	 bunch	 of	 niggers,	 pretty	 much
nothing	but	niggers	around	there.

And	I've	had	to	drive	there	a	few	times.	And	the	thing	about	entering	a	Negro	ridden	city
is	that	you	can	just	sense	that	it	just	feels	lifeless.	You	can	even	sense	that	the	color	is
just	sapped	out.

You	can	sense	the	sort	of	 low	vibrational	 frequency.	Exactly.	When	you	compare	 it,	 for
example,	 if	 you're	 driving	 through	 like	 an	 affluent	 suburb	 or,	 you	 know,	 whatever,	 a
regular	middle-class	white	suburb	and	the	vibrations	pick	up	and	then	you	go	down	into
the	downtown	and	then	you	sense	this	sort	of	like,	you	know,	sort	of	anchorage.

Yeah.	You	sense	this	sort	of	 like	a	violent	aggression,	 like	you're	attacked	almost.	And
then	 if	 you	 go	 off	 into	 the	 countryside	where	 there's	 less	 than	most	 people,	 then	 the
vibrations,	you	know,	it	literally	feels	like	you're	opening	up.

Yeah.	Because	they're	probably	thought	forms	that	are	generated	by	these	beings,	that,
you	 know,	 the	 denizens	 of	 whatever	 environment.	 And	 that,	 you	 know,	 that	 is	 either
harmonious	or	inharmonious	thought	form.



Which	doesn't	mean,	 you	know,	 sugar-coated	Christian	 lions	 lying	down	with	 lambs.	 It
means,	you	know,	things	work	together	harmoniously.	You	know,	like	a	lion	eats	a	lamb,
a	lamb	flees	from	a	lion.

And	they,	you	know,	they	all	have	a	sort	of	agreement,	implied	agreement.	That's	what
the	country	offers.	But	when	you	go	into	the	city,	which	is	an	artificial	environment,	then
you	have	the,	you	know,	sort	of	chaotic	thought	forms	that	bombard	your	consciousness.

That	are	manifested	into	reality.	Yeah.	And	you	can	see	that	too	in	the	case	of	jails.

That's	why	they	usually	have	jails	and	prisons	built	far	away	from	people.	Either	that,	or
they'll	 build	 it	 right	 around	where	 there's	 like	a	 river	 so	 that	 it	 can	 carry	away	all	 the
negative	energy.	Because	the	flow	of	the	river	will,	you	know,	dissipate	that.

So	 that's	 one	 of	 the	 reasons	 why	 any	 multi-cultist	 society	 will	 never	 work.	 Because
there's	different	vibrational	frequencies.	Yeah,	they	just	sort	of	clash	against	each	other.

Yeah.	And	once	you're,	when	you're	in	an	environment	and	even	babies	and	children	can
understand,	especially	white	babies	who	have	a	higher	consciousness,	they	can	pick	up
that,	whatever	you	want	to	call	it,	that	discord	of,	you	know,	discordant	vibrations.	And
so	you	see	that	with	little	Jew	children	too.

Like	I	walk	around	and	I'll	have	these	little	Jew	children	just	sort	of	like	come	at	me.	Like
they're	trying	to	attack	me.	Like	they'll	walk	towards	you	sort	of	like	aggressively.

Well,	 that	 reminds	me	of	when	 I	was	 in	 the	 fourth	grade.	Are	 they'll	sort	of	hawk	over
you?	What's	that?	 I	said,	or	the	 Jew	children	will	 just	hawk	over	you.	Like	they	want	to
just	control	every	aspect	of	your	life.

Usually	kind	of	very	controlling.	Like	I,	when	I	was	in	fourth	grade,	I	had	this,	there	was
this	angry	Jewish	kid	and	there	was	this	scrawny,	like	kind	of,	kind	of	German	kid	that	he
would	always	like	harass	regularly	and	yell	at	him	and	punch	him.	And,	you	know,	the	kid
was	certainly,	you	know,	the	German	kid,	he	was	certainly	very	sensitive	and	very	like,
he	was	a	bit	of	an	odd	guy,	but	he	was	very	sensitive.

And	like,	he	would	take	that	stuff	personally.	And	basically	one	day	this,	you	know,	this
angry	Jewish	kid	kept	punching	him.	One	day	when	there	was	this	trip,	this	camping	trip,
and	there	were	a	bunch	of	kids	stuck	in	the	tree	or	whatever,	and	he	was	punching	him
on	the	tree.

And	 then	basically	he	ended	up	being	expelled	because	he	kept	harassing	and	yelling
and	 berating	 this	 kid	 the	 whole	 time.	 Yeah,	 that's	 sort	 of	 their	 nature.	 When	 they're
younger,	 they're	 not	 as	 subtle	 because	 they	 haven't	 developed,	 you	 know,	 sufficient
subtlety,	but	their	true	personality	comes	out.



That's	why	 if	 you	 look	 at	 younger	 people	 in	 general,	 you	 can	 see	 the	 inner	 nature	 of
them	come	out	more	explicitly,	I	guess	you	could	say,	because	it's	not	bound	up	with	all
sorts	of	varied	experiences.	It's	more	like	a	raw	state	of	being.	Right.

Yeah,	it	was	a	show	that	Jews	and	whites	are	cosmic	enemies.	Pretty	much.	I	definitely
think	 that	 the	 conception	 of	 Bill	White,	 that	 basically	 Jews	 derived	 from	 some	 type	 of
reptilian	aliens	or	something.

Oh,	 it	wouldn't	 surprise	me	because	 if	 you	 look	at	 these	people,	 you	can	 just	 tell	 that
they're	 just,	 they	 just	act	very	 robotic,	you	know?	Yeah,	 that's	what	Serena	would	call
them.	You	can	 just	 tell	 they're	demented	by	 looking	at	 their	eyes.	So	 I	guess	you're	 in
the	South.

What	is	going	on	there	now	that	you	see	and	that	you	anticipate	to	occur?	We'll	see	in
this	town	that	I	currently	live	in,	 I	 just	noticed,	ever	since	four	years	ago,	I	noticed	this
explosion	of	foreigners	of	all	kinds,	Negroes,	Filipinos,	Mestizos	to	a	certain	extent,	and
maybe	Jews	somewhat.	It's	just	out	of	nowhere.	Six	years	ago,	it	was	practically	a	white
ethnostate,	but	now	it's	not	so	much.

Still	majority	white,	but	you	can	definitely	 tell	 that	 these	non-whites	are	being	 flooded
from	the	city.	They're	pretty	much,	yeah,	they're	just	coming	out	of	the	city	and	flooding
this	area.	So	that's	probably	a	deliberate	plan	on	the	part	of	Jews	to	brown	out	the	area.

I	definitely	feel	like	that's	the	case.	Yeah,	I	was	liking	it	too,	sort	of	metaphorically,	like
they're	 spreading	 shit	 on	 a	 piece	 of	 white	 bread.	 They	 want	 to	 spread	 it	 as	 thin	 as
possible	or	as	 thickly	as	possible	all	 over	every	 corner	of	 the	white	bread	 so	 that	 you
can't	even	have	a	single	white	town	in	the	middle	of	nowhere	that	you	can	escape	to,	to
get	away	from	them.

So	yeah,	I	definitely	recommend	the	people	out	there	to	get	as	far	away	from	the	city	as
possible.	I'm	talking	about	like	at	least	an	hour	to	an	hour	and	a	half	away	from	a	major
city.	 Yeah,	 because	 usually	 they	 set	 up	 or	 there	 already	 exists,	 you	 know,	 bedroom
communities	and	places	that	are	 like	towns	of	maybe	10,000	outside	of	cities,	usually,
you	know,	from	whatever,	zero	to,	or,	you	know,	like	maybe	a	couple	thousand	to	10,000
or	so	within	the	first,	like	40	minutes,	45	minute	radius.

Usually,	at	 least	 that's	 the	way	 it	 is	 in	 this	country	 in	Canada.	They	usually	have	 it	all
designed	around,	 like,	you	know,	 they're	big	major	cities.	And	 then,	you	know,	around
that,	there's	like	affluent	suburbs	half	an	hour	out	or,	you	know,	half	an	hour	out	of	the
downtown	core.

And	then	half	an	hour	outside	of	that,	they'll	have	a	smaller	town	that	is	still	for	more	like
affluent	people.	So	there's	within	commuting	distance.	So	basically	what	you	want,	if	you
can	manage	 it,	 is	 to	 get	 away	 from	 the	 commuting	 zone	 because	 the	 non-whites	 are



going	to	be	typically	within	that	radius	because	the	only	thing	they	do	for	work,	if	they're
work	at	all,	they'll	just	hang	around	in	welfare,	is	basically	working	in	the	city	in	a	service
job	or	factory	or	whatever	for	the	Jews	or	some	government	job.

In	this	country,	most	of	the	government	workers	are	Jews.	And	then	under	them,	you	got
the	white	race	traders.	And	then	under	them,	you've	got	the	token	minorities.

So	 I	 guess	 the	 safest	 bet	 to	 avoid	 the	 chaos	 is	 obviously	 get	 your	 own	 farmland
somewhere	and	then	have	a	bunch	of	people	on	it.	But	even	then,	you	still	make	yourself
out	to	be	a	sort	of	a	target	though.	That's	true.

Like	Ruby	Ridge	in	Waco.	Yeah.	So	that's	why	you	don't	want	to,	you	don't	want	to	live	in
the	city,	but	at	the	same	time,	you	don't	want	to	live.

Yeah,	 the	 real	 estate	 agencies	 are	 going	 to	 know	 who's	 moving	 where	 almost
instantaneously.	Yeah,	and	all	the	realtors	are	either	Jews	or	Freemasons	probably.	Most
of	them	are	probably.

Most	 of	 them.	 It	wouldn't	 surprise	me.	 Yeah,	 that's	 been	my	 experience	when	 I	 came
here	to	this	place	as	I	wrote	about	that	autobiography	of	mine	that	I	just	did.

The	 guy	who	 is	 showing	 the	 real	 estate,	 it	 wasn't	 advertised	 this	 one	 place,	 this	 one
residence.	And	then	we	called	them	up,	 I	got	a	sensation	somehow,	almost	 like	maybe
they	were	using	synthetic	telepathy	to	 implant	this	thought	maybe	that,	oh,	we	should
call	the	real	estate	agent	again.	Maybe	there's	another	property.

And	lo	and	behold,	there	was.	And	that	property	was	like	just	within	our	budget.	Cheap,
the	cheapest,	one	of	the	cheapest	ones	in	the	whole	of	the	town.

And	the	real	estate	agent,	he	was	like	this	privileged	piece	of	shit,	liberal	who,	you	know,
whose	family	was	wealthy	and	so	 forth.	And	he	 just	had	this	sort	of	psychopathic	 little
attitude,	you	know,	like,	you	know,	I'm	better	than	everybody	else.	It's	holier	than	thou
type	of	attitude.

And	at	the	same	time,	sort	of	robotic	nature,	pretty	corrupt.	So	I'm	sensing	that	he	was
probably	 a	 Freemason	 or	 something,	 just	 given	 the	way	 he	 behaved.	 There's	 a	 lot	 of
people	around	here	that	are	like	that.

And	I	guess.	Speaking	of	Freemasons,	I've	been	noticing	a	lot	of	them	lately.	You	know
how	they'll	have	the	G	symbol	on	their	license	plates?	That's	how	I	figured	them	out.

Freemasons.	So	they're	moving	into	your	area.	I've	just	I	don't	know	about	them	moving
in	there.

Maybe	they're	recruiting	more.	You	know	what	could	be	happening	to	you?	What	could
be	happening	is	that	you're	being	gang	stalked	because	that's	what's	happening	to	me



here.	Maybe	that's	just	sort	of	within	this	area.

I	just	noticed	that	I	don't	notice	them	following	me	per	se,	but	because	you	could	never
be	sure.	Yeah,	that's	interesting.	About	that	is	when	I	was	at	the	local	Union	Cemetery	a
few	weeks	ago,	it	was	wandering	around	and	the	vast	majority	of	the	graves	there	were
Freemasons.

So	I	think	that	the	area	I'm	in	probably	has	a	good	amount	of	that	influence	and	they're
just	very	covert	about	 it.	Yeah,	my	dad's	a	good	 friend.	 I	actually	became	one	not	 too
long	ago.

I	think	he's	more	of	a	low	level	Mason,	so	he	doesn't	know	what	it's	really	about.	Yeah,	I
guess	in	the	Blue	Lodge	they	don't	really	reveal	too	much	to	them,	apparently,	but	at	the
same	time	I	climb	up	and	yeah,	they	know	what's	going	on.	Yeah,	so	what	I	was	going	to
say	 about,	 you	 know,	 the	 Freemasons,	 how	 they're	 how	 you're	 seeing	 more	 license
plates	is	that	maybe	what	they're	doing	is	just	revealing	themselves	to	you.

So	that	they	can	say	we	know	who	you	are.	We	know	where	you	are.	Here	we	are	and
and	from	there	it	escalates	because	that's	what	gang	stalking	is	all	about.

You	know,	they'll	monitor	your	every	move	and	they'll	try	to	sabotage	you	in	every	way
they	possibly	can.	Get	you	fired,	set	you	up,	and	then,	you	know,	if	you	know	about	gang
stalking.	Now	 that	 you	mentioned	gang	 stalking,	 I	 have	noticed	 these	people	 in	white
van	and	maybe	a	white	van	and	a	car	would	just	go	around	those	spy	around.

They	will	 just	creep	around	the	neighborhood.	Like	I	was	because	I	 live	in	a	gate.	Well,
not	in	a	gated	community	per	se,	but	my	property	is	gated	and	well	secured.

I	just	saw	this	this	woman.	I	don't	know	if	it's	a	woman	or	dude	per	se,	but	the	windows
on	the	vehicle	were	most	definitely	tinted,	which	is	pretty	dubious.	Yeah,	that's	what	I'm
just	sort	of.

They	were	just	sort	of	creeping	up	around	the	interest	of	my	property,	but	oh,	you	can
come	on	ahead.	As	soon	as	I	came	right,	drove	right	beside	him,	they	just	kind	of	came
up	and	came	to	this	halt,	you	know?	Yeah,	well,	 that's	to	me.	That	would	suggest	that
you're	probably	being	subjected	to	that	because	that's	the	main	technique	of	the	Jew	to
try	to	sabotage	white	people	is,	you	know,	monitor	them	all.

And	 then	 at	 a	 certain	 point,	 they're	 going	 to	 try	 to	 probably	 kill	 us	 off	 through
assassination	through	their	Mossad	and	so	forth.	Or	they	could	be	playing.	They	could	be
playing	some	sort	of	false	flag	attack.

Yeah,	well,	what	 they	 can	 do	 and	do	 do	 is	 to	 set	 people	 up	 as	 a	 Patsy	 for	 false	 flags
where	they	subject	them	to	harassment,	mind	control,	and	then	they	harass	you	to	an
extent	 where	 it	 basically	 drives	 you	 crazy.	 And	 then	 you	 try	 to	 get	 revenge	 or	 try	 to



attack	the	people	who	are	harassing	you.	And	then	they	just,	you	know,	they've	got	all
sorts	of	black	ops	operatives	around	who	will	basically	do	away	with	you.

You	know,	police	on	the	periphery	and	so	forth.	There	is	actually	a	police	officer	that	was
in	my	neighborhood	too.	Now	that	I	remember.

And	he	did	pull	me	over	 for	speeding,	which	 I	was	speeding.	 I	was	 like	10	or	15	miles
above	the	speed	limit	by	accident.	Well,	the	police,	in	my	experience,	are	basically,	if	not
wholly,	then	at	least	in	part	involved.

Oh,	they're	most	definitely	controlled.	Yep.	It's	like,	you	know,	the	boys	in	blue	serve	the
Jew,	you	know?	Yeah.

Well,	even	now,	as	we	speak.	Pretty	much	proxy	warriors	for	the	Jew.	Even	now,	as	we
speak,	 I'm	looking	out	of	the	window	and	I'm	seeing	the	gang	stalker	across	the	street
deliberately	 shoveling	 his	 snow	 right	 at	 the	 very	 moment	 that	 I	 mentioned	 that,	 you
know,	this	issue.

So	and	what	happened	yesterday	when	I	was	attempting	to	communicate	with	our	fellow
on	the	show	here,	 I	got	kicked	out.	Yeah,	basically	 right	as	we	started	recording	 it,	he
was	 signed	out.	 Yeah,	 I	 said	 I'm	going	 to	 record	now	and	 then	 they	 signed	me	out	 of
Skype.

Right	 there.	 And	 that's	 happened	 multiple	 times.	 So	 the	 thing	 is	 they're	 monitoring
electronic	communications	and	everything	else.

There's	actually	a	cell	tower	literally	blocks	away	from	my	area,	too.	So	they	could.	They
could	be	monitoring	people	that	way.

Close	proximity.	And	what	they	do,	even	though	it	sounds,	you	know,	very	exaggerated,
they	actually	set	up	those	cell	towers	around	people	who	are	targets.	I	mean,	really,	they
even	set	up	construction	sites	around	where	they	live,	too,	because	that	way	they	create
noise	pollution	in	their	area	to	deliberately	harass	them.

That's	 one	 of	 the	major	 techniques	 they	 use	 to	 perpetually	 harass	 you	 is	 deliberately
have	a	bunch	of	fake	construction	sites,	you	know,	do	it	yourself.	Yeah,	there	is	a	lot	of
construction	 not	 too	 far	 from	 the	 road.	 It's	 not	 really	 on	 the	 road	 leading	 to	 my
neighborhood,	but	it's,	you	know,	within	that	area	as	you	go	further,	further	down,	you'll
see	all	this	construction	and	nothing	ever	gets	done	as	usual.

So	long	as	you	can	hear	it	right.	Can	you	hear	the	construction	where	you	are?	No,	but
as	far	as	noises	come,	I	do	sometimes	hear	this	guy	just	blaring	this	loud	music,	music
outside.	It's	usually	around	like	10	or	11,	at	11	o'clock.

At	 night?	 Yeah,	 at	 nighttime.	 Yeah,	 that's	 probably	 something	 they're	 doing,	 too,



because	 right	what	 they	do	with	me	here,	 they'll	have	 the	 Jews	next	door	deliberately
banging	on	the	walls	to	interrupt	my	sleep,	you	know,	just	after	they	think	I've	gone	to
sleep,	maybe	half	an	hour	or	so,	they'll	start	knocking	against	the	wall	or	they'll	have	a
bunch	of	pieces	of	shit	come	around	at	night	and	start	making	noise	deliberately	to	try	to
wake	you	up.	That's	another	one	of	their	techniques.

But	they've	got	all	sorts	of	very	detailed	procedures	for	this.	What	I'll	do,	I'll-	Should	be
illegal	what	 they're	 doing.	Well,	 the	whole	 state	 is	 basically	 a	 terrorist	 organization	 at
this	point.

It's	basically	not	even	a	legitimate	government.	In	any-	Especially	in	Canada.	Yeah,	well,
basically,	yeah,	here	is	very	socialistic.

I'll	link-	Yeah,	it's	more	communistic.	I'll	link	a	channel	for	people	on	this	podcast,	so	it'll
be	down	in	the	show	notes,	to	a	gang	stalking	channel	that	goes	through	copious	details
of	what	they're	doing	and	how	they're	doing	it.	That's	very,	very	important.

Well,	we	do	know	that	there	is	a	certain	gang	stalking	channel	you	wouldn't	want	to	link
because	he's	 probably	 inoperative	 and	 shut	 your	 channel	 down.	 Probably,	well,	 he's	 a
Christian	 too,	 apparently,	 so	 that	 explains	 it.	 Even	 if	 he	were	 being	 targeted,	 being	 a
Christian	 is	 enough	 because	 they're	 hooked	 into	 the	 thought	 forms	 that	 the	 Jews
created.

Being	a	Christian	is	enough	to	be	a	backstabber.	Basically,	they'll	do	whatever	it	takes	to
you	know,	set	you	up.	Yeah,	because	it	gets	you	in	the	spirit	of	the,	you	know,	the	Jews.

Makes	you	spiritually	one	of	them,	basically.	Pretty	much.	Yeah,	speaking	about	Negroes
though,	I've	been,	you	see,	my	grandfather	from	my	mother's	side	of	the	family,	he's	not
really	my	biological	grandfather,	but	he's	a	good	man,	so	I	very	much	respect	him.

You	see	my	biological	grandfather	from	my	mother's	side	of	the	family,	apparently	he's
an	alcoholic	piece	of	shit	and	I	never	met	him	in	real	life.	So,	but	either	way,	that's	not
the	 point.	 Anyhow,	 he	was	 having	 trouble	 getting	 his	 phone	 charger	 to	work	 because
apparently	the	port	screwed	up	and	we	have,	we	do	service	with	Sprint,	right?	You	know
how	they	recently	had	the	merge	with	T-Mobile?	Yeah,	they	had	the	merge	with	T-Mobile
not	too	long	ago.

Yeah,	I	did	hear	something	about	that.	Yeah,	well	anyway.	All	my	papa	was	trying	to	do
was,	he	was	trying	to,	we're	trying	to	send	it	in	for	repair.

We	didn't	know	how	to,	so	what	would	 the	most	 logical	choice	be?	Go	up	 to	 the	store
maybe	and	see	if	they	can,	if	there's	a	technician	that	can	help	them.	Well,	of	course	the
Sprint's	 only	 Sprint	 store	 left,	 of	 course,	which	 is,	which	 is	 north	 of	 the	 city,	 that	was
closed,	that	was	closed	down	temporarily	because	they	were	rebuilding	the	store	to	be
more	like	a	T-Mobile	one.	Well,	anyhow,	we,	well,	me	and	my	nanny	were	actually	trying



to	get	this	sorted	out.

So	we	drove	all	the	way	to	the,	to	the	town	about	20	or	30	minutes	away	from	there	to	T-
Mobile.	Of	course,	they're	all,	these	stores	are,	pretty	much	have	Negroes	doing	all	the
operations,	right?	There's,	none	of	these	stores	have	any	technicians	that	actually	help
us.	So	we,	so	we	decided	to	say	screw	it,	we're	just	going	to	go	online	and	see	how	to
sort	this	issue	out.

So,	so	we	called	the	number,	we	finally	got	a	 little	bit	of	 insight	because	these	niggers
are	 dumb.	 They	 don't	 know	 shit	 about	 technology,	 per	 se.	 Yeah,	 I've	 had	 a	 couple	 of
other	neck	with	that.

So	let's	continue.	So	my	poppy,	he	was,	the	next	day	he	was	getting	a	little	bit	impatient.
I	told	him	to	wait	so	I	could	transfer	his	pictures	and	stuff	over	to	the	computer	because	I
know	how	to	do	that	personally.

But	he	got	a	little	bit	impatient.	So	I	went	to	the	store	with	a	Negro	running	it,	surprise,
surprise.	 And	 guess	 what	 happens?	 He,	 he	 pretty	 much	 restores	 the	 phone's	 factory
settings	to	a	blank	state	with,	and	he	didn't	even,	he	basically	 lied	to	my	poppy's	 face
saying,	oh,	your	pictures	are	backed	up,	oh,	blah,	blah,	blah,	because	that's	what	you're
supposed	to	do	when	you	send	your	phone	to	get	repaired.

You	 know,	 but	 he	 never	 warned	 my	 poppy	 that	 you're	 going	 to	 lose	 your	 pictures	 if
they're	not	backed	up	already.	So	he	pretty	much	lied	straight	to	his	face,	straight	to	his
face.	And	he	told	me	to	come	and	look	at	it	and	make	sure	everything	was	right	to	have
it	sent	off	to	get	it	repaired.

It's	 interesting.	 I	 checked	 it,	 it	 just	 had	 enough	 battery	 so	 where	 I	 could	 check	 the
settings	 and	 lo	 and	 behold,	 all	 of	 his	 stuff	 was	 gone	 all	 because	 of	 this	 dumb	 nigger
didn't	know	he	was	either	stupid	or	lazy	or	he	was,	he	deliberately	did	it.	It	could	also	be,
yeah,	like	you	said,	malevolence	on	the	part	of	the	non-white	right	there.

Yeah,	probably	did	to	him	just	because	he's	white,	you	know?	Yeah,	and	the	thing	is	too,
they're	so	capable	or	competent	in	terms	of	lying	that	truth	does	not	mean	anything	to
them.	 It's	 just	words	 are	 just	 an	 instrument	 that	 they	use	 to	 get	 stuff	 for	 themselves.
Words	are	basically	just	like	a	tool,	you	know,	just	like	a	stick	that	they	get	termites	out
of	a	mound	with.

Uh-huh.	 Pretty	much	 all	 words	 are.	 Yeah,	 I've	 been	 having	 to	 deal	with	 these	 fucking
Jewish	phone	companies	for	the	past	couple	weeks.

It's	pretty	irritating,	to	say	the	least.	Well,	a	good	way	to	look	at	it,	I	think,	is	words	don't
really	mean	anything	but	actions	do.	And	I	think	a	lot	of	them	just	think	that	they	could
win	an	argument	by	Like	I	said,	if	he	had	just	waited	for	me	to	arrive	to	his	house,	I	could
have	easily	backed	up	his	pictures	that	he	collected	for	a	year.



And	this	is	why	I	tell	people	to	always	make	physical	backups.	Do	not	trust	these	cloud
storage.	Yeah,	well,	the	thing	is,	I've	had	plenty	of	those	shut	down	myself.

Omega.NZ	and	Mediafire.	 I've	had	whole	accounts	shut	down.	You	know,	 they	say,	oh,
yeah,	it's	been	six	months.

You	got	to	sign	back	in.	Otherwise,	you're	going	to	get	rid	of	all	your	stuff.	And	then	you
have	to	remember.

Yeah,	that's	why	I	advise	people,	you	know,	only	solid	state	drives	and	USBs	and	keep
them	in	a	metal	storage	container.	Because	hard	drives	are	prone	to,	you	know,	going
down	too.	So	SSDs	and	flash	drives	might	be	the	best	alternative.

Yeah,	I've	looked	into	that	myself	in	terms	of	what	is	the	best	storage	option.	You	know,
there's	microfiche,	which	is	still	magnetic	tape.	There's,	you	know,	whatever	sort	of	other
magnetic	 tape	 or	 something,	 cassette	 tapes,	 you	 know,	 archival	 disks,	 archival	 grade
disks	made	of,	like,	you	know,	very	solid	material.

You	can	get	some	of	those,	but	then	you	have	to	have	a	disk	drive	to	play	it	on.	So	it	all
ultimately	just	depends	on	having	a	computer	or	electrical	power	in	the	end.	That's	the
thing.

If	 I	 was	 working	 at	 that	 phone	 store,	 I	 could	 have	 easily,	 easily	 backed	 that	 stuff	 up
because	 I	 know	how	 to	 do	 it	 because	 I'm	pretty	 tech	 savvy	 to	 a	 certain	 extent.	 So	 in
terms	 of	 storage,	 the	 only	 thing	 you	 could	 have	 with	 any	 degree	 of	 permanence	 is
physical	 printed	 out	 papers	 or,	 you	 know,	 printed	 out	 images	 and	 stuff	 like	 that.	 And
then	you	can	laminate	them.

You	can,	you	know,	keep	them	in	very	environmentally	stable	conditions	where	there's
not	going	to	be	any	moisture	or	whatever,	you	know,	museum	type	conditions.	But	that's
what	I	would	advise	people	to	do	if	you	have	the	money.	And	if	you're	living	in	an	area
that	can	accommodate	that,	you	know,	buy	huge	amounts	of	books	and	materials	and
then	just	keep	it	in	like	a	bunker	type	environment.

So	nobody	will	know	about	it.	Like	in	a	sea	can	or	something.	Yeah.

Shipping	container.	You	never	know	what	will	happen	in	the	future.	You	know,	they	could
always	shut	down	the	internet.

You	never	know.	It	could	just	just	just	cease	to	exist	in	the	near	future.	Yeah.

And	 they	could	claim	 it's	 like	an	EMP	strike	by	China	or	Russia	or	something	 like	 that.
Yeah.	When	obviously	it'd	just	be	Jews	and	the	Israelis	or	whatever.

I	 guess	 they're	all	 the	 same	 thing.	 Speaking	of	 Israelis,	 you	 know,	 you	know,	 the	CPU
chip	manufacturer	Intel.	Yeah.



Their	 manufacturing	 sites	 are	 now	 have	moved	 to	 Israel	 like	 eight	 years	 ago	 or	 nine
years	ago.	Right.	So	they've	got	back	doors	to	all	your	computers.

They	can	basically	monitor	and	hack	into	your.	Oh,	absolutely.	They've	actually	had	back
doors	since	Windows	95	to	be	intact.

Probably.	 You	 know,	Microsoft	 is	 obviously	 owned	by	 Jews.	Bill	Gates	was	 a	 Jew,	most
definitely.

Well,	he	still	 exists,	unfortunately.	Now	he's	 trying	 to	push	vaccines	upon	 the	masses.
Yeah.

That's	why	I	think	the	Bill	Gates	Foundation	I	think	it	was	created	to	get	us	into	probably
in	the	following	year.	I	think	that	there's	probably	going	to	be	some	kind	of	war	against
China	or	something.	Something	happened	like	that.

And	then	they	bring	in	Russia	versus	America.	Yeah,	and	I	think	that's	what	the	Russia
collusion	stuff	was	for	was	to	incite	a	possible	war	against	Russia.	Yeah,	of	course,	Russia
is	controlled	by	Putin,	who's	a	Jew.

Yeah,	Jews	have	controlled	that	since	1905,	probably	if	not	even	before.	I	heard	that	the
Tsar	Nicholas	was	actually	Jewish	himself	or	partially	Jewish,	even	though	he	was	killed
by	the	Jewish	Bolsheviks.	So	you	can	never	be	sure	about	that.

But	 yeah,	 it's	 all	 contrived.	 Basically,	 it's	 just	 a	 theater	 of	 the	 real.	 And	 all	 we	 are
basically	just	pawns	in	their	games	that	they're	manipulating	and	moving	around	on	the
chessboard.

Yeah,	that's	another	game	of	genocide	is	basically	they	pit,	they	make	these	fratricidal
wars	 kind	 of	 like,	 you	 know,	 with	 the	 30	 Years'	 War,	 which	 was	 around	 Christianity,
Protestantism	 versus	 Lutheranism	 or	 might	 have	 been	 Catholicism.	 Yeah,	 it	 was
Catholicism.	Yeah,	and	things	like	things	of	that	sort.

Obviously,	World	War	 Two,	 that's	 an	 obvious	 one.	 And	 then	wars	 you	 can't,	 you	don't
win,	you	know,	these	no	win	wars	 like.	You	know,	war	on	terror,	 the	war	on	drugs,	the
war	on	whatever.

Yeah,	 it's	 always	 some	 game	 that	 they	 use	 right	 now.	 They're	 creating	 a	 race	 war,
obviously,	with	BLM.	 Is	there	any	of	that	type	of	activity	around	where	you	guys	are?	 I
haven't	noticed	it	in	my	area,	surprisingly,	not	yet,	at	least.

Other	than	seeing	virtue	signalers	put	signs	up	in	front	of	their	houses,	 I	haven't	seen.
I've	seen	one	sign.	That's	pretty	much	it.

Who	is	 in	the	house	that	had	the	sign?	Was	it	a	Jew	or	 just	a	liberal	 idiot?	Pretty	much
just	go	on.	Could	have	been.	Oh,	I	didn't	know	he	was	talking	to.



Well,	 just	yeah,	you	this	southerner.	So	yeah,	I'm	not	sure	who	was	in	the	house.	I	 just
saw	the	sign	outside	of	it.

Just	one	really.	There's	not	a	lot	of	BLM	supporters	as	far	as	I	know,	or	it's	pretty	stupid
to	do	that	in	a	small	white	town.	Unless	you're	a	Jew	who	knows	what	sort	of	plans	are
going	to	be	brought	down	on	that	town.

And	that's	part	of	their	psyop.	Well,	that	or	maybe	there's	sort	of	like	the	lone	liberal	who
thinks	they're	cool	for	being	the	only	one	with.	You	know	what's	 interesting?	I	was	just
maybe	like	a	month	and	a	half	ago.

I	was	woken	up	in	the	middle	of	night	at	like	130	in	the	morning	by	these	pieces	of	shit
race	mixers	that	were	living	two	houses	down	or	so.	And	they	were	they	were	chanting
Black	Lives	Matter	in	the	middle	of	the	night.	So	then	I	called	the	cops	and	and	the	police
shut	them	down.

Luckily,	 there	was	 at	 least	 some	 police	who	were	 doing	 their	 proper	 job.	 But	most	 of
them,	 you	 know,	 they	 don't	 they're	 they're	 going	 along	 with	 the	 agenda.	 They	 don't
really	care.

Yeah.	Yeah.	And	another	thing	is,	is	too	many.

It's	 really	amazing	how	 just	 calling	people	names	 is	an	effective	 strategy	 for	 some	 to,
you	know,	capitulate	to	whatever	they're	trying	to	push,	you	know,	calling	you	racist	or
whatever	trigger	word	they	come	up	with.	Basically,	they	do	that	just	to	silence	you	and
make	 you	 submit	 to	 whatever	 agenda	 they're	 trying	 to	 push.	 Yeah,	 it's	 called
weaponized	words.

It's	 really	 just	 based	 on	 emotion,	 basically.	 And	 it's	 just	 a	 way	 to	 manipulate	 you	 to
because	 they	 don't	 have	 any	 rational	 argument.	 They	 try	 to	 manipulate	 you	 through
emotion.

Exactly.	And	that's	what	a	lot	of,	you	know,	either	just	I	mean,	you	also	see	that	just	with
stupid	people.	 I	mean,	 they	do	 that	oftentimes	where	 they	 just	will	play	 these	childish
games,	you	know,	calling.

Yeah,	they'll	play	all	these	fallacies.	They'll	start	these	fallacies	out	of	nowhere.	Calling
you	names	that	are	probably	just	attacking	you	personally	and	things	of	that	sort.

Ad	hominem.	Yeah.	Ad	hominems.

Yeah,	usually	 that's	what	 they	do.	They	shift	people's	attention	away	 from	any	sort	of
rational	 thought	 because	 that	 way	 it	 creates	 a	 scene.	 That's	 what	 Jews	 always	 do
everywhere	you	go.

Especially	 in	 gang	 stalking,	 too.	 They'll	 deliberately	 hover	 around	 you	 and	 then	 try	 to



provoke	 you	 to	 say	 something.	 And	 then	when	 you	 do,	 then	 they'll	 try	 to	 like	 get	 all
emotional,	try	to	create	an	emotional	situation.

Oh	my	God,	did	you	hear	what	that	guy	said?	The	racist	guy.	Well,	another	thing	 is,	 is
they	 try	 to	 stalk	 you	 and	 try	 to	 drive	 you	 crazy.	 Like,	 you	 know,	 another	 guy	 who's
associated	with	 us,	 you	 know,	 you	 know	who	 I'm	 talking	 about,	 where	 there	was	 this
incredibly	egregious	individual	who	spammed	his	voicemail	for	several	days	calling	him	a
bald	virgin.

And	he	was	doing	that	for	like	two	weeks.	And	once	he	didn't	give	him	any	attention,	he
pretty	much	just	gave	up.	Yeah,	I	got	some	of	that	sort	of	email	messaging	where	they'd
message	 like,	claiming	 that	 I	was,	 that	 they	video	 recorded	me	watching	child	porn	or
something	like	that.

They	were	sending	me	emails	like	that,	these	antifa	types.	If	they	had	their	information,
they	couldn't	plant	that	type	of	stuff	on	your	computer	or	whatever	device	you're	using.
Yeah,	of	course	they	would	have	that	kind	of	stuff	to	plant	it	on	there	to	begin	with.

Yeah.	Because	they're	perverts.	Yeah,	most	of	them	are	disgusting	degenerates.

Pretty	much	antifa	is	sort	of	like	the	anti-chamber	to	the	sort	of	Freemasonic,	whatever
you	want	 to	 call	 that.	Black	magic,	 Jewish	black	magic	perversity.	 Yeah,	 I	won't	 call	 it
Satanism	because	Satan	is	just	a	Jewish	word,	which	means	adversary.

It's	 a	word,	 satanamon,	which	means	 truth	 in	 Sanskrit.	 So	 that's	 just	 a	 Jewish	word.	 I
wouldn't	employ	it	in	that	context,	but	whatever	it	may	be.

It's	just	a	punching	bag	of	a	word,	essentially.	Yeah,	it's	just	calling	everything	satanic	or
Satan.	 But	 Jews	 are	 Jews	 and	 they're	 the	 ones	 who	 are	 the	 poison	 on	 the	 earth,
whatever.

I	 think	satanic	 is	 just	a	spook	word	to	 like	 things	 that	 they	regard	as	evil	or	whatever.
Yeah,	that	way	they	can	confuse	people's	minds	through,	again,	these	weaponized	words
and	semantics	that	they	employ	to	manipulate	people's	consciousness.	Yeah,	it's	like	the
word	evil,	you're	evil.

They	try	to	associate	the	word	like	conspiracy	with	craziness,	really.	Yeah,	just	like	they
associate	the	word	nigger.	It's	a	form	of	linguistic	programming	they	try	to	use.

And	 the	 word	 nigger	 with	 hate	 and,	 you	 know,	 violence.	 Yeah.	 And	 so	 they've
conditioned	 the	minds	 of	 the	 non-whites	 to	 basically	 lash	 out	 every	 time	 you	 use	 the
word	white.

Or	if	you	use	the	word	non-white,	then	it'll	deliberately	put	them	into	that	state	of,	you
know,	 emotional	 reactivity	 so	 that	 they	 will	 just	 act	 according	 to	 their	 programming



based	 upon	 classical	 conditioning,	 the	 repetition	 of,	 you	 know,	 saying	 the	 same	 thing
over	and	over	and	over	again	 in	 the	media	 they	control.	Also,	 I	 think	even	 just	 saying
negro,	I	think	even	that	would	like,	oh	no,	you	know,	you're	KKK	just	saying	negro,	you
know.	Even	though	it's	a	Latin	word,	which	means	black.

Yeah,	I	know.	And	even	just	in	Spanish.	Yeah,	Spanish	too.

It's	silly.	So	I	guess	Southerner,	you're	basically	more	infested	with	the	non-white	nigger
or	negro.	Yeah.

And	 the	 other	 interlocutor	 on	 the	 other	 side	 is	more	mestizo.	 That's	 about	 it,	 isn't	 it?
Pretty	much.	In	terms	of	like	the	concentration.

I	guess	here	in	Canada,	it	varies	in	different	places,	of	course.	And	I	think	that	that's	part
of	 the	 pattern	 of	 what	 they	 do.	 The	 Jews,	 they	 deliberately	 put	 in	 different	 regions,
different	types	so	that	they	can	affect	different	purposes.

So	in	Canada,	for	example,	and	this	in	terms	of	like	a	historical	progression.	Initially,	they
put	 in	 the	 best	 of	 the	 non-whites,	 the	 ones	 that	 are	 most	 intelligent	 and	 the	 most
appealing	so	that	they	can	make	white	people	feel	like	there's	something,	really	cool	and
intriguing	and	very	interesting	and	so	forth	about	the	so-called	culture	of	the	non-white.
So	they	start	off	with	a	Chinese	or	something.

Vancouver	 is	practically	a	Chinese	state	as	 far	as	 I'm	concerned.	Yeah,	 I	 think	you	can
see	that,	especially	with	like	more	upper	class	neighborhoods	and	so	on.	Where	it's	like,
oh,	anecdotal	case,	where,	you	know,	 I	have	smart,	you	know,	Asian	or	whatever	 it	 is,
you	know,	because	you're	in	some	gated	community	that	is	away	from	somewhere	like
parts	of	L.A.	where	if	you're,	you	know,	that	would	be	an	interesting	reality	show	is	have
some	white	 people	walk	 through	 like	Watts	 or	 Inglewood	 in	 L.A.	 with	 no	 phone	 or	 no
money,	walk	 through	 there,	and	 that's	 the	survival	 show	 is	 just	walking	 through	 these
neighborhoods	without	getting	shot.

Have	you	ever	been	to	a	place	like	that	before?	Huh?	Have	you	ever	been	to	a	place	like
that	 before?	 I've	 been	 close.	 I've	 been	 certainly	 close.	 I've	 tried	 to	 stay	 away	 from
anywhere	that	is	of	such	a	caliber.

I	 know	my	 brother	 lives	 out	 in	 Chicago,	 and	 I	 know	 that	 that	 is	 not	 probably	 not	 the
safest	area.	Yeah,	especially	 if	you're	 in	 like	the	south	side	of	Chicago.	 I	guess	that's	a
notorious	gangster	disciple	hangout.

I	 think	Farrakhan	 lives	 in	Chicago,	doesn't	he?	Yeah,	so	 that's	where	they	have	 like	all
the	major	stronghold	of	the	blacks	in	terms	of	cities.	So	far	as	I	know,	anyway,	I	guess
they've	got	representation	in	all	sorts	of	different	places.	But	Chicago	is	sort	of	like	the
black,	I	guess	Atlanta,	Georgia	would	also	be	southern.



Oh,	definitely,	definitely	Atlanta,	Georgia.	Atlanta,	yeah.	 It's	 interesting	how	 they	have
the	Center	for	Disease	Control	in	Atlanta,	isn't	it?	I	think	so.

Almost	as	if	that	was	their	plan	to	just	use	the	non-whites	to	create	the	chaos	and	then
they're	 just	 going	 to	 do	 away	 with	 them	 when	 they're	 done	 with	 them.	 Because	 I
remember	in	the	book,	The	Hidden	Tyranny	by	Harold	Rosenthal,	it	says,	we're	probably
going	to	kill	the	Negroes	when	we're	done	with	them.	That's	a	direct	quote	from	Harold
Rosenthal,	who	is	a	senatorial	aide	to	Jacob	Javits,	one	of	the	people	who	are	behind,	one
of	the	Jews,	I	should	say,	not	people	who	are	behind.

Yeah,	not	human.	Well,	that's	the	thing	is	like	when	you	are	of	a	certain	intelligence,	you
don't	 realize	 that	 they	don't	 realize	 they're	being	used	because	 they're	dumb.	 I	mean,
it's	sort	of	like.

And	even	if	you	were	to	tell	them	that	Jews	are	not	white,	they	would	still	prefer	just	to
lump	them	in	with	white	people	because	it	makes	them	feel	better.	Yeah,	and	if	you	say
that,	 you're	 calling	 them.	 Actually	 feel	 any	 contempt	 or	 sorrowfulness	 for	 the	 white
person.

Yeah,	and	another	thing	is,	is	if	you	say	that	you're	called	anti-Semitic	or	something,	just
for	 pointing	 these	 things	 out,	 just	 for	 pointing	 something	 like	 that	 out.	 It's	 pretty
pathetic.	Yeah.

So	yeah,	trying	to	work	with	the	Negro	is	definitely	not	going	to	help	us	in	the	long	run	or
even	short	term.	That's	obviously	what	they're	attempting	to	do.	I	think	I	had	heard,	you
know,	 that	 Charles	 Manson	 was	 trying	 to	 foment	 chaos	 around	 in	 his	 L.A.,	 trying	 to
create	a	race	war	there	to	do	whatever	means.

And	he	was	obviously	an	operative	of	the	cabal.	Wasn't	that	Timothy	McVeigh	was	trying
to	start	 something	with	 that	with	 the	Oklahoma	 thing?	 I	don't	 think	so.	Celebrities	are
part	of	the	cabal.

Yeah,	 I	 know	 that	 that	 Oklahoma	 City	 bombing	 was	 just	 a	 government	 operation.
Anyway,	they	were	trying	to	eliminate	some	type	of	documents	in	the	Murrah	building,	I
think.	And	that	had	something	to	do	with	Waco,	I	believe,	possibly.

So	what	they	don't	care	how	many	people	they	kill	to	get	their	goals.	They	just	want	they
just	want	the	ends	justify	the	means,	you	know.	Yeah,	there's	a	communist	saying	goes
their	 intention	 was	 to	 shut	 down	 the	 militia	 movement	 in	 the	 states	 by	 having	 the
Oklahoma	City	bombing	so	they	could	justify	more,	you	know,	police	statism	against	the
population.

But	 clearly,	 that's	 their	 intention.	 There's	 even	 songs	 about	 race	 war,	 like	 Ice-T,	 that
military	 industrial,	whatever	guy,	he	was	actually	 like	a	military	brat	 from	New	 Jersey,
probably	outside	of	Trenton,	New	Jersey,	where	I	think	they	have	a	military	base	there.



He	was	put	into	the	position	to	create	gangster	rap	in	the	80s	in	like	1983.

And	he	had	a	song	called	Race	War	on	his	album	called	Home	Invasion	in	1993.	And	on
the	cover	of	that	Home	Invasion	album	is	like	this	white	teenager	with	his,	you	know,	like
with	his	crossed	legs	is	he's	listening	to	gangster	rap.	And	there's	all	these	crazy	images
coming	out	of	his	mind,	you	know,	thought	forms	of	violence	and	so	forth.

And	yeah,	and	that	cover	also	has	like	the	autobiography	of	Malcolm	X	or	something	like
that.	He's	 also	wearing	 like	 a	 shirt	with	 an	African	 continent	 on	 it.	 He's	 like	 a	wigger,
basically.

So	 obviously,	 that's	 what	 they're	 trying	 to	 do.	 A	 home	 invasion,	 right?	 In	 your	 mind,
they're	 manipulating	 your	 consciousness	 to	 implant	 these	 thoughts,	 to	 create	 these
realities.	That's	why	there's	so	many	wiggers	everywhere	now.

Yeah,	 I've	noticed	 that.	 They	 just	get	 so	 sucked	 into	 this	garbage	 that	 they	 think	 that
that's	what	reality	is.	It's	just	like,	yo,	yo,	yo.

And	not	only	that,	it's	trying	to	emulate	the	behavior	of	the	Negro.	And	it's	just	pathetic,
honestly.	It	just	makes	them	really	look	stupid.

And	it	 just	dumbs	down	their	vocabulary.	 It's	 like,	oh,	yeah,	yo,	man,	bruh,	bruh,	bruh,
bruh,	bruh.	Yeah,	or	fam	is	another	one,	fam.

And	they	actually	believe	it	makes	them	cool.	That's	the	worst	thing	about	it.	They	just
don't	have	the	brainpower	just	to	see	how	stupid	they	sound.

Yeah,	and	I	wouldn't	even,	 I	think	it	would	be	an	insult	to	even	call	them	neologisms.	 I
would	just	call	it	gibberish.	I	wouldn't	even	say	the	neologisms.

As	a	lowkey,	call	it	slanglish.	Slanguage.	Yeah,	yeah.

There's	 actually	 a	 book	 by	 this	 rapper	 called	 E-40.	 I	 think	 it's	 called	 the	Dictionary	 of
Slanguage	or	something.	He	actually	wrote	that	in	the	90s	somewhere.

Yeah,	we	were	mentioning	before	we	started	recording	here	about	how	Ice	Cube	was	in	a
group	called	CIA	before	N-W-A,	which,	you	know,	the	manager	was	a	Jew,	obviously.	And
then	he	went	on	 to	play	a	police	officer	 in	 films.	So	 it's	 sort	of	 like	a	 revelation	of	 the
method	where	you're	making	songs	called	Fuck	the	Police	or	whatever,	and	then	you	go
on	and	play	a	police	officer.

Totally	not	an	agent.	And	CIA	was	 this	previous	group.	 I	mean,	 it's	pretty	obvious	 that
they're	just	like	instruments	to	their	plan.

That's	 just	 a	 form	 of	mockery.	 Yeah,	well,	 that's	 the	 inversion	 of	 reality	 and	 then	 the
perversion	of	reality.	That's	the	Jewish	methodology	right	there.



They	take	white	culture	and	then	they	twist	it	out	of	shape	and	then	they	say,	here	you
go,	whitey,	here's	your	culture.	They	get	you	to	consume	it	and	believe	that	that	is	your
culture,	which	then	changes	your	consciousness	and,	you	know,	causes	even	more	harm
to	you.	And	then	it's	really	just	distorted	reality.

And	like	dumb	hicks	all	of	a	sudden	because	of	all	this	garbage	media	that	Jewish	media
that	they	consume,	they	can,	oh,	this	 is	our	culture,	 it's	supposed	to	be	 like	this.	Well,
that's	true.	Yeah,	that's	true.

And	 how	 they	 make	 these	 films	 like,	 you	 know,	 where	 they	 just	 make,	 you	 know,
southerners	or	hicks	or	 rednecks	or	 really,	you	know,	white	working	class	people,	 they
make	 them	 look	 like	 they're	 just,	 you	 know,	 basically	 just	 trash	 and	 pieces	 of	 shit,
basically.	 That's	 what	 these	 movies	 do.	 Southerners	 actually	 do	 consume	 that	 media
constantly.

They	sort	of,	they	manifest	it	into	reality.	That's	the	worst	thing	about	it.	It's	a	reification
of	the	idea,	simulacrum.

If	you	read	the	book	Simulacra	and	Simulations	by	 Jean	Baudrillard,	 then	that	explains
the	revelation	of	the	method	type	gimmick	on	the	part	of	the	Jews	where	they	manifest
these	ideas	into	reality	through	that	predictive	programming	type	of	technique	of	theirs,
getting	people	to	believe	that	these	things	are	theirs	or	to,	you	know,	take	ownership	of
these	as	if	they	were	their	authentic	culture.	Yeah.	Or	like,	you	know,	putting	posters	on
their	wall	and	like,	you	know,	LeBron	James	is	a	hero.

Yeah.	I	had	a	Snoop	culture	as	a	teenager	on	my	wall.	 I	never,	I	never	understood	the,
you	know,	the	worship	of	Negroes	catching	balls.

It's	 really,	 it's.	Yeah.	 It's	 like	what,	you	know,	Fallout	man,	you	know,	 it's	 like	what	he
said	in	that	video	where	he's	burning	the	Star	Wars	stuff.

He's	 like,	 that's	 all	 people	 in	 this	 world	 care	 about	 is	 cheap	 plastic	 shit	 and	 niggers
catching	balls.	I	mean,	that's	just,	that's	the	modern	world.	Yes.

That's	a	by	Marica.	It's	like	to	call	it	in	a	nutshell.	Why	America	have	to	revolt	against	the
modern	world?	That's	a	Julius	of	all	his	book,	right?	Yeah.

Definitely	 worthwhile	 reading.	 I'd	 recommend	 you	 do	 sound	 quite	 interesting.	 Yeah,	 I
would	say	that	definitely	him	and	Serrano	are	pretty	much	on	the	forefront	 in	terms	of
ideology	or	philosophy,	esotericism,	call	it	whatever	you	want.

That's,	 that's	definitely	what	 I	seek	to	hone	 in	on	and	 focus	my	consciousness	on,	you
know,	especially	Evola's	works,	which	are	very,	very	well	written,	not	a	lot	of	emotional
bullshit.	It's	just	very	dry	and	form.	Yeah.



Very	 detailed	 and	 cut	 and	 dry	 Henry	 Ford's	 book,	 the	 international	 Jew,	 the	 world's
foremost	 problem.	 That's	 a	 very	 good	 book.	 Definitely	 a	much	more	 worthwhile	 read
than	that	other	book	that	the	alt-right	like	to	push.

What's	it	called?	The	culture	critique.	I	threw	that	in	the	garbage.	I	never	understood	the
hype	behind	that	book.

Kevin	McDonald's	obviously	a	Jew	himself	and	he's	a	disinformation	agent.	Pretty	much
the	whole	alt-right	is	just	pushing	Christianity	and	it's	sort	of	through	the	back	door,	you
know,	very	indirectly,	a	lot	of	nebulous	rhetoric.	But	they're	pushing	a	lot,	you	know,	the
acceptance	of	non-whites	and	faggotry	as	well.

Yeah,	like	Greg	Johnson	is	one	where	he's	like,	you	know,	check	out	this	base	sodomite
basically.	Yeah,	it's	pretty	disgusting.	I	mean,	I	thought	I	didn't	sign	up	for	this	shit.

I	 just	want	 to	kick	all	 these	Mexicans	and	niggers.	And	 then	 it's	 like	you	have	Richard
Spencer	 who	 like	 basically	 talks	 like	 a	 fag.	 And	 I	 mean,	 in	 the	 sense	 of	 what	 you're
talking	about,	I	would	say	I	would	suggest	you	go	read	Ben	Klasson,	man.

Yeah,	the	little	white	book	is	the	best.	Pretty	much	all	you	really	need	for	the	creativity
movement	is	a	little	white	book.	Yeah,	it's	a	good	synopsis.

Once	I	have	my	library	site	up	with	all	my,	I	got	like	about	8,000	documents	on	there	in
topical	arrangement.	Once	that's	up,	then	I'll	be	able	to	send	it	to	you.	And	maybe	you
can	spread	it	around	to	other	people,	too,	because	that	way	we	can	get	a	good	archive
of	information	all	in	one	place.

I'll	definitely	work	on	backing	them	up,	too.	Yeah,	 I	would	say	the	little	white	book	is	a
good	synthesis	for	Klasson.	And	for	Serrano,	I	would	say	the	Son	of	the	Widower	would
be	a	good	synopsis	of	his	work,	which	you	could	go	and	find	on	the	net	for	free.

Both	 of	 them	 you	 could.	 They're	 pretty	 short	 works.	 That's	 the	 best	 way	 to	 approach
these	sorts	of	subjects	is	just	to	read	like	smaller,	shorter	works	by	the	people.

And	then,	you	know,	you	can	get	more	in	depth	if	you	really	cared	to	from	there.	And	if
you	don't,	then	you	can	just	reject	it,	obviously.	But	when	you	were	talking	about	Henry
Ford's	The	International	Jew,	this	ties	into	what	Jews	do	in	terms	of	using	the	non-whites
as	their	tool	or	their	instrument	of	white	genocide.

Is	with	Henry	Ford,	when	he	obviously	tried	to	oppose	the	Second	World	War,	the	Jews
came	after	him	very	hard	because	they	were	trying	to	get	rid	of	opposition	to	their	plans.
And	 so	 they	 sabotaged	 his	 company.	 And	 he	 also	 published	 The	 International	 Jew,
putting	it	in	every	glove	box	of	every	Model	T	that	he	manufactured.

I'm	sorry,	go	ahead.	Well,	yeah,	you	can	interrupt	by	all	means.	But	I	was	just	going	to



say	that	they	basically	forced	his	company	to	use	gasoline	because	it	was	controlled	or,
you	know,	largely	controlled	by	the	oil	reserves	and	gas	reserves	by	Standard	Oil,	which
is	controlled	by	the	Rockefellers,	who	are	actually	named	Rosenfelder.

Oh,	really?	Yeah.	Who	are	Jews.	I	always	figured	they	were	Jewish.

Yeah.	They're	related	to	the	Rothschilds.	I	think	they're	the	cousins	of	the	Rothschilds.

So	what	they	did,	they	basically	prevented	Henry	Ford	from	using	gasohol	in	his	vehicles,
which	 is	 made	 from	 vegetable	 scraps.	 Oh,	 really?	 Yeah.	 So	 it	 wouldn't	 have	 polluted
anything	in	the	environment	on	the	one	hand.

And	on	the	other	hand,	the	Model	T	was	made	to	last	a	whole	lifetime	for	people.	So	now
you	look	at	the	cars,	they're	just	made	like	pieces	of	garbage.	Planned	obsolescence	to
fall	apart	in,	you	know,	just	a	short	time.

And	they're	all	electronic,	so	they	can	be	controlled.	You	know,	they	can	take	control.	I
don't	trust	those	electronic	cars.

No,	they	can	take	control	of	your	vehicle	and	ram	you	into	traffic.	You	know,	ram	you	off
a	cliff.	That's	within	their	capability.

And	 they	can	also	 short	 circuit	 it	 or	 something	 like	 that,	when	you're	 in	 the	middle	of
traffic,	driving	full	speed.	Make	it	look	like	an	accident.	Yeah,	exactly.

That's	what	 their	attempts	are.	To	kill	people	 for	assassination	purposes,	 they	do	 that.
Probably	a	lot	of	car	accidents	are	like	that,	or	deliberately	people	being	run	into	traffic
or	whatever,	into	a	brick	wall.

So	what	 they	 did	 to	 Henry	 Ford,	 they	 also,	 after	 sabotaging	 his	 company,	 then	 in	 his
town	of	Dearborn	Independent,	they	deliberately	made	that	into	like	an	Arab	stronghold
after,	 you	 know,	 whenever	 they	 started	 bringing	 them	 in.	 And	 so	 that	 way	 they	 can
curse,	 you	 know,	 the	 jet	 cuts.	 Yeah,	 basically,	 that's	 their	 little	 technique	 of	 trying	 to
stick	a	knife	in	people's	back.

And	 they	did	 the	 same	 thing	with	Charles	 Lindbergh,	who	 tried	 to	 oppose	 the	Second
World	 War,	 too.	 Ritually	 murdered	 his	 child	 with	 the	 Purple	 Gang	 outside	 of	 Detroit,
Michigan.	And,	you	know,	then	from	there,	they	bring	in	huge	amounts	of	Somalians	into
Minneapolis,	Minnesota,	where	his	father	was	like	a	governor	and	so	forth.

I	don't	know	 if	he	was	a	governor,	 too,	but	 they	sabotaged	his	 life.	And	so	that's	what
they	do	in	the	whitest	areas,	 in	the	areas	that	have	the	most	blonde	haired,	blue	eyed
people,	they	put	in	the	darkest	and	the	shittiest	people,	as	a	means	of	sort	of	defiling	the
culture	of	the	people.	They	started	off	in	Germany	with	Turks.

And	in	various	other	European	cities,	they	brought	in	a	bunch	of	Paki's	and	so	forth	from



there.	But	usually	what	they	do	with	the	more	intelligent	groups,	they	try	to	bring	in	the
most	intelligent	non-whites	so	that	they	can,	you	know,	not	have	as	much	pushback	from
the	white	populace,	you	know,	Chinese	and	whatever,	Iranian	or	Turks	or	something	like
that	 or	 Japanese.	 Then	 from	 there,	 once	 they	 get	 them	 in,	 you	 know,	 down	 the	 line
gradualistically,	it's	more	and	more	shitty.

Yeah,	that's	sort	of	make	it	more	accepting	to	the	average	white	person.	Yeah.	And	then
once	they	get	to	that	stage,	then	the	next	stage	is	where	they	deliberately	pump	in	the
most	violent	and	stupid	of	them	progressively.

So	from	the	Chinese	and	the	Japanese	and,	you	know,	Iranian	and	Turkish	and	so	on,	and
Persian,	then	from	there	it	goes	to	like	the	Arabs	and	then	from	there,	whatever,	Filipino.
Yeah,	ultimately,	 it	 just	gets	 to	 like	the	blackest	of	 the	black	and	the	most	violent	and
stupid.	 And	 that's	 the	 whole	 procedure	 of	 a	 Jew,	 is	 this	 entropic	 violence	 that	 they
impose	on	people.

And	 they're	 just	 trying	 to	 do	 the	 violence	 themselves	 because	 they're	 the	 biggest
cowards	in	the	face	of	the	earth.	So	they	have	to	use	other	people	to	do	their	dirty	work.
Yeah,	because	they're	passive	aggressive,	basically.

And	cowardness	before	is,	do	you	think	that	we	will	win	the	eternal	war	at	some	point,
whether	 or	 not	 it's	 in	 our	 lifetime	 or	 not?	 Well,	 I	 know	 Miguel	 Serrano	 says	 that	 we
already	won	 the	war	 in	 the	 spiritual	 dimensions	 ever	 since	Hitler	 deliberately	 lost	 the
war.	According	to	Miguel	Serrano,	he	deliberately	lost	the	war	in	the	physical	so	that	he
could	win.	 Isn't	 that	 sort	 of	 like	 the	Christian	 sense	of	winning	by	 losing?	Yeah,	pretty
much	that.

Well,	he,	Serrano	even	explicitly	makes	that	statement	multiple	times,	you	know,	win	by
he	won	by	losing.	So,	you	know,	it's	questionable	whether	it	does	make	sense,	you	know,
in	terms	of	karma	that,	you	know,	they	have	used	sort	of	crude	means	to	gain	a	victory.
And	then	in	doing	so,	they	basically,	they	had	to	violate	the	harmony	of	existence,	which
in	turn	generated	karma	or	disharmony,	discord.

And	 then	 that	 rebounds	 against	 them	 and,	 you	 know,	 brings	 about	 a	 reaction.	 But	 of
course,	that,	you	know,	 it's	not	the	same	really	as	Christianity	 insofar	as	Christianity	 is
more	purely	pacifistic	and	it's	not	really	like	an	authentic	Aryan	tradition,	whereas,	you
know,	the	notion	of	karma	and	so	forth,	that	is	so	far	as	I	know,	you	know,	authentically
Aryan.	But	I	might	be	wrong	in	that	regard	also.

But	I	don't	think	that	Serrano's	win	by	losing	conception	precludes,	you	know,	an	act	of
fighting	 and	 opposition.	 It's	 just,	 you	 know,	 that	 from	 a	 karmic	 perspective	 or	 like	 a
cosmic	perspective.	So	the	question	is,	then,	will	we	win	the	race	war?	I	would	say	we've
already	won	in	that	respect.



But	 in	 terms	 of	 physical	 life	 and	 its	 continuance	 of	 white	 people	 on	 Earth,	 that's
definitely,	you	know,	questionable.	I	would	say	we	probably	will.	But	I	think	the	strongest
are	going	to	survive	at	the	end	of	the	day.

But,	you	know,	it's	sort	of	just	living	in	a	dog-dog	world.	Yeah,	I	agree.	I	would	say	that
when	the,	you	know,	I	would	say	once	this,	the	jog	falls	apart	at	some	point,	I	think	that
at	that	point	it	will	just	be	survival	of	the	fittest,	basically.

And	 then	 all	 the	 parasites	 and	 the	 dumbed	 down	 peoples	 of	 the	 world	 will	 basically
perish	because	of	that.	Yeah,	and	they'll	all	be	living	in	the	cities	and	all	the	cities	will	be
the	 ones	 that	 are	 collapsing,	 which	 is	 in	 a	 way	 unfortunate	 because	 a	 lot	 of	 the
intelligent	people	are	living	in	the	cities,	but	a	lot	of	them	are	moving	away	from	there
now.	You	had	said,	Southerner,	about	a	dog-eat-dog	world,	but	you	could	say,	too,	that
it's	like	a	dog-eat-God	world.

Oh.	 Basically,	 because	 the	 dog	 is	 like	 the	 inverse	 of	 God	 of	 the	 Christian.	 Oh,	 you're
right.

Because	 it's	 spelled	 backwards.	 And	 that	 refers	 to	 like	 the	 dog	 star	 of	 Sirius	 and	 the
Orion	constellation,	where	apparently	the	white	gods	came	from	the	Orion	constellation
in	Sirius.	Oh,	that	makes	sense.

Well,	 it's	 sort	 of	 like	 the	 symbology	 of,	 you	 know,	 Adolf	 Hitler	 had	 a	 dog.	 And	 well,
according	 to	 the	 Chinese	 zodiac,	 I	 was	 born	 in	 the	 year	 of	 the	 dog,	 too.	 That's	 very
interesting.

Yeah,	 my	 birthday	 is	 what's	 weird	 about	 my	 birthday	 is	 that	 it's	 the	 same	 day	 that
Goebbels	died,	which	I	just	think	is	kind	of	interesting.	Yeah,	maybe	that's	reincarnation
of	Goebbels.	Yeah.

Propaganda	minister.	 It	 is	unfortunate	that	he	had	to	murder	his	entire	 family,	 though.
Well,	I	guess	the	only	alternative	is	that	they'd	be	tortured	to	death	or	murdered	by	the
Allied	 powers	 like	 they	 killed	 off	 the	 Germans	 in	 the	 Nuremberg	 trials	 through
strangulation	and	so	forth.

Yeah,	 it	 isn't.	Yeah,	 I	guess	 there	wasn't	 really	much	of	a	choice	anyway.	That	way	he
spared	his	children,	you	know,	even	worse	suffering.

It's	 like	that	movie	made	by	Stephen	King	called	Apt	Pupil.	 I	don't	know	if	you've	seen
that	movie	before.	Movie	by	Stephen	King	or	book?	Well,	it's	both.

It's	 basically	 this	 kid	 becomes	 like	 a	mentor	 by	 this	 ex-national	 socialist	 guy,	 this	 old
man,	and	then	the	old	man's	being	hunted	down	and	he's	like	in	a	hospital	going	to	be
extradited	 to	 Israel	 to	 be	 killed.	 And	 then	 the	 old	 man	 basically	 kills	 himself	 in	 the
hospital	room	to	avoid	being,	you	know,	taken	to	 Israel	to	be	killed.	And	it's	really	sick



how	they're	like	arresting	people	who	are	in	their	90s	or	even	100s.

You	 know,	 it's	 really	 fucked	 up.	 Struggling	 to	 walk	 in	 their	 crutches.	 It's	 somehow	 a
threat.

Well,	that	obviously	shows	the	weakness	of	the	Jews	power,	because	if	they	have	to	go
so	far	just	to	like	do	that	to	old	people,	they	just	demonstrate	their	oriental	despotism,
their	tyrannical	nature.	And	that's	not	going	to	not	going	to	get	any	sympathy	for	them.
It's	just	going	to	make	people,	you	know,	have	a	hostility	toward	them.

I	 think	 that	 the	 Jeffrey	Epstein	 thing	really	opened	a	 lot	of	people's	eyes	to	 that	whole
influence	 of	 things,	 at	 least	 in	 recent	 times.	 The	whole	 suicide	murder,	 whatever	 you
want	to	call	it,	it	was	a	hoax.	I	think	he's	alive.

I	think	he's	alive,	too.	That's	just	a	way	the	Jews	flaunt	their	pedophilia	upon	the	masses.
I	sort	of	wonder	 if	 that's	 the	same	with	Michael	Aquino,	 the	Temple	of	Set	guy,	who	 is
also	 specialized	 in	military	 psyops,	 about	 how	his	 death	was	 announced,	 like	 nearly	 a
year	later	after	he	supposedly	died.

So	that	might	have	been	a	psyop	in	itself.	Yeah,	about	these,	you	know,	strange	deaths
that	 occur	 within	 a	 whole	 sphere.	 Those	 dates	 are	 obviously	 numerological	 with	 their
Kabbalistic	coding.

Yeah,	they	do	that	to	celebrities	all	the	time.	They're	always	killing	at	the	age	of...	could
ever	imagine.	Yeah,	it's	weird	how	Charles	Manson	claims	to	worship	the	god	of	Braxis,
which	Kabbalistically	would	go	 to	 the	number	365,	which	 is	 the	number	of	days	of	 the
year.

Right.	 So	 it's	 sort	 of	 interesting	 how,	 you	 know,	 you	 can	 sort	 of	 crack	 their	 code	 by
looking	at	what	they're,	what	they	coincide	with	numerologically	with	their,	the	Kabbal.
Or	like	how	they	like	to	hijack	the	number	33,	any	chance	they	have?	Well,	yeah,	I	mean,
isn't	that	the	club	in	Disneyland,	Club	33?	I	think	that	number	has	spiritual	significance,
that	they're	just	trying	to	hijack	it	for	themselves.

And	there's	another	example	of	use	of	33	is	how	the	band,	the	Smashing	Pumpkins,	they
had	a	song	called	33,	and	they	would	kind	of	 incorporate	a	 lot	of	that	 imagery	 in	their
music	videos.	And	a	few	years	ago,	I	went	to	go	see	them	live,	and	they	had	a	lot	of	that
creepy	kind	of	Masonic	imagery.	It	just	felt	like	this	negative	thought.

Dark.	 I	 felt	 like	 I	 had	 dark	 forces	 around	me,	 basically.	 And	 then	 the	Corgan	guy,	 the
singer	was	like,	he	looked	like	he	was	wearing	one	of	those	like	robes.

He's	wearing	like	this	red,	like,	it	was	sort	of	like,	if	you	ever	saw	the	Revenge	of	the	Sith,
the	 way	 Palpatine's	 robe	 looked	 in	 that	 it	 looked	 exactly	 the	 same	 as	 what	 he	 was
wearing	on	the	stage.	So	it	was	pretty	weird.	Like	Freemasonic	attire?	I	mean,	it's	sort	of



like	what	 that	Dragon's	Paw	operative	guy	was	pointing	out	about	 that	Madonna	ritual
from	a	year	ago,	where	she	basically	was	at	Eurovision.

And	she	was	wearing	this	eyepatch	and	this	robe.	And	she	was	 like	sidestepping	down
stairs.	And	it	was	very	creepy.

And	then	in	foreshadowing,	they	were	all	having	gas	masks	on	for	the	year	2020.	Go	on,
sorry,	I	don't	want	to	ramble.	I	was	just	gonna	say,	when	you	get	a	lot	of	people	in	the
same	place,	then	obviously,	that	creates	energetic	states,	because	their	consciousness	is
merged	and	blended	together.

And	then	when	you	have	all	these,	this	imagery,	symbolism,	color,	tone	and	sound,	all	of
that	manipulates	their	consciousness	and	puts	them	into	like	a	same,	you	know,	this	sort
of	receptive	state	of	consciousness,	where	they	are,	they're	lending	their	energy	to	the
event.	So	it	basically	is	a	ritual,	all	these,	you	know,	that's	why	I	tend	to	stay	away	from
like	nightclubs	and	bars,	because	 it	 just,	 I	don't	know,	they	always	have	made	me	feel
unease.	I'm	not	really	a	fan	in	general	of	crowds	or	live	music	or	really	anywhere	that's
loud.

And	I'm	kind	of,	I	don't	know,	I've	always	been	a	quiet	guy.	I	don't	like	loud	places.	I	don't
like,	you	know,	anywhere	where	there's	a	lot	of	people.

Seneca	said,	avoid	the	crowd.	And	that's	definitely	something	that	I've	adhered	to,	ever
since	 I	 first	heard	 that	quotation.	And	before	 that,	 you	could	always	 just	 sort	of	 sense
that	all	this	very	loud	noise	is	not	healthy	for	you,	even	just	from	a	purely	like,	physical
level,	you	know,	you're	having	all	 this,	 this	 force	beating	against	you,	 like,	and	people
find	this	appealing	and	interesting.

This	is	kind	of	like,	when	you	listen	to	these	bands,	and	you	have	your	headphones	on	or
your	speakers	or	whatever,	and	you	just	feel	like	they're	banging	your	ears	out	with	the
loud	percussion	and	the	loud,	and	then	you're	sort	of	in	a	trance	state.	And	then	it	keeps
you	in	that	same	frame	of	consciousness	as	whatever	message	you're	trying	to	deliver	to
you	 through	 the	 the	 sonic,	 you	 know,	 sound	 of	 what	 is	 going	 through	 your
consciousness,	 basically.	 And,	 you	 know,	 that's	 why	 I	 just	 try	 to	 avoid	 anywhere,
anything	that's	really	pushing	a	destructive,	uh,	self	destruction	and,	you	know,	things	of
that	sort.

Most	 of	 that	 represents	 itself	 as	 if	 it	 isn't	 destructive,	 it	 represents	 itself,	 or	 is
represented	 as	 if	 it	 were	 something	 beneficial	 or	 healthy,	 like,	 yeah,	 you	 want	 to	 be
social,	 right,	man,	you	want	 to,	you	know,	go	and	get	some	chicks	and	whatever.	And
then	what	is	the	fallout	of	all	these	activities,	you	know,	it's	just	dissipation,	you	waste	all
your	 energy,	 your	 bio	 energy,	 you're	 you're	 ejaculating	 all	 over	 the	 place	 and	 getting
diseases	and	so	forth.	And	yeah,	it's	like,	Hey,	man,	you	want	to	be	cool,	you	want	to	be
trying	 to	 get	 yourself	 involved	 in	 all	 this	 disgusting	 ass,	 this	 degenerate	 bullshit,	 and



you'll	be	cool.

Because	 that's	all	cool	means	 it	means	basically,	 I	guess,	 the	extinction	of	your	divine
spark.	Maybe	that's	an	occult	joke	on	the	part	of	the	Jews	is	just	to	create	that	notion	of
being	 apathetic,	 and,	 you	 know,	 not	 having	 your	 consciousness	 in	 really	 engaged	 in
reality,	 so	 that	 you	 can	 become	basically	 like	 a	 dead	 zombie,	 like	most	 of	 the	 people
have	become	 through	all	 this	 so	called	Antarctic	culture	 that	 they	 tie	 themselves	 into.
Yeah,	 what	 do	 you	 think	 of	 that?	 The	 quotes	 from,	 you	 know,	 Adolf	 Hitler	 about,	 you
know,	the	strongest	man	acts	alone,	I	believe	was	how	it	was.

Yeah,	 well,	 that	 just	 means	 that	 you	 don't	 have	 to	 depend	 on	 others.	 And	 therefore,
you're	stronger	because	you	don't	require	other	people	in	order	to	act.	Right.

So	that's	definitely	a	signifier	of	leadership,	and	of	being	a	stronger	person	is	not	having
to	rely	on	externals	 in	order	to	prop	yourself	up.	 I	would	say	another	good	quote	 is	do
not	compare	yourself	to	others.	If	you	do,	you're	insulting	yourself.

It's	interesting	how	all	the	non-whites,	they	always	have	to	have	huge	amounts	of	their
own	kind	to	hang	around	with	them.	You	know,	they're	almost	never	alone.	That's	true.

I've	noticed	that	with	the	Filipinos	as	well.	They're	always	in	just	groups.	Yeah,	nattering
away.

Their	 native	 tongue	 is	 weird.	 Yeah,	 well,	 I	 think	 they're	 actually	 apparently	 interbred
allegedly	with	quote	unquote	Spanish.	But	 I'm	pretty	sure	that	those	Spanish	are	 Jews,
actually.

Because	of	the,	what	was	it	called?	The	Inquisition?	Yeah,	the	Maranos.	Well,	I'm	pretty
sure	that	when	the	Spanish	went	to	the	Philippines	that	they	basically	did	prima	nocte	on
the	Oriental	population.	So	most	of	the	Filipinos	are	probably	like	half	Jews	or	something.

They	certainly	behave	 like	 that.	They've	got	 that	 sort	of	devious	 little	attitude.	That	 is
true.

You	 know,	 it's	 interesting.	 I	 wrote	 about	 this	 in	 my	 little	 autobiography	 that	 I	 wrote
because	I	wanted	to	get	the	message	out	about	what	 Jews	do	to	people.	And	there's	a
couple	instances	in	there	where	deliberately,	like	I	went	on	dating	sites	and	so	forth	just
to	meet	people	to	hang	around.

And	 the	only	people	 that	would	 respond	were	 like	Filipinos.	So	 then	 like	Filipino	males
actually	 met	 up	 with,	 not	 for	 faggotry	 or	 anything,	 but	 just	 to	 hang	 around,	 have
somebody	to	talk	to.	And	then	I	met	up	with	them	because	there	was	nobody	else	at	the
time.

And	they're	like	trying	to	involve	themselves	in	sexual	activities	with	me	and	so	forth.	At



one	time	I	stayed	at	this	place	and	there	was	like	five	Filipinos	there.	I	had	nowhere	else
to	go	because	my	drunken	father	threw	me,	basically	caused	me	to	be	homeless.

And	that's	the	only	place	I	could	get	to	room.	And,	you	know,	the	guy,	the	guy	there	was
not	 Filipino.	He	was	 saying	 that	 it's	 the	 culture	 of	 Filipinos	 to	 involve	 themselves	with
each	other,	like	bisexually.

Yeah.	What's	weird	about	that	is	when	I	was,	when	I	was	in	high	school,	a	lot	of	who	I,
you	 know,	was	 I	 surrounded	myself	 with	 basically,	 uh,	 I	 wasn't	 really	 totally	 aware	 of
everything	 at	 the	 time	 and	why	 these	 people	were,	 uh,	 just	 really	messed	up	 people.
And,	uh,	I	really	just	was	around	them	because	I	don't	know,	I,	at	the	time	I	was	just	kind
of	looking	for	somewhere	to	sit	or	whatever	during	breaks	or	what	have	you.

And	 then	earlier	 this,	uh,	year	back	 in	 January,	 I,	uh,	 I	was	over	at	 the,	you	know,	 the
store,	you	know,	just	looking	for	food	or	whatever.	And	then	right	as	I	was	leaving	my	old
high	school	group,	uh,	you	know,	 I	 spot	 them	and	 they	were	 like,	Hey,	you	know,	you
know,	my,	my	name,	you	know,	and	they,	and	they	were	 like,	Hey,	you	know,	and	 I'm
like,	Oh	no.	And	it's	like,	I	just,	I	just	kept	walking.

I	tried	to	ignore	them,	but	then	they	started	following	me	and	I	was	like,	okay,	you	know,
and	then	I	started	talking	to	them	for	a	little	bit.	And	then,	uh,	basically	they	were	telling
me	about	all	this	like	perverted	shit	that	I	didn't	know	about.	They	were	trying	to	make	it
seem	like	it	was	normal.

Like	 there	 was	 this,	 uh,	 like	mulatto	 or	 whatever	 that	 was	 there.	 And	 he	 was	 talking
about	how	there	was	this	14	year	old	when	senior	year	or	whatever,	 they	were	 joking,
they	were	joking	about	it.	Like,	ha	ha.

Remember	 that	 time	where	you	were	stalking	 that	14	year	old	senior	year?	And	 I	was
like,	what	the	fuck?	Like,	I	didn't	know	that	about	this,	you	know,	or	whatever.	And	then
there	was	this	other	guy,	this	Filipino	kid	who	basically	was	known	for	stalking,	uh,	girls.
And,	uh,	basically	that	was	why	I	tried	to	avoid	him	was	because	he's	creepy.

You	know	what's	 interesting?	He	would	go	out	of	his	way	to	stalk	girls	on	social	media
and	also	 stalk	 them	 in	 real	 life	by	 following	 them.	And,	uh,	he	would	 sort	of	 sit	 in	 the
bushes	and	really,	just	really	disturbing	people.	Go	on.

I'm	sure	there	are	gang	stalkers	that	are	just	trying	to	set	you	up.	Cause	that's	what	they
often	 seem	 to	 do	 is	 just	 set	 people	 up	 as	 pedophiles	 or	 in	 like,	 like	 I	 said,	 with	 the
Filipinos	 that	 were	 trying	 to	 involve	 themselves	 in	 faggotry	with	me.	 You	 know,	 they,
they	deliberately	send	these	people	out	to	try	to,	to,	you	know,	involve	you	in	corruption.

If	you	read	the	book,	uh,	the	hidden	evil	by	Mark	Rich,	it	discusses	that	these	are	some
of	the	techniques	that	the	gang	stalkers	use	to	corrupt	people	is	through	faggotry	and	so
on.	Yeah.	Yeah.



I	mean,	that's	like	another	time	where,	uh,	when	I	was	younger,	there	was	this	camping
trip	and	there	was	this,	uh,	mulatto	kid	who	was	next	to	me	in	the	tent	that	I	was	in.	And
he	kept	trying	to	do,	uh,	you	know,	uh,	gay	shit	to	me.	And	at	that	point	I	was	like,	get,	I
was	like,	get	away	from	me.

I	was	like,	I	was	like	shoving	him	away.	I	was	like,	you	know,	I	think	I	even	punched	him
in	the	face.	I	was	like,	get	the	fuck	away	from	me,	you	fucking	weirdo.

And	he	was	like,	 just	rabid,	 like,	yes.	Really	sick	stuff,	man.	Do	you	think	that,	um,	the
mulatto	was	a	Jew	maybe,	or	like	a	hybrid?	Oh,	I	don't	know.

It's	 possible.	 Anything's	 possible.	 Thing	 is	 when	 they	 become	 hybridized	 like	 that,
different	groups,	then	that	obviously	creates	a	very	deviant,	uh,	character	because	their
soul	is	not	the	same	as,	and	their	genetics	are,	you	know,	totally	foreign	to	one	another
and	incompatible.

Basically	 makes	 them	 schizophrenic.	 Yeah.	 Cause	 they	 have	 different	 souls	 that	 are
combined	together	basically.

Not	only	that,	they	tend	to	have	a	lot	of	abnormalities	behaviorally	and	even	physically
health	wise.	Yeah.	Like	a	lots	of	disease	states	and	eventually	they	become	sterile.

Sick	more	often.	There's	a	really	good	book	on	that	subject	called	the	synthesis	of	racial
doctrine	by	Julius.	Oh	yeah.

That,	 that	 definitely	 goes	 through	 a	 lot	 of	 interesting,	 uh,	 uh,	 points	 about	 that.	 I
definitely	recommend	that	you	get	that,	that	book,	especially.	Yeah.

I	would	say	for	that	book,	I	would	say	read	revolt	against	the	moral	first,	and	then	that's
sort	of	 like	expands	and	what	he	already	kind	of	said	 in	revolt	against	the	moral	world
about,	well,	it's	a	very	large	book	though.	Not	too	many	people	have	all	the	time.	Well,
it's,	uh,	it's	not	too	large.

I	mean,	 it's	only	a	bit	right	here,	actually.	 It's	 like	300	and	roughly	370	pages.	 I	mean,
that's	not	horrible.

What	 I	would	say	 for	people	who	don't	know	anything	about	Evola's	works	 is	 read	 the
following	works	in	this	sequence.	First	read	heathen	imperialism,	read	elements	of	racial
education,	read,	uh,	three	aspects	of	the	Jewish	problem.	Then	you	can	read,	uh,	a	very,
a	variety	of	his	articles.

Uh,	again,	evolaasheis.wordpress.com	is	a	good	site	for	a	lot	of	the	free	articles	and	so
forth.	And	you	can	get,	get	the	books	through	there	too.	Or	you	can	check	around	on	the,
on	the	net	for	those,	but	it's	good	to	start	off	there	to	like,	uh,	smaller	articles.

Cause	 not	 everybody	 wants	 to	 spend	 huge	 amounts	 of	 time	 reading	 like,	 uh,	 larger



works.	 Right.	 But	 that's	 why	 many	 haven't	 read,	 uh,	 you	 know,	 Francis	 Barbiaki's
Imperium	because	it's	fairly	lengthy	work.

Yeah,	I	have	his	collection.	You	can't	even	buy	that	book	anymore.	Can	you?	Yeah,	you
can	get	it	at	Invictusbooks.com.	Oh,	okay.

Can	you	send	me	a	link?	Yeah,	you	can	get	the	Invictus	books	one,	but	the	other	ones
have	fallen	out	of	print	for	whatever	reason.	Well,	at	least	you	can	still	get	it.	I	would	say
heathen	imperialism	is	much	better	in	terms	of	like	a	political	or	metapolitical	work	than
Imperium	is.

And	 that's	 Evola's	 work.	 Because	 the	 problem	 with	 Yawkey	 is	 that	 his	 conception	 of
organicism	 is	 sort	 of	 like	 this	 fatalistic	 conception	 where	 he	 thinks	 that,	 uh,	 so-called
cultures	are	like	organisms	that,	uh,	you	know,	come	and	go,	so	to	speak,	in	cycles	and
so	forth.	And,	uh,	yeah,	his	description	of	race	was	a	little	odd	about,	you	know,	spiritual
idea	of	race.

Yeah,	 it's	very	nebulous.	 It's,	 it's	sort	of	 like,	uh,	almost	culture	at	 its	core	 is	based	on
race.	Yeah.

Whereas	he	 tries	 to	 invert	 that	 and	 says	 that	 race	 is	 based	on	 culture	and	 that	 these
biological	groups	are	like,	uh,	incarnations	of	this	culture	or	like	the	culture	is	like	their
oversoul,	 I	 guess.	Where	do	 you	 think	 the	word,	 um,	 nation	 came	 from	exactly?	 Latin
natio.	It's	from	the	Latin	word	nati.

Yeah,	I	think	it's	something	to	do	with	people.	Nation	is	actually	a	race	of	people.	Yeah.

Nation	comes	 from	 the	Latin	word	nati,	which	means,	you	know,	a	people.	 It	means	a
people.	Oh,	it's	nati?	I	thought	it	was	natio.

Yeah,	nati.	Okay.	Yeah.

And	basically,	uh,	it,	it	refers	to	people	and	what	people	forget	now	in	this,	uh,	you	know,
decadent	 corrupt	 world	 is	 they	 just	 think	 that,	 oh,	 it	 just	 means	 a	 geographical,	 you
know,	you're	an	American	just	by,	uh,	being	in	America	and	you're,	uh,	European	just	by
being	in	the	geographical	region	of	Europe.	Because	it's	like,	anyone	can	just	come	down
here.	So	what	does	that	mean?	This	 is,	 it	 just	means	America	 is	a	dumping	ground	for
third	world	trash	these	days.

Yeah.	It's	like,	I've	never	really	particularly	identified	as	an	American,	even	before	I,	uh,
you	know,	became	aware	of	all	this	stuff.	I	never	particularly,	uh,	you	know,	identified	as,
it's	 kind	 of	 like,	 uh,	 Loki,	 do	 you	 really	 identify	 as	 Canadian?	 No,	 I	 never	 really	 have
either.

I	always	 looked	upon,	 I	was	young	as	 like,	oh	yeah,	Canadian.	Yeah.	 It's	hockey	 in	 the



woods	and	so	forth,	like	where	I	am.

But,	 uh,	 you	 know,	 not	 really.	 I	 always	 looked	 upon	myself	 as	 European	 because	my
mother's	 from	 Denmark.	 So	 I	 always	 had	 a	 sort	 of	 like	 biological	 orientation	 or
understanding.

Yeah.	I'm	mainly,	uh,	like	Celtic	and	Germanic.	So	basically,	uh,	central	north	Europe	is
sort	of	like	where,	you	know,	I	best	identify	with.

I	mostly	have,	um,	English	and	ancestry	and	a	bit	of	Scottish	blood	as	well.	As	far	as	 I
know.	I	heard	there's	lots	of	Scottish	people	in	the	south.

Huh?	Yeah.	My,	my	grandfather,	uh,	he's,	uh,	you	know,	like	Irish	Scottish	and	he's,	uh,
from,	he's	from,	uh,	Kentucky.	So.

Okay.	 Yeah.	 So	 yeah,	 you're,	 you	 are	 right	 about	 that,	 that	 there	 is	 a	 lot	 of	 like	 Irish
Scottish,	uh,	in	the,	in	the	south.

So	 is	 there	any	predictions	 in	 terms	of	 timelines	of	when	 there's	going	 to	be	 race	war
popping	 up?	 You	 mentioned	 in	 your,	 your	 manifesto	 that	 you	 think	 it	 will	 be	 2024.	 I
would	 say	 2023,	 2024	 where	 something	 happens.	 I'd	 say	 it's	 going	 to	 get	 really	 bad
around	2025.

Yeah,	it	definitely	seems	like	it's	going	to	have	to	build	up	a	little	bit	more	before	it	really
gets,	 uh,	 more	 chaotic	 to	 the	 point	 where,	 you	 know,	 whites	 are	 forced	 to	 actually
actively	engage	in	a	more	physical	sense	as	a	collective	group,	you	know,	not	some	sort
of	 like	 lone	 wolves	 going	 to	 go	 around	 causing	 chaos,	 but	 in	 terms	 of	 defensive,	 uh,
action	to,	you	know,	prevent	their	own	destruction.	Basically	foxes	in	a	sense.	What	do
you	mean?	Well,	having	to,	you	know,	foxes	go	out.

He's	 talking	 about	 how	 in	 the	 last	 stream	 that	 we	 did,	 we	 made	 that	 comparison
between,	uh,	 remember	how	 I	mentioned	wolves	and	sheep,	and	 then	you	said,	uh,	 it
was	more,	we're	more	like	foxes	in	the	sense	of	being	more	clever	and	more	predatory
like	 wolves.	 Yeah,	 I	 guess	 that's	 sort	 of	 the	 way	 it	 is.	 Basically	 wolves	 have	 to	 come
together	and	try	to	survive.

Yeah,	we	can't	all	just	be	like,	uh,	lone	wolves	or	whatever.	You	know,	we're	certainly,	it
would	not	be	a	very	prudent	 idea	to	 just	go	around	doing,	you	know,	sort	of	terroristic
craziness	 like,	uh,	all	 these,	uh,	shills	are	putting	forward,	you	know,	 like	 James	Mason
and	stuff	like	that.	That's	just	a	recipe	for	heads.

That's	 a	 hit	 right	 there	 that	 he's	 more	 likely	 an	 operative.	 Yeah,	 and	 they're	 always
pushing	Christian,	Christianity	too.	So	that's	a,	another	red	flag.

Anybody	pushing	Christianity	 is	obviously	tying	people	 into	the	 Jews	thought	 forms.	So



that	 obviously	 doesn't	 serve	 our	 interests	 at	 all.	 I	 think	 anybody	 who's	 pushing	 CI	 or
anything	like	of	that	sort	or	terror	or	balkanization	is	probably,	um,	I	mean,	some	could
be	 useful	 idiots,	 but	 I	 think	 more	 than	 likely	 they're	 just	 subversives	 trying	 to	 incite
violence.

Yeah,	pretty	much.	Yeah.	I	don't	think	the	balkanization	thing	is	going	to	happen	anytime
soon.

They	put	the	lights	in	one	area,	they	could	just	firebomb,	firebomb	the	area,	kind	of	like
they	did	in	Dresden,	Germany.	Well,	and	also	it,	it	alienates	people	geographically	and,
uh,	you	know,	it	basically	leaves	those,	if	you're	not,	you	know,	if	you're	not	in	this	area,
let's	say	an	example	of	the	Northwest	with,	uh,	you	know,	what	Harold	Covington	would
propose	about	all,	let's	all	go	pack	and	move	to	the	Northwest.	Anybody	who's	not	in	the
Northwest	is	just	left	to	die,	basically.

Yeah.	And	that's	why	I	think	Varg	Beekerness	pushes	very	divisive	rhetoric	about	like,	oh
yeah,	 you	know,	 screw	all	 the	American,	 uh,	 you	 know,	white	people,	 uh,	 you	 know,	 I
only	 care	 about	 the	 survival	 of,	 uh,	 you	 know,	Nordics,	 basically.	 Do	 they	 have	Nords
who,	uh,	immigrated	to	America	many	years	ago?	Yeah,	I	know.

So	 it's	 like,	 you're	 basically	wanting	 to,	 yeah,	 it's	 like,	 I	 don't	 care	 if	millions	 of	white
people	die	because	of	geography,	basically.	Yeah.	That's	again,	the	divide	and	conquer
type	game	that	they	always,	uh,	employ	to	try	to	tear	apart	whites.

Obviously	 the	 strategy	 should	be	more	or	 less	pervasive,	 basically	 swimming	with	 the
sea	of	the	people	is	the	only	proper	strategy.	Yeah.	And,	uh,	also	Pan-Aryanism.

Yeah,	 exactly.	 Sort	 of	 like	 what	 Ben	 Claston	 said.	 Claston	 had	 a	 good	 critique	 of	 the
Balkanization	and	probably,	I	think	it	was	the	Rahoa,	this	planet	is	all	ours.

And	he	also	refuted	Covington	as	well,	calling	him	out	as	a	Jew	and	so	forth.	Yeah.	Matt
Hale	said	he	was	a	Jew	as	well	in	one	of	his	letters.

Yeah.	 It's	pretty	hard	 to	 tell	who	 is	 really	authentic	and	who	 really	 isn't.	 I	 think	 it	 just
says	a	lot	about,	uh,	you	can	tell	a	lot	about	a	person	by	what	agenda	they	push	and,	uh,
how	their	style	presentation,	like	if	they	sound	very	scripted	or	if	their	production	looks	a
little	too	artificial	or,	uh,	you	know,	we	could	go	into	some	examples,	but	I	don't	know	if
we	would	really	want	to,	I	don't	know	if	it's	really	necessary.

What?	You	know,	if	the	production	looks	too	flashy	and	fancy,	that's	a	good	indication	as
well.	Yeah.	It's	kind	of	like	Red	Ice	TV.

Yeah.	Very	high	level	graphic	design	and	so	forth.	Everything	is	very	studio	quality.

Whereas	 if	you	 look	at	this	podcast.	Where	they	get	this	money,	you	know,	to	pay	the



people	to	do	all	this	stuff	because,	you	know,	all	that	production	takes	time,	you	know,
and	it	takes	talent	as	well.	Yeah.

And	 they	 usually	 have	 like	 a	 weekly	 podcast	 or	 something	 like	 that,	 or	 at	 least
sometimes	even	more.	Yeah.	And	they	have	one	like	certain	really	high	profile	guests	or
whatever.

Yeah.	Well,	they	even	had	Dugan	on,	uh,	Red	Ice	Radio	before.	So.

Yeah.	Like	Dugan	or	David	Duke	or,	uh,	like	one	of	these	very	known	people.	Kind	of	like
the	clown.

I'm	not	going	to	name	his	name.	That	piece	of	shit.	I	mean,	it's	a	good	thing	that	he	went
away	because	everybody	figured	out	how	fake	he	was.

Loki	was	kicked	off	Lulu	because	of	that	guy.	And	I	myself	was	stalked	and	threatened	by
this	individual	several	months	ago.	Loki	sent	them	the	how	to	identify	a	Jew	document.

Yeah,	that	was	what	he	did.	And	that	pissed	him	off	and	got	him	kicked	off.	I	think	that
Lulu	publishes	in	Canada	and	Toronto.

So	they're	very,	uh,	you	know,	totalitarian	in	terms	of	shutting	down,	uh,	any	dissident
discourse.	So	I'm	thinking	is	if	there's	any	like	a	third	world	publishing	print	on	demand
companies,	 I've	 been	 checking	 in	 India	 and	 Pakistan.	 There's	 some	 there,	 but	 I	 don't
know	if	they're	legitimate	or	not,	but	I	think	that's	probably	the	only	way	you	can	go	in
the	coming	to	the	future	for	publications	that	you	have	to	pretty	much	go	with,	like,	out
of	the	way	third	world,	uh,	uh,	sources	or	else	just	make	your	own	totally.

Yeah.	I	submitted,	uh,	your,	uh,	book	to,	that's	probably	what	it's	a	good	background,	but
I	submitted	your	book	to	that	 Indian	site	that,	that,	uh,	what	was	that	one	that	started
with	a	P	that	Potha	or	Pothia,	I	think	it	was	Pothia.	That	was	what	it	was.

Yeah.	I	submitted	it	there	and,	uh,	they	should	be	reviewing	it.	I	don't	know	if	it's	going
to	go	through.

Yeah.	 It's	 pretty	 scathing	 indictment	 of,	 uh,	 the	 Jews,	 even	 though	 all	 I	 did	 was	 just
relate.	This	is	what	the	Jew	did	here.

This	is	what	the	Jew	did	there	type	incidents.	Right.	And	then,	so	basically	I	think	really
where	things	are	going	is	I	think	we're	going	to	have	to	keep	retreating	from	platform	to
platform,	because	I	think,	I	don't	think	it's	really	going	to	last	personally.

Their	search	function	still	doesn't	even	work	despite	all	the	funding	that	they're	getting,
you	know,	 I	 just	have	a	feeling	that	 it's	going	to	shut	down	 in	some	way.	 I	 just	have,	 I
don't	know.	 I	don't	know	what	 it	 is,	but	 the,	 the,	 the	way	 they've	shut	entire	channels
down	now	and,	uh,	and	how	they've	been	sneaking	in,	you	know,	comment	sections	or



there've	been	these	people	who've	been	trying	to	spam	like	porn	links	or	whatever	and
comment	sections.

There's	no	way	to	block	people	that	are	deliberately	spamming.	You're	not.	Yeah.

And	that's	the	thing	is	you're	not,	you're	still	not	allowed	to	ban	people.	From	a	coding
perspective,	you	can't	even	click	on	their	profile	to	get	there	immediately.	You	have	to
copy	and	paste	a	channel	name,	go	to	this	broken	search,	search	engine	and	go	to	their
channel	that	way.

It's	such	a	piece	of	shit	the	way	they	designed	it.	And	there's	no	notification.	So	you	can't
have	any	dialogue.

There's	no	notifications	anymore.	It's	just	broken.	Yeah.

You	have	to	click	on	the	videos	to	see	the	comments	now,	which	is	really	lame.	And	also,
uh,	you're	still	not	allowed	to	ban	people.	They	got	some	cheap	ass	to	do	the	coding	for
them.

The	only	thing	that	I	like	about	the	new	comment	system	is	that	you're	no	longer	able	to
stalk	someone's	comments	like	you	were	able	to	with	Discus.	And	they're	not	completely
sensitive.	You	can	actually	say	the	word	nigger	in	the	comments	now.

Right.	Discus,	 I	know	that	 they	used	to,	uh,	 like	 if	you	said,	you	know,	words	 like	that,
they	would,	uh,	basically,	uh,	you	know,	try	to	not	post	your	comment	or	whatever	that
may	be	kind	of	like	YouTube	now.	Comments	on	YouTube	is	just	a	hassle.

You	can't	even	put	 triple	parentheses	anymore	on	YouTube.	So	Southerner,	you	don't,
uh,	you	say	2025	is	when	there's	going	to	be	the	major	conflagration.	I	say	so	because
that's	the	end	of	the	Iron	Age.

That's	supposed	to	be	the	lowest	of	the	low.	What	is	that	based	on?	Um,	trying	to	think,
you	know,	 trying	to	think	what	 is	 it	called?	You	know,	 like	the,	um,	cyclical,	you	know,
the	 timeline,	 cyclical	 type	of	 timeline	charts.	Based	on	 the	Mayans,	you	mean?	 Is	 that
the	 Mayans?	 Usually	 that's	 what	 they	 cite	 people,	 uh,	 like	 the	 2012	 in	 the	 Mayan
calendar	type	thing.

I	don't	know.	I	have	a	feeling	it's	going	to	be	soon.	It	can't	be	no,	it	can't	be	no	later	than
10	years	from	now.

Yeah,	I	think	it's	all	going	to	be	pretty	much	resolved	by	the	end	of	this	decade.	One	way
or	 the	 other.	 I	 know	 that	 Edgar	 Case	 from	 Atlanta	 predicted	 that,	 uh,	 2026	 slash	 27
would	be	that,	and	then	it	would	all	be	over	by	2029.

But	of	course	they	create	all	these	sorts	of,	uh,	prophecies	and	stuff	like	that	all	the	time.
And	they	have	throughout	history	too,	as	a	sign	up	to	get	people	to,	you	know,	whatever,



give	up	all	their	money	or	whatever	the	case	for	God	or	something	like	that.	So	you	can
never	be	sure	if	they're	not	just	deliberately	predictively	programming	here	too,	just	so
that	 they	 could	 bring	 in	 their	 little	 Messiah	 and	 so	 forth	 and	 pretend	 it's	 biblical
prophecy.

Well,	I	think	that's	why,	you	know,	kind	of	like	what	class	had	pointed	out	about	how,	uh,
you	know,	the	Christians	would	point,	you	know,	use	that	phrase,	money	is	the	root	of	all
evil.	I	think	that	that's	there	to,	you	know,	what	he	pointed	out	was	like,	uh,	basically	it's
just	 there.	 So	 you	 give	 up	 all	 your	money	 because	 it's	 evil,	 you	 know,	 it's	 evil,	 even
though	they	make	offerings,	you	know,	give	up	your	possessions,	give	it	all	up,	throw	it
away.

You	know,	uh,	you	know,	basically	it's	just,	those	big	churches	actually	make	from	these
gullible	 idiots.	 It	 is	 just	 downright	 shocking	 how	much	money	 they	 really	make.	Well,
yeah,	 I	mean,	 it's	sort	of	 like	how,	uh,	you	know,	 that's	how	they	 run,	 that's	how	they
operate	basically.

And	they're	not	taxed	because,	uh,	you	know,	oh,	you	can't	tax,	you	know,	basically	in,
uh,	and	then	they	would	go	up	to	your	door	and	 like,	ask	you	for	money,	even	though
they	could	say,	well,	it's	ending	this	Sunday,	give	us	$50.	Can	I	make	a	point?	And	that's
why	all	 these	companies	hold	charity	so	 they	can	get	 tax	breaks.	 It's	not	 really	about,
you	know,	yeah,	it's	just	a	tax	shelter.

It's	just	a	tax	shelter.	Same	with	all	these	so-called	philanthropists.	Except	for	the	greats,
good.

It's	just	a	tax	shelter,	like	you	said.	All	those	people	who	claim	to	be	philanthropists	are
just	a	bunch	of	Jews	typically	looking	to,	uh,	you	know,	make	some	political	social	capital
for	themselves.	And	at	the	same	time	to	create	tax	shelters	so	that	they	could,	uh,	you
know,	create	like	a	slush	fund	or	launder	money	through	their	troops.

Michael	Milken.	That	was	what	he	was	known	for	was	he's	known	as	 like	the	 junk	king
and	he	would	make	a	bunch	of	slush	funds	basically.	I	mean,	like	I	was	funny.

Yeah,	we're,	we're,	 uh,	 low-key	we're	 referring	 to	 that	 Elmo	guy	who,	 uh,	went	 in	 the
time	 square	 and	 was	 like,	 don't	 use	 Michael	 Milken's	 international	 Jew	 toy	 leapfrog.
There's	a	clip	of	him	saying,	I'm	in,	I	am	a	Henry	Fordian	anti-Semite.	I'm	a	Henry	Fordian
anti-Semite,	all	right.

He's	wearing	his	Cookie	Monster	outfit.	Anyway,	we	don't	need	to	go	too	off	topic.	Well,	I
think	we	pretty	much	nailed	it	down	right	now.

So	I	guess	that'll	be	probably	good	for	the	show.	Most	people	don't	want	to	hear	past	two
and	a	half	hours	anyway.	Yeah.



It's	been	quite	some	time	since	we	started.	 I	guess	we'll	cut	 it	off	here.	And	thanks	for
listening.


